CITY OF CLEARWATER

ITB # 03-21, Vehicle/Equipment Repair & Maintenance
DUE DATE: December 1, 2020; 10:00 AM
BID TABULATION

Dynmaic Diesel Works
5303 126th Ave N

Clearwater, FL 337‘0

Tampa Spring Company
8820 N Brooks St
Tampa, FL 33604 '

Item No. CATEGORY 1 - AUTOMOBILES / SEDANS Price Per Hour Price Per Hour
1 Shop Labor Hourly Rate $75.00 $70.00
2 Emergency Hourly Rate $75.00 $105.00
3 Service/Road Call Rate (if applicable) $75.00 No Bid
4 Pick-up/delivery (if applicable) No Bid No Bid

CATEGORY 2 - LIGHT DUTY TRUCK/SUV CLASS 1-3 (0 -14,000 LBS)
5 Shop Labor Hourly Rate $75.00 $70.00
6 Emergency Hourly Rate $75.00 $105.00
7 Service/Road Call Rate (if applicable) $75.00 No Bid
8 Pick-up/delivery (if applicable) No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 3 - MEDIUM/HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS CLASS 4-8 (14,001 -33,001+ LBS)
9 Shop Labor Hourly Rate $75.00 $70.00
10 Emergency Hourly Rate $75.00 $105.00
1 Service/Road Call Rate (if applicable) $75.00 No Bid
12 Pick-up/delivery (if applicable) No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 4 - CONSTRUCTION/OFF ROAD
13 Shop Labor Hourly Rate $75.00 $70.00
14 Emergency Hourly Rate $75.00 $105.00
15 Service/Road Call Rate (if applicable) $75.00 No Bid
16 Pick-up/delivery (if applicable) No Bid No Bid
CATEGORY 5 - WALKING FLOOR AND STANDARD TRAILER
17 Shop Labor Hourly Rate $75.00 $70.00
18 Emergency Hourly Rate $75.00 $105.00
19 Service/Road Call Rate (if applicable) $75.00 No Bid
20 Pick-up/delivery (if applicable) No Bid No Bid
Parts and Materials Mark-up will not be utilized for determination of award
21 Parts and Materials Mark-up from cost 18% 28%

There were no small, women, minority or disadvantaged businesses

NOTE:

Items with a star ( —sfrindicates intent to award.
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