



DATE: Tuesday, May 7, 2019
TO: School Board Members
FROM: Jeff Eakins, Superintendent

SUBJECT / RECOMMENDATIONS

Accept the Lowest Responsive, Responsible Bids from Multiple Vendors - Invitation to Bid (ITB) #19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, and Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt) (*Business Services Division*)

EXECUTIVE SUMMARY

On March 14, 2019, Procurement Services, in conjunction with the Transportation Department, issued an ITB for new and rebuilt parts for trucks and buses. The awarded vendors will provide stock items for inventory and non-stocked original equipment parts, supplies, and equipment for vehicles maintained districtwide. Award shall be to the lowest responsive, responsible bidder by group. The General Manager of the Transportation Department has reviewed this recommendation.

The award of this contract will be for a 1-year period, with four 1-year renewals. There is a 30-day termination for convenience clause included in this contract. All prices offered are firm against any increase for one year from the effective date. This contract will be reviewed and evaluated annually and may be renewed by the Superintendent, per the terms of the specifications.

STRATEGIC OBJECTIVES

- Establish a strong foundation of financial stewardship

FINANCIAL IMPACT (Budgeted: Yes)

Funds in the amount of \$3,000,000 are available in the General Fund Reserve for inventory purchases. Product is initially purchased from object 1150 and placed into Transportation inventory. As product is needed, the product and expense are both transferred to the using site. As of April 16, 2019, the remaining balance less encumbrances for this line item equaled \$1,732,872.78. Funding needed for the remainder of the contract term will be allocated in the next fiscal year.

EVALUATION

Contract administration and evaluation is performed by the Project Manager (the "End User") and the Procurement Officer, who function as a team, by utilizing an online vendor performance report or via in-person reviews. The evaluation consists of an assessment of the vendor-provided goods and services, deliverables, and compliance with contractual requirements. The resulting data will support renewal decisions and/or alterations to a new agreement.

SUBMITTED BY: Corey A. Murphy, General Manager, Procurement Services
 James Beekman, General Manager, Transportation Department

Christopher Farkas
 Deputy Superintendent, Operations
 (813) 272-4004

Gretchen Saunders
 Chief Business Officer
 (813) 272-4270

B 6.18

Hillsborough County Public Schools (Florida) * Mtg.#20190507_923 (Board Meeting followed by Public Hearing) *
 Section B Item# 6.18

HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS - PROCUREMENT SERVICES
901 EAST KENNEDY BOULEVARD, TAMPA, FLORIDA 33602

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)

AWARDED FROM:		May 8, 2019 through May 7, 2020		
DATE OPENED:		April 3, 2019		
DATE AWARDED:		May 7, 2019		
DEPARTMENT:		Transportation		
DESCRIPTION OF ITB: Hillsborough County Public Schools is seeking bids from qualified vendors to provide parts for its fleet of trucks, buses, and other vehicles.				
RESPONDING VENDOR(S)	AWARDED VENDOR	CONTACT PERSON	TELEPHONE NUMBER	FAX NUMBER
Auto Plus Auto Parts				
1201 Old Hopewell Rd., Ste. 7, Tampa, FL 33619	No	Michael Brinser	(813) 620-1677	(813) 664-9824
Bartow Ford				
2800 US Hwy 98 N, Bartow, FL 33830	Yes	Bill Davis	(863) 533-0425	(863) 533-7758
Cold Air Distributors Warehouse of Florida				
9940 Currie Davis Dr., Tampa, FL 33619	No	Denick Cobb	(813) 542-4136	(813) 542-4144
Fleet Acquisitions DBA Fleet Products				
6510 Groves Ln., Tampa, FL 33610	Yes	John S. Williams	(813) 621-1734	(813) 626-2010
Hutcherson Auto Electric LLC				
701 S. 50th St., Tampa, FL 33619	No	Mark Brawner	(813) 247-4365	(813) 247-4839
Jasper Engines & Transmissions				
7315 Ellenor Dr., Orlando, FL 32809	Yes	RB Burkhardt	(800) 827-7455	(812) 481-0210
Marks Air, Inc.				
8214 Bowles Rd., Tampa, FL 33637	No	Caroline Acebedo	(813) 988-1671	(813) 988-0072
Matthews Bus Alliance, Inc.				
4805 West Colonial Dr., Orlando, FL 32805	Yes	Kevin O'Gorman	(800) 330-1175	(407) 374-1748
NAPA Auto Parts				
6202 E Hillsborough Ave., Tampa, FL 33610	Yes	Chris Bracken	(813) 621-9626	(813) 621-2253
Southeast Power Systems of Tampa				
6515 Adamo Dr., Tampa, FL 33619	No	Bryant King	(813) 623-1551	(813) 626-3312
Sun State International				
6020 Adamo Dr., Tampa, FL 33619	Yes	Jason Zier	(813) 621-1331	(613) 621-4526
Tampa Spring Company				
8820 N. Brooks St., Tampa, FL 33604	No	John Messina Jr	(813) 933-2805	(813) 933-5292

HILLSBOROUGH COUNTY PUBLIC SCHOOLS - PROCUREMENT SERVICES
901 EAST KENNEDY BOULEVARD, TAMPA, FLORIDA 33602

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)

AWARDED FROM:		May 8, 2019 through May 7, 2020	
DATE OPENED:		April 3, 2019	
DATE AWARDED:		May 7, 2019	
DEPARTMENT:		Transportation	
DESCRIPTION OF ITB: Hillsborough County Public Schools is seeking bids from qualified vendors to provide parts for its fleet of trucks, buses, and other vehicles.			
RESPONDING VENDOR(S)	AWARDED VENDOR	CONTACT PERSON	TELEPHONE NUMBER FAX NUMBER
Truck Pro LLC			
5711 N 56th St., Tampa, FL 33610	Yes	Dennis Lively	(813) 626-1877 (813) 627-8997
The Parts House			
6868 118th Ave. Largo, FL 33773	No	Richard Kilpatrick	(727) 573-1580 (727) 572-8935
Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc.			
3595 N. Dixie Hwy. Bay # 7, Boca Raton, FL 33431	No	Lindi Brooks	(561) 362-1070 (561) 362-7994

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes.

31 vendors registered to receive updates on this solicitation.

Responses were received from 15 vendors. Their bids are tabulated and the recommended award is shaded.

1904D-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)								
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Auto Plus Auto Parts	Bartow Ford	Cold Air Distributors Warehouse of Florida	Fleet Acquisitions DBA Fleet Products	Hutcherson Auto Electric LLC	Jasper Engines & Transmissions
	Group A - Air Condition		COST	COST	COST	COST	COST	COST
1	MOTOR, BLOWER, A/C	EA			*		94.58	
2	CONTROLLER	EA			*		270.46	
3	COMPRESSOR, A/C, 8GROOVE	EA			*		304.21	
4	COMPRESSOR, A/C, TM16HS	EA			*		163.11	
5	DRYER, A/C	EA			*		67.98	
6	CONDENSER, A/C	EA			*		1,572.22	
7	AC COVER	EA			*		246.55	
8	FILTER, A/C	EA			*		10.76	
9	DRAIN PAN	EA			*		136.37	
10	PULLEY, A/C, GROOVED	EA			*		26.42	
	Total					2,892.66		
	Group B - Alternator/Starter							
11	ALTERNATOR M, 320 AMP	EA		613.12	*		356.84	359.00
12	ALTERNATOR M, 320 AMP	EA		837.00	*		356.84	359.00
13	STARTER, 444E	EA		193.12	*		229.47	225.00
14	STARTER, VT365	EA		165.82	*		142.11	276.90
15	STARTER, C-2 MBE900	EA		142.73	*		186.32	291.50
	Total			1,951.79			1,271.58	1,511.40
	Group C - Belt							
16	BELT, A/C 444E	EA		17.60	*		12.57	
17	BELT, A/C, BYPASS VT365	EA		30.05	*		23.93	
18	BELT, A/C, ISB6.7L NVSTR	EA		15.05	*		14.39	
19	BELT, MAIN, MBE 900 C2	EA		27.59	*		27.27	
	Total			90.29			78.16	
	Group D - Body							
20	ROOF HATCH	EA		154.10	*		236.87	

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)								
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Auto Plus Auto Parts	Bartow Ford	Cold Air Distributors Warehouse of Florida	Fleet Acquisitions DBA Fleet Products	Hutcherson Auto Electric LLC	Jasper Engines & Transmissions
	Group E - Brakes							
21	PURGE VALVE BENDIX	EA		42.68	*		49.40	
22	SENSOR, ABS BENDIX	EA		68.15	*		69.58	
23	VALVE, ABS BENDIX	EA		129.15	*		163.18	
24	COMPRESSOR, AIR, 444E BENDIX	EA		320.93	*		267.58	
25	COMPRESSOR, AIR, VT360 BENDIX	EA		355.91	*		392.64	
26	CARTRIDGE, AIR DRYER BENDIX	EA		19.66	*		22.63	
27	SEAL, WHEEL FRONT SKF CR	EA		26.92	*		25.94	
28	SEAL, WHEEL REAR SKF CR	EA		29.69	*		31.74	
29	AIR CHAMBER FRONT MGM	EA		52.08	*		31.03	
30	AIR CHAMBER REAR MGM	EA		95.45	*		115.79	
	Total			1,140.62			1,169.51	
	Group F - Brakes							
31	DRUM, REAR GUNITE	EA		88.57	*		88.99	
32	DRUM, FRONT GUNITE	EA		90.77	*		124.84	
33	DRUM, REAR GUNITE	EA		147.35	*		147.86	
34	DRUM, FRONT GUNITE	EA		150.58	*		154.39	
35	SHOE KIT, FRONT MERITOR	EA		38.94	*		38.03	
36	SHOE KIT, REAR MERITOR	EA		50.64	*		52.34	
	Total			566.85			606.45	
	Group G - Electrical							
37	SOLENOID, DISCONNECT	EA			*		13.65	
38	RELAY STANDARD	EA			*		5.44	
39	ALARM, BACKUP ECCO	EA			*		57.08	
40	SOLENOID, WHITE RODGES	EA			*		51.45	
41	BREAKER CIRCUIT, COLE HERSEE	EA			*		3.49	
42	SWITCH GPS, COLE HERSEE	EA			*		2.55	
43	BUZZER, COLE HERSEE	EA			*		7.86	
	Total						141.52	

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)								
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Auto Plus Auto Parts	Bartow Ford	Cold Air Distributors Warehouse of Florida	Fleet Acquisitions DBA Fleet Products	Hutcherson Auto Electric LLC	Jasper Engines & Transmissions
	Group H - Engine							
44	FAN CLUTCH, 466MAX BORGWARNER	EA		225.09	*	236.88		
45	FAN CLUTCH, 3588739C11 *	EA		212.22	*	226.32		
46	FAN CLUTCH, 444E BORGWARNER	EA		182.26	*	192.81		
47	FAN CLUTCH, C2 HORTAN	EA		558.13	*	510.53		
	Total			1,177.70		1,166.54		
	Group I - Radiator/Engine							
48	RADIATOR C-2 MBE900	EA		532.40	*	521.05		
49	RADIATOR 444E	EA		533.93	*	521.05		
50	RADIATOR VT365	EA		647.14	*	445.79		
51	RADIATOR CAT 3126	EA		390.75	*	743.71		
	Total			2,104.22		2,201.60		
	Group J - Engine							
52	TURBO VT365	EA			*	705.26		600.00
53	TURBO 466 MAXFORCE	EA			*	1,315.79		1,150.00
	Total					2,021.05		1,750.00
	Group K - Exhaust							
54	TAIL PIPE SPOUT	EA		13.92	*	18.83		
55	SEAL CLAMP 4"	EA		6.65	*	6.61		
56	TAIL PIPE SPOUT	EA		39.74	*	20.22		
57	SEAL CLAMP 3 1/2"	EA		7.28	*	7.14		
	Total			67.59		52.80		
	Group L - Filters							
58	FILTER, AIR	EA		26.77	*	26.68		
59	FILTER, AIR	EA		19.29	*	19.94		
60	FILTER, AIR	EA		27.64	*	27.34		
61	FILTER, OIL	EA		6.26	*	6.58		
62	FILTER, OIL	EA		4.23	*	4.84		
63	FILTER, OIL	EA		4.76	*	4.96		
64	FILTER, FUEL	EA		11.95	*	12.78		
65	FILTER, FUEL	EA		5.28	*	5.37		
66	FILTER, FUEL	EA		14.01	*	32.80		
67	FILTER, TRANSMISSION	EA		33.35	*	33.04		
68	FILTER, TRANSMISSION	EA		3.01	*	3.03		
69	FILTER, POWER STEERING	EA		8.01	*	7.98		
70	FILTER, POWER STEERING	EA		9.90	*	7.96		
	Total			174.46		193.30		

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)								
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Auto Plus Auto Parts	Bartow Ford	Cold Air Distributors Warehouse of Florida	Fleet Acquisitions DBA Fleet Products	Hutcherson Auto Electric LLC	Jasper Engines & Transmissions
	Group M - Fuel System							
71	INJECTOR, 466 MAXX 1ST GEN.	EA		241.07	*	322.23		255.00
72	INJECTOR, 466 MAXX 2ND GEN.	EA		268.99	*	349.08		335.00
73	INJECTOR, VT365	EA		153.30	*	200.71		172.00
	Total			663.36		872.02		762.00
	Group N - Instrumentation							
74	DASH CLUSTER	EA			*	1,036.84		
75	DASH CLUSTER	EA			*	990.04		
	Total					2,026.88		
	Group O - Lifts							
76	ROLL STOP CYLINDER	EA			*	407.24		
77	KIT, BRAUN, RETRO	EA			*	387.54		
78	FLUID, HYDRAULIC, BRAUNABILITY	EA			*	68.42		
	Total					863.20		
	Group P - Lights							
79	BULB, HALGEN H/L	EA		4.35	*	1.76		
80	BULB, HALGEN H/L C2	EA		7.08	*	2.47		
81	HEADLIGHT	EA		5.68	*	4.69		
82	STOPLIGHT KIT (LED)	EA		43.82	*	*		
83	BULB,HALOGEN WARNING	EA		3.30	*	1.16		
84	LAMP MARKER, RED	EA		4.38	*	4.54		
85	LAMP MARKER, AMBER	EA		1.85	*	1.58		
86	LAMP ASSY, RED (LED)	EA		21.37	*	19.45		
87	LAMP, TAG	EA		3.34	*	2.79		
88	STROBE ASSY	EA		131.96	*	75.87		
	Total			227.13		**		
	Group Q - Mirrors							
89	BASE, MIRROR	EA		7.03	*	9.69		
90	MIRROR	EA		54.05	*	45.89		
91	MIRROR	EA		26.19	*	28.84		
92	MIRROR, BRACE C2	EA		42.85	*	69.13		
93	MIRROR,BASE RH	EA		11.57	*	13.16		
94	MIRROR, BRACKET R/S	EA		52.18	*	71.82		
95	MIRROR, BRACKET R/S	EA		130.00	*	122.76		
96	MIRROR, HEAD,REMOTE	EA		125.50	*	176.06		
	Total			449.37		537.35		

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)								
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Auto Plus Auto Parts	Bartow Ford	Cold Air Distributors Warehouse of Florida	Fleet Acquisitions DBA Fleet Products	Hutcherson Auto Electric LLC	Jasper Engines & Transmissions
	Group R - Radio							
97	MICROPHONE	EA		15.35	*	14.92		
98	MICROPHONE	EA		45.24	*	43.29		
99	MICROPHONE	EA		32.55	*	46.03		
	Total			93.14		104.24		
	Group S - Restraints							
100	SAFETY VEST,SMALL EZ-ON	EA			*	108.11		
101	SAFETY VEST,MEDIUM EZ-ON	EA			*	108.11		
102	SAFETY VEST,LARGE EZ-ON	EA			*	108.11		
	Total					324.33		
	Group T - Safety Devices							
103	BASE,CROSSARM	EA		82.20	*	115.41		
104	BASE,CROSSARM	EA		180.40	*	349.63		
105	BASE,CROSSARM	EA		157.13	*	259.01		
106	BASE,CROSSARM	EA		28.83	*	55.16		
107	BLADE,CROSSARM	EA		43.80	*	78.38		
108	BLADE,CROSSARM	EA		33.89	*	78.44		
109	STOPARM,FRONT	EA		263.94	*	592.21		
110	STOPARM, C2 FRONT	EA		345.75	*	420.66		
111	STOPARM, C2 REAR	EA		345.75	*	392.97		
112	STOPARM,REAR	EA		230.53	*	413.43		
113	POWER SUPPLY,CROSSARM	EA		84.67	*	125.25		
	Total			1796.89		2,880.55		
	Group U - Shop Supplies							
114	BRAKE CLEANER	EA		1.84	*	1.67		
115	DEGREASER	EA		2.62	*	2.79		
116	LUBRICANT	EA		5.75	*	3.53		
117	SILICONE, AEROSOL	EA		4.95	*	2.65		
118	WASHER FLUID	EA		0.86	*	0.87		
119	LUBRICANT	EA		3.90	*	3.18		
	Total			19.92		14.69		

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)								
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Auto Plus Auto Parts	Bartow Ford	Cold Air Distributors Warehouse of Florida	Fleet Acquisitions DBA Fleet Products	Hutcherson Auto Electric LLC	Jasper Engines & Transmissions
	Group V - Steering/Suspension		COST	COST	COST	COST	COST	COST
120	TIE ROD	EA		32.95	*	26.19		
121	TIE ROD	EA		32.95	*	26.19		
122	DRAGLINK, C2	EA		117.00	*	137.99		
123	DRAGLINK	EA		73.44	*	86.67		
124	TIE ROD	EA		28.03	*	22.27		
125	TIE ROD	EA		28.03	*	22.27		
126	AIR BAG	EA		118.65	*	75.22		
127	SHOCK	EA		33.74	*	39.26		
128	SHOCK	EA		30.56	*	41.44		
129	SHOCK	EA		37.26	*	26.34		
	Total			532.61		503.84		
	Group W - Wheelchair							
130	KIT, WHEELCHAIR	EA			*	112.47		
131	BELT, SHOULDER/LAP	EA			*	158.82		
132	BELT, RETACTOR	EA			*	159.38		
133	KIT, TIEDOWN	EA			*	564.32		
	Total					994.99		
	Group X - Wipers							
134	WIPER BLADE 18INCH	EA	2.49	2.45	*	2.16		
135	WIPER BLADE 20INCH	EA	2.49	2.45	*	2.16		
136	WIPER BLADE 22INCH	EA	2.49	2.45	*	2.16		
137	WIPER BLADE 24INCH	EA	2.49	2.45	*	2.16		
138	WIPER BLADE 28INCH	EA	2.49	2.45	*	2.16		
	Total		12.45	12.25		10.80		
	BALANCE OF LINE ITEMS							
139	Balance of Line-Miscellaneous Materials and/or Parts	EA		10%		5%		10%
140	Balance of Line-Specific Materials and/or Parts	EA		10%		5%		10%

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)									
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Marks Air, Inc.	Mathews Bus Alliance, Inc.	NAPA Auto Parts	Southeast Power Systems of Tampa	Sun State International	Tampa Spring Company	
	Group A - Air Condition		COST						
1	MOTOR, BLOWER, A/C	EA	139.00	76.92	181.07				
2	CONTROLLER	EA	133.13	121.72			70.10		
3	COMPRESSOR,A/C, 8GROOVE	EA	399.50	233.80	405.84		266.60		
4	COMPRESSOR,A/C, TM16HS	EA	259.43	139.40	279.60		184.21		
5	DRYER,AC	EA	56.15	26.08	58.02		22.84		
6	CONDENSER, A/C	EA	1,050.00	746.22	1,063.29				
7	AC COVER	EA	228.38	154.75	269.16		116.75		
8	FILTER, A/C	EA	135.30	6.88			4.34		
9	DRAIN PAN	EA	130.35	99.81	153.12		84.30		
10	PULLEY,A/C,GROOVED	EA	33.47	22.43	53.68		12.62		
	Total		2,564.71	1,628.01	**		**		
	Group B - Alternator/Starter								
11	ALTERNATOR M, 320 AMP	EA		958.37	614.31	475.00	693.41		
12	ALTERNATOR M, 320 AMP	EA		967.52	600.34	425.00	1,113.68		
13	STARTER,444E	EA		260.31	197.07	180.00	215.74		
14	STARTER,VT365	EA		189.46	202.94	241.00	205.08		
15	STARTER,C-2 MBE900	EA		154.35	232.27	206.00	179.91		
	Total			2,530.01	1,846.93	1,527.00	2,407.82		
	Group C - Belt								
16	BELT,A/C 444E	EA		28.43	14.39		15.35		
17	BELT,A/C, BYPASS VT365	EA		40.26	26.48		32.14		
18	BELT,A/C,ISB6.7L NVSTR	EA		20.16	16.56		13.40		
19	BELT,MAIN, MBE 900 C2	EA		22.73	31.22		23.83		
	Total			111.58	88.65		84.72		
	Group D - Body								
20	ROOF HATCH	EA		185.99			175.11		

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)									
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Marks Air, Inc.		Matthews Bus Alliance, Inc.	NAPA Auto Parts	Southeast Power Systems of Tampa	Sun State International	Tampa Spring Company
	Group E - Brakes		COST						
21	PURGE VALVE BENDIX	EA	59.85		29.99	41.61		44.32	
22	SENSOR, ABS BENDIX	EA	110.15		42.33	82.33		90.32	
23	VALVE, ABS BENDIX	EA	630.26		201.93	191.97		152.82	
24	COMPRESSOR, AIR, 444E BENDIX	EA			359.18	304.36		313.70	
25	COMPRESSOR, AIR, VT360 BENDIX	EA			402.95	464.58		341.88	
26	CARTRIDGE, AIR DRYER BENDIX	EA	40.65		20.95	19.59		20.69	
27	SEAL, WHEEL FRONT SKF CR	EA	40.65		19.20	27.73		26.47	
28	SEAL, WHEEL REAR SKF CR	EA	59.59		21.35	33.91		32.50	
29	AIR CHAMBER FRONT MGM	EA	182.92		34.58	65.46		58.98	
30	AIR CHAMBER REAR MGM	EA	175.50		75.12	137.13		97.65	
	Total		**		1,207.58	1,368.37		1,179.33	
	Group F - Brakes								
31	DRUM, REAR GUNITE	EA			85.73	87.28		88.80	
32	DRUM, FRONT GUNITE	EA			85.25	128.63		100.24	
33	DRUM, REAR GUNITE	EA			187.28	205.08		121.97	
34	DRUM, FRONT GUNITE	EA			95.93	133.91		170.02	
35	SHOE KIT, FRONT MERITOR	EA			43.25	52.62		41.34	
36	SHOE KIT, REAR MERITOR	EA			49.11	67.61		54.30	
	Total				546.55	675.13		576.67	
	Group G - Electrical								
37	SOLENOID, DISCONNECT	EA			16.45	16.96			
38	RELAY STANDARD	EA	14.82		4.30	4.36			
39	ALARM, BACKUP ECCO	EA			60.80	65.73			
40	SOLENOID, WHITE RODGES	EA			20.37	69.99			
41	BREAKER CIRCUIT, COLE HERSEE	EA			2.28	4.34			
42	SWITCH GPS, COLE HERSEE	EA			2.61	3.17			
43	BUZZER, COLE HERSEE	EA			7.49	9.77			
	Total		**		144.30	174.32			

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuild)									
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	MARKS AIR, INC.	MATTHEWS BUS ALLIANCE, INC.	NAPA AUTO PARTS	SOUTHEAST POWER SYSTEMS OF TAMPA	SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL	TAMPA SPRING COMPANY	
	Group H - Engine		COST						
44	FAN CLUTCH, 466MAX BORGWARNER	EA		260.40	321.93	247.00	308.57		
45	FAN CLUTCH, 3588739C11 *	EA		286.14	335.78	299.00	258.92		
46	FAN CLUTCH, 444E BORGWARNER	EA		194.49	262.05	195.00	259.34		
47	FAN CLUTCH, C2 HORTAN	EA		583.90	758.81	769.00	831.70		
	Total			1,324.93	1,678.57	1,510.00	1,658.53		
	Group I - Radiator/Engine								
48	RADIATOR C-2 MBE900	EA		593.75		435.00	462.96		
49	RADIATOR 444E	EA		695.00	609.19	585.00	537.98		
50	RADIATOR VI365	EA		488.75	595.05	473.00	376.26		
51	RADIATOR CAT 3126	EA		531.25	623.32	473.00	383.05		
	Total			2,288.75	**	1,906.00	1,760.25		
	Group J - Engine								
52	TURBO VT365	EA		1,259.69		950.00			
53	TURBO 466 MAXFORCE	EA		1,540.00		975.00			
	Total			2,799.69		1,925.00			
	Group K - Exhaust								
54	TAIL PIPE SPOUT	EA		20.15	17.60				
55	SEAL CLAMP 4"	EA		5.50	6.87				
56	TAIL PIPE SPOUT	EA		20.15	18.91				
57	SEAL CLAMP 3 1/2"	EA		6.59	6.67				
	Total			52.39	50.05				
	Group L - Filters								
58	FILTER, AIR	EA			26.89	29.75	26.77		
59	FILTER, AIR	EA			21.20	21.89	19.29		
60	FILTER, AIR	EA			29.07	30.83	27.64		
61	FILTER, OIL	EA			6.49	7.13	6.26		
62	FILTER, OIL	EA			4.72	4.83	4.23		
63	FILTER, OIL	EA		10.79	4.84	5.34	4.76		
64	FILTER, FUEL	EA			12.66	14.08	11.95		
65	FILTER, FUEL	EA			4.99	5.88	5.28		
66	FILTER, FUEL	EA		27.42	27.89	34.50	14.01		
67	FILTER, TRANSMISSION	EA			34.79	37.92	33.35		
68	FILTER, TRANSMISSION	EA			2.99	3.36	3.01		
69	FILTER, POWER STEERING	EA			8.32	9.32	8.01		
70	FILTER, POWER STEERING	EA			8.06	61.33	9.60		
	Total			**	192.91	266.16	174.16		

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuild)										
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Marks Air, Inc.		Matthews Bus Alliance, Inc.	NAPA Auto Parts	Southeast Power Systems of Tampa	Sun State International	Tampa Spring Company	
	Group M - Fuel System		COST							
71	INJECTOR, 466 MAXX 1ST GEN.	EA			230.97		237.00	290.89		
72	INJECTOR, 466 MAXX 2ND GEN.	EA			250.77		257.00	338.84		
73	INJECTOR, VT365	EA			112.17		146.00	253.55		
	Total				593.91		640.00	883.28		
	Group N - Instrumentation									
74	DASH CLUSTER	EA						812.93		
75	DASH CLUSTER	EA						705.26		
	Total							1518.49		
	Group O - Lifts									
76	ROLL STOP CYLINDER	EA			244.13			271.25		
77	KIT, BRAUN, RETRO	EA			199.13			221.25		
78	FLUID, HYDRAULIC, BRAUNABILITY	EA			31.39			33.80		
	Total				474.65			526.30		
	Group P - Lights									
79	BULB, HALGEN H/L	EA			1.90	2.02		2.31		
80	BULB, HALGEN H/L C2	EA			3.54	5.76		5.07		
81	HEADLIGHT	EA			6.17	5.60		8.20		
82	STOPLIGHT KIT (LED)	EA			42.67	43.84		50.89		
83	BULB, HALGEN WARNING	EA			1.24	4.58				
84	LAMP MARKER, RED	EA			5.23	5.13		5.61		
85	LAMP MARKER, AMBER	EA			1.99	2.19		2.16		
86	LAMP ASSY, RED (LED)	EA			19.69	25.01				
87	LAMP, TAG	EA			3.20	3.55		3.89		
88	STROBE ASSY	EA			76.00	64.06		109.77		
	Total				161.63	161.74		**		
	Group Q - Mirrors									
89	BASE, MIRROR	EA			10.71			14.21		
90	MIRROR	EA			52.36			82.33		
91	MIRROR	EA			29.13			41.50		
92	MIRROR, BRACE C2	EA			61.95			50.64		
93	MIRROR, BASE RH	EA			12.04			16.00		
94	MIRROR, BRACKET R/S	EA			71.58			86.10		
95	MIRROR, BRACKET R/S	EA			134.58			170.73		
96	MIRROR, HEAD, REMOTE	EA			158.78			223.36		
	Total				531.13			684.87		

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)							Tampa Spring Company
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	MARKS AIR, INC.	MATTHEWS BUS ALLIANCE, INC.	NAPA AUTO PARTS	SOUTHEAST POWER SYSTEMS OF TAMPA	
Group R - Radio							
97	MICROPHONE	EA		17.22			
98	MICROPHONE	EA		44.00			
99	MICROPHONE	EA		33.28			
	Total			94.50			
Group S - Restraints							
100	SAFETY VEST, SMALL EZ-ON	EA		86.90			
101	SAFETY VEST, MEDIUM EZ-ON	EA		86.90			
102	SAFETY VEST, LARGE EZ-ON	EA		86.90			
	Total			260.70			
Group T - Safety Devices							
103	BASE, CROSSARM	EA		59.55			94.68
104	BASE, CROSSARM	EA		248.53			200.40
105	BASE, CROSSARM	EA		130.12			179.38
106	BASE, CROSSARM	EA		28.66			45.20
107	BLADE, CROSSARM	EA		40.74			60.91
108	BLADE, CROSSARM	EA		37.75			41.26
109	STOPARM, FRONT	EA		293.24			352.88
110	STOPARM, C2 FRONT	EA		289.42			
111	STOPARM, C2 REAR	EA		267.58			
112	STOPARM, REAR	EA		293.24			320.45
113	POWER SUPPLY, CROSSARM	EA	NLA				128.31
	Total			**			**
Group U - Shop Supplies							
114	BRAKE CLEANER	EA			1.79		1.87
115	DEGREASER	EA			3.00		3.58
116	LUBRICANT	EA			4.33		11.27
117	SILICONE, AEROSOL	EA			7.42		3.47
118	WASHER FLUID	EA			0.98		1.79
119	LUBRICANT	EA			3.85		4.18
	Total				21.37		26.16

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuild)									
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	MARKS AIR, INC.	MATTHEWS BUS ALLIANCE, INC.	NAPA AUTO PARTS	SOUTHEAST POWER SYSTEMS OF TAMPA	SUN STATE INTERNATIONAL	TAMPA SPRING COMPANY	
	Group V - Steering/Suspension		COST						
120	TIE ROD	EA		30.76	35.90		37.05	29.73	
121	TIE ROD	EA		30.76	35.90		37.05	29.73	
122	DRAGLINK, C2	EA		96.25	112.38			93.04	
123	DRAGLINK	EA		81.42	95.06			78.71	
124	TIE ROD	EA		20.93	24.43			20.23	
125	TIE ROD	EA		20.93	24.43		24.75	20.23	
126	AIR BAG	EA		91.46	92.97		121.23	88.36	
127	SHOCK	EA		25.39	45.04		53.25	37.54	
128	SHOCK	EA		19.06	47.53		38.66	28.17	
129	SHOCK	EA		30.88	30.20		47.06	45.68	
	Total			547.84	543.84			471.42	
	Group W - Wheelchair								
130	KIT, WHEELCHAIR	EA		81.47					
131	BELT, SHOULDER/LAP	EA		129.99					
132	BELT, RETACTOR	EA		245.71					
133	KIT, TIEDOWN	EA		384.79					
	Total			841.96					
	Group X - Wipers								
134	WIPER BLADE 18INCH	EA		2.50	2.83	2.02	2.33	2.84	
135	WIPER BLADE 20INCH	EA		2.50	2.83	2.02	2.33	2.84	
136	WIPER BLADE 22INCH	EA		2.50	2.85	2.02	2.33	2.84	
137	WIPER BLADE 24INCH	EA		2.50	3.85	2.02	2.33	2.84	
138	WIPER BLADE 28INCH	EA		2.50	4.29	6.65	2.78	10.14	
	Total			12.50	16.65	14.73	12.10	21.50	
	BALANCE OF LINE ITEMS								
139	Balance of Line-Miscellaneous Materials and/or Parts	EA		FLEET		10%	10%	COST + 10%	
140	Balance of Line-Specific Materials and/or Parts	EA		FLEET		10%	10%	COST + 10%	

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DS1-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)							
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Truck Pro LLC	The Parts House	Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc.		
Group A - Air Condition							
1	MOTOR, BLOWER, A/C	EA			COST		
2	CONTROLLER	EA					
3	COMPRESSOR,A/C, 8GROOVE	EA					
4	COMPRESSOR,A/C, TM16HS	EA					
5	DRYER,AC	EA					
6	CONDENSER, A/C	EA					
7	AC COVER	EA					
8	FILTER, A/C	EA					
9	DRAIN PAN	EA					
10	PULLEY,A/C,GROOVED	EA					
	Total						
Group B - Alternator/Starter							
11	ALTERNATOR M, 320 AMP	EA	1,092.79				
12	ALTERNATOR M, 320 AMP	EA	1,092.79				
13	STARTER,444E	EA	288.36				
14	STARTER,VT365	EA	250.06				
15	STARTER,C-2 MBE900	EA	243.41				
	Total		2,967.41				
Group C - Belt							
16	BELT,A/C 444E	EA	20.80	16.78	14.44		
17	BELT,A/C, BYPASS VT365	EA	38.82	35.12	27.11		
18	BELT,A/C,ISB6.7L NVSTR	EA	23.09	17.38	16.45		
19	BELT,MAIN, MBE 900 C2	EA	42.94	18.47	25.03		
	Total		125.65	87.75	83.03		
Group D - Body							
20	ROOF HATCH	EA					

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)							
ITEM #			ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Truck Pro LLC	The Parts House	Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc.
			Group E - Brakes				COST
21	PURGE VALVE BENDIX		EA	57.23	53.13		
22	SENSOR, ABS BENDIX		EA	79.09	74.84		
23	VALVE, ABS BENDIX		EA	183.28	180.78		
24	COMPRESSOR, AIR, 444E BENDIX		EA	324.33	360.58		
25	COMPRESSOR, AIR, VT360 BENDIX		EA	443.58	422.33		
26	CARTRIDGE, AIR DRYER BENDIX		EA	23.71	23.37		
27	SEAL, WHEEL FRONT SKF CR		EA	32.92	28.53		
28	SEAL, WHEEL REAR SKF CR		EA	40.29	34.92		
29	AIR CHAMBER FRONT MGM		EA	67.67	46.31		
30	AIR CHAMBER REAR MGM		EA	126.71	110.51		
			Total	1,378.81	1335.3		
			Group F - Brakes				
31	DRUM, REAR GUNITE		EA	96.34	106.09		116.54
32	DRUM, FRONT GUNITE		EA	89.04	137.54		150.00
33	DRUM, REAR GUNITE		EA	164.17	162.91		177.11
34	DRUM, FRONT GUNITE		EA	107.53	154.39		189.04
35	SHOE KIT, FRONT MERITOR		EA	39.92	43.84		
36	SHOE KIT, REAR MERITOR		EA	44.99	56.59		
			Total	541.99	661.36		**
			Group G - Electrical				
37	SOLENOID,DISCONNECT		EA				
38	RELAY STANDARD		EA				
39	ALARM, BACKUP ECCO		EA	79.44			
40	SOLENOID, WHITE RODGES		EA				
41	BREAKER CIRCUIT, COLE HERSEE		EA				
42	SWITCH GPS, COLE HERSEE		EA	6.72			
43	BUZZER, COLE HERSEE		EA	12.38			
			Total	**			

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)					
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Truck Pro LLC	The Parts House	Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc.
	Group H - Engine				
44	FAN CLUTCH, 466MAX BORGWARNER	EA	335.93	229.48	
45	FAN CLUTCH, 3588739C11 *	EA	345.37	290.7	
46	FAN CLUTCH, 444E BORGWARNER	EA	273.42	186.78	
47	FAN CLUTCH, C2 HORTAN	EA	731.01	682.71	
	Total		1,685.73	1389.67	
	Group I - Radiator/Engine				
48	RADIATOR C-2 MBE900	EA			
49	RADIATOR 444E	EA			
50	RADIATOR VT365	EA			
51	RADIATOR CAT 3126	EA			
	Total				
	Group J - Engine				
52	TURBO VT365	EA			
53	TURBO 466 MAXFORCE	EA			
	Total				
	Group K - Exhaust				
54	TAIL PIPE SPOUT	EA	32.14	21.19	
55	SEAL CLAMP 4"	EA	8.17	8.26	
56	TAIL PIPE SPOUT	EA	34.52	22.75	
57	SEAL CLAMP 3 1/2"	EA	8.04	8.03	
	Total		82.87	60.23	
	Group L - Filters				
58	FILTER, AIR	EA	28.79	28.97	
59	FILTER, AIR	EA	21.32	21.32	
60	FILTER, AIR	EA	31.00	30.01	
61	FILTER, OIL	EA	6.94	6.94	
62	FILTER, OIL	EA	4.71	4.71	
63	FILTER, OIL	EA	5.20	5.2	
64	FILTER, FUEL	EA	13.71	13.71	
65	FILTER, FUEL	EA	5.73	5.73	
66	FILTER, FUEL	EA	38.58	33	
67	FILTER, TRANSMISSION	EA	36.92	36.92	
68	FILTER, TRANSMISSION	EA	3.27	3.27	
69	FILTER, POWER STEERING	EA	9.07	9.07	
70	FILTER, POWER STEERING	EA	8.41	8.41	
	Total		213.65	207.26	

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)					
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Truck Pro LLC	The Parts House	Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc.
	Group M - Fuel System				COST
71	INJECTOR, 466 MAXX 1ST GEN.	EA		282.64	
72	INJECTOR, 466 MAXX 2ND GEN.	EA		316.1	
73	INJECTOR, VT365	EA		166.67	
	Total			765.41	
	Group N - Instrumentation				
74	DASH CLUSTER	EA			
75	DASH CLUSTER	EA			
	Total				
	Group O - Lifts				
76	ROLL STOP CYLINDER	EA			
77	KIT, BRAUN, RETRO	EA			
78	FLUID, HYDRAULIC, BRAUNABILITY	EA			
	Total				
	Group P - Lights				
79	BULB, HALGEN H/L	EA	2.41	2.26	1.93
80	BULB, HALGEN H/L C2	EA	3.36	3.06	2.35
81	HEADLIGHT	EA	4.88	5.47	4.97
82	STOPLIGHT KIT (LED)	EA	43.85	40.89	42.62
83	BULB, HALOGEN WARNING	EA	2.32	2.11	1.65
84	LAMP MARKER, RED	EA	4.82	5.02	5.00
85	LAMP MARKER, AMBER	EA	1.88	4.09	2.19
86	LAMP ASSY, RED (LED)	EA		37.6	35.95
87	LAMP, TAG	EA	3.15	3.07	3.88
88	STROBE ASSY	EA	126.65	155.00	105.65
	Total		**	258.57	206.19
	Group Q - Mirrors				
89	BASE, MIRROR	EA			
90	MIRROR	EA			
91	MIRROR	EA			
92	MIRROR, BRACE C2	EA			
93	MIRROR, BASE RH	EA			
94	MIRROR, BRACKET R/S	EA			
95	MIRROR, BRACKET R/S	EA			
96	MIRROR, HEAD, REMOTE	EA			
	Total				

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)							
ITEM #		ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM	Truck Pro LLC	The Parts House	Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc.	
		Group R - Radio				COST	
97		MICROPHONE	EA				
98		MICROPHONE	EA				
99		MICROPHONE	EA				
		Total					
		Group S - Restraints					
100		SAFETY VEST,SMALL EZ-ON	EA				
101		SAFETY VEST,MEDIUM EZ-ON	EA				
102		SAFETY VEST,LARGE EZ-ON	EA				
		Total					
		Group T - Safety Devices					
103		BASE,CROSSARM	EA				
104		BASE,CROSSARM	EA				
105		BASE,CROSSARM	EA				
106		BASE,CROSSARM	EA				
107		BLADE,CROSSARM	EA				
108		BLADE,CROSSARM	EA				
109		STOPARM,FRONT	EA				
110		STOPARM, C2 FRONT	EA				
111		STOPARM, C2 REAR	EA				
112		STOPARM,REAR	EA				
113		POWER SUPPLY,CROSSARM	EA				
		Total					
		Group U - Shop Supplies					
114		BRAKE CLEANER	EA	3.01	1.65		
115		DEGREASER	EA	5.10	3.10		
116		LUBRICANT	EA	6.17	5.00		
117		SILICONE, AEROSOL	EA	3.17	2.67		
118		WASHER FLUID	EA	1.25	1.04		
119		LUBRICANT	EA	4.30	3.64		
		Total		23.00	17.10		

NOTE: A blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.

19040-DST-VT Truck, Bus, & Vehicle Parts (New and Rebuilt)					Truck Pro LLC	The Parts House	Vehicle Maintenance Program, Inc.
ITEM #	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UOM					COST
Group V - Steering/Suspension							
120	TIE ROD	EA	34.79		33.51		
121	TIE ROD	EA	34.79		33.51		
122	DRAGLINK, C2	EA	129.72		104.86		
123	DRAGLINK	EA	106.02		88.7		
124	TIE ROD	EA	27.25		22.8		
125	TIE ROD	EA	27.25		22.8		
126	AIR BAG	EA	107.60		93.12		
127	SHOCK	EA	49.42		42.44		
128	SHOCK	EA	52.48		43.54		
129	SHOCK	EA	33.15		29.06		
	Total		602.17		514.34		
Group W - Wheelchair							
130	KIT, WHEELCHAIR	EA					
131	BELT, SHOULDER/LAP	EA					
132	BELT, RETACTOR	EA					
133	KIT, TIEDOWN	EA					
	Total						
Group X - Wipers							
134	WIPER BLADE 18INCH	EA	3.19		2.29		2.45
135	WIPER BLADE 20INCH	EA	3.19		2.29		2.45
136	WIPER BLADE 22INCH	EA	3.19		2.29		2.29
137	WIPER BLADE 24INCH	EA	3.21		2.29		2.39
138	WIPER BLADE 28INCH	EA	3.28		2.29		2.40
	Total		16.06		11.45		11.98
BALANCE OF LINE ITEMS							
139	Balance of Line-Miscellaneous Materials and/or Parts	EA		20%		10%	
140	Balance of Line-Specific Materials and/or Parts	EA		25%		10%	

NOTE: Blank space represents a "no bid" by the vendor for a given item.

* Items that do not meet specifications shall not be considered valid and shall not be tabulated, per bid document.