
CITY OF CLEARWATER

ITB #20-20, Outdoor Site Furnishings

DUE DATE: April 29, 2020; 10:00 AM

BID TABULATION

Item Description

Estimated

3-Year 

Term

Quantities

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

Chongqing Arlau
Price

Each

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

Corporate 

Interiors

Price

Each

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

Furniture by 

Willam Webb

Price

Each

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

Graber 

Manufacturing

Price

Each

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

Plamore 

Recreational 

Products

Price

Each

Minimum 

Qty

 per Order 

Victor 

Stanley, Inc

Price

Each

1 Standard Picnic Table 60 10 1,290.00$           EA n/a no bid EA 10 3,886.20$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $1,236.14 EA 60 4,297.80$    EA

2 ADA Standard Picnic Table 15 10 1,206.00$           EA n/a no bid EA 5 4,330.70$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $1,236.14 EA 15 3,970.80$    EA

3 Hoop Bike Rack 30 10 162.00$               EA n/a no bid EA 10 787.40$                EA 1 400.49$               EA 5 $244.61 EA 30 527.90$        EA

4 Drink Rail w/Legs 10 10 615.00$               EA n/a no bid EA 3 4,826.00$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $516.30 EA n/a no bid EA

5 Drink Rail 10 10 433.00$               EA n/a no bid EA 3 3,556.00$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $395.74 EA n/a no bid EA

6 Short Drink Rail 10 10 296.00$               EA n/a no bid EA 3 2,794.00$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $297.02 EA n/a no bid EA

7 Backless Bench 75 10 459.00$               EA 10 1,058.65$       EA 10 2,082.80$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $759.16 EA 75 971.10$        EA

8 Bench with Back 25 10 852.00$               EA 10 2,269.96$       EA 8 3,683.00$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $1,070.16 EA 25 1,201.70$    EA

9 Trash Receptacle 150 10 640.00$               EA n/a no bid EA 10 1,384.30$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $444.34 EA 150 1,490.60$    EA

10 Removable Bollard 10 10 189.00$               EA n/a no bid EA 3 1,739.90$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $721.20 EA n/a no bid EA

11 Non-removable Bollard 25 10 152.00$               EA n/a no bid EA 8 1,054.10$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $661.20 EA 25 448.00$        EA

12 Square Three-Seat Picnic Table 21 10 970.00$               EA n/a no bid EA 7 2,641.60$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $1,287.68 EA 21 3,058.70$    EA

13 Square Four-Seat Picnic Table 15 10 1,097.00$           EA n/a no bid EA 5 2,641.60$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $1,038.71 EA 15 3,685.00$    EA

14 Round High Top Table 30 10 376.00$               EA n/a no bid EA 10 1,574.80$             EA n/a no bid EA 5 $462.13 EA 30 1,058.60$    EA

Note: Items with a (              ) indicates intent to award 

Products did not meet 

specifications


