
CITY OF CLEARWATER

ITB #05-20, FIRE CLOTHING AND EQUIPMENT

DUE DATE: NOVEMBER 6, 2019

BID TABULATION

Description Brand Style #
Est. Quantity

(UOM)
 Size  Price  Oversized  Oversized Pricing  Size  Price  Oversized  Oversized Pricing  Size  Price  Oversized 

 Oversized 
Pricing 

Uniforms

SOFT SHELL JACKET, BLACK ROTHCO 9834
1 S-XL  $                     66.95 

   2XL     
                                 3XL

$71.95
                    $79.95 S-XL  $                     60.00 

   2XL     
                                 3XL

$65
                    $70

PANTS, STATION NAVY RED KAP PT20NV
6 28-42  $                     19.95 

  44-50    
                                 52-60

$22.95
                    $24.95 24-42  $                     15.25 

  44+    
                  INSEAM 33/35/

$17
                    $16.25

SHIRTS, SHORT SLEEVE BLUE SOUTH EASTERN 3203
6 14-17.5  $                     32.45 

  18-19   
                               19.5-20

$35.45
                    $39.45 14-17.5  $                     35.50 

  18-19   
                               19.5-20

$38.50
                    $39.50

SHIRTS, LONG SLEEVE BLUE SOUTH EASTERN 3103
1 14-17.5  $                     34.95 

  18-19   
                               19.5-20

$38.45
                    $42.95 14-17.5  $                     38.75 

  18-19   
                               19.5-20

$41.75
                    $42.75

T-SHIRTS, SHORT SLEEVE NAVY ANY
50/50 COTTON 
BLEND 8  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID S-XL  $                       5.50 

   2XL     
                                 3XL

$7
                    $8

T-SHIRTS, LONG SLEEVE NAVY ANY 
50/50 COTTON 
BLEND 3  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID S-XL  $                       7.75 

   2XL     
                                 3XL

$9.25
                    $10.25

SHORTS, BDU ZIPPER NAVY PROPPER F5261
2 S-2XL  $                     22.95 S-2XL  $                     21.70 

JUMPSUIT, NAVY RED KAP CP40NV
1 S-XL  $                     75.95  2XL-3XL  $                     80.95 S-XL  $                     69.95  2XL-3XL  $                     76.95 

HAT, BALLCAP NAVY ANY ANY
1 S/M-L/XL  $                     14.95 ALL  $                     12.50 

TIE, CLIP-ON BLACK 90049
1 ALL  $                       6.50 ALL  $                       4.95 

SHIRTS, SHORT SLEEVE WHITE SOUTH EASTERN 3202
6 14-17.5  $                     32.45 

   18-19     
                              19.5-20

$35.45
                    $39.45 14-17.5  $                     35.50 

  18-19   
                               19.5-20

$38.50
                    $39.50

SHIRTS, LONG SLEEVE WHITE SOUTH EASTERN 3102
1 14-17.5  $                     34.95 

   18-19     
                              19-20

$38.45
                    $42.95 14-17.5  $                     38.75 

  18-19   
                               19.5-20

$41.75
                    $42.75

JACKET, BLAZER DARK NAVY FLYING CROSS N/A
1 36-46  $                   289.00 

  48-54   
                               56-60

$319
                    $339  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

TROUSERS, DRESS DARK NAVY FLYING CROSS N/A
1 28-42  $                     99.00  44-50  $                   109.00  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

CAP, BELL CROWN WHITE CUSTOM N/A N/A
1 S-2XL  $                   109.00 ALL  $                     64.00 

SHOES, HI GLOSS OXFORD BATES 22141
1 ALL  $                     69.95 ALL  $                     65.00 

Moisture Wicking Polo Shirt Short Sleeve, 
WHITE

CORNERSTONE N/A
5 S-XL  $                     35.95 

   2XL     
                                 3XL

$37.95
                    $39.95 1-7 S-XL  $                     43.40 XXL  $                     45.40 

PANTS, CLASSIC CARGO TRU-SPEC 1186
6 28-44  $                     42.25  46-54  $                     47.25 28-44  $                     38.20  46+  $                     42.00 

PANTS, STATION BLACK RED KAP PT20BK
6 28-42  $                     20.50  44-60  $                     23.50 24-42  $                     15.25 

  44+    
                  INSEAM 33/35/

$17
                    $16.25

ALTERATION TO CLASS A BLAZER FLYING CROSS N/A
per stripe  $                     15.00  per maltese cross  $                       5.00 per braid  $                     18.00  per maltese cross  $                       3.75 

PANTS, TACTICAL NAVY PROPPER 25214
3 30-56  $                     38.95 28-56  $                     38.20 

T-SHIRTS, SHORT SLEEVE GREY ANY
50/50 COTTON 
BLEND 6  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID S-XL  $                       5.50 

   2XL     
                                 3XL

$7
                    $8

T-SHIRTS, LONG SLEEVE GREY ANY 
50/50 COTTON 
BLEND 3  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID S-XL  $                       7.75 

   2XL     
                                 3XL

$9.25
                    $10.25

PANTS, SUPERVISOR 100% POLY BLACK SOUTH EASTERN 9009
3 28-42  $                     36.95  44-50  $                     39.95 28-42  $                     29.00 

 44-50   
                               52-54

$31
                    $32.50

T-SHIRTS, SHORT SLEEVE WHITE ANY
50/50 COTTON 
BLEND 6  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID S-XL  $                       4.50 

   2XL     
                                 3XL

$6
                    $7

T-SHIRTS, LONG SLEEVE WHITE ANY
50/50 COTTON 
BLEND 3  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID S-XL  $                       6.25 

   2XL     
                                 3XL

$8.25
                    $9.25

PANTS, TACTICAL BLACK PROPPER F527450
3 30-56  $                     38.95 28-56  $                     38.20 

COAT, MILITARY POLY WOOL BLEND 
MCBLUE (BLACK)

FECH 19B9996C
1 ALL  $                   795.00  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

TROUSERS, MILITARY POLY WOOL BLEND FECH 28P8696C
1 ALL  $                   175.00  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

SHIRTS, JOBSHIRTS ANY ANY 1 S-XL  $                     46.95 S-5XL $62.00

        star indicates intent to award

Uniforms Manufacturing, Inc (UMI) 
**non-responsive**

North America Fire Equipment Company Inc. Signal 15 Inc.
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