

CITY OF CLEARWATER

ITB # 05-19, Chemicals: Sodium Hydroxide / Sodium Bisulfite

DUE DATE: January 22, 2019; 10:00 AM

BID TABULATION

Vendor	Description	Unit Price (per Gallon) (A)	Estimated Quantity (B)	Total Price (A X B)	
Allied Universal Corporation (NON-RESPONSIVE)	50% Sodium Hydroxide (Caustic Soda)	\$ 2.1500	93,724	\$ 201,506.60	3,500 gl minimum between 2 locations
Harcros Chemicals Inc ★	50% Sodium Hydroxide (Caustic Soda)	\$ 2.48	93,724	\$ 232,435.52	
Hawkins, Inc	50% Sodium Hydroxide (Caustic Soda)	\$ 2.55	93,724	\$ 238,996.20	
Odyssey Manufacturing Company	50% Sodium Hydroxide (Caustic Soda)	\$ 2.50	93,724	\$ 234,310.00	
Thatcher Chemical of Florida	50% Sodium Hydroxide (Caustic Soda)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Univar USA, Inc (NON-RESPONSIVE)	50% Sodium Hydroxide (Caustic Soda)	\$ 1.7950	93,724	\$ 168,234.58	minimum 44,000 lbs per delivery (3,500 gl)

Vendor	Description	Unit Price (per Pound) (A)	Unit Price (per Gallon) (B)	Estimated Quantity (C)	Total Price (A or B x C)	
Allied Universal Corporation (NON-RESPONSIVE)	Sodium Bisulfite	N/A	\$ 1.5900	133,590	\$ 212,408.10	4,000 gl minimum between 4 locations
Harcros Chemicals Inc	Sodium Bisulfite	\$0.1750	\$ 1.9880	133,590	\$ 265,576.92	
Hawkins, Inc	Sodium Bisulfite	No Bid	No Bid	133,590	No Bid	Price calculated by City using the supplied SDS
Odyssey Manufacturing Company	Sodium Bisulfite	No Bid	No Bid	133,590	No Bid	
Thatcher Chemical of Florida ★	Sodium Bisulfite	\$ 0.1293	\$ 1.6567	133,590	\$ 221,318.55	
Univar USA, Inc	Sodium Bisulfite	No Bid	No Bid	133,590	No Bid	

REMARKS: Price(s) with star (★) indicates apparent low bidder, intent to award.