EXHIBIT B - BID PRICING FILE
ITB 29-16, LANDSCAPING SERVICES
BID SUMMARY PAGE

ZONE 1 BEACH TOTAL

ZONE 2 COUNTRYSIDE TOTAL

ZONE 3 DOWNTOWN TOTAL

ZONE 4 EAST TOTAL

ZONE 5 NORTHWEST TOTAL

ZONE 6 SOUTHWEST TOTAL

Botanical
Dimensions

S 46,074.00

$ 79,530.00

S 46,200.00

S 86,681.00

$ 105,168.00

$ 54,351.00

incumbent

Central FL
Landscaping

incumbent

$ 123,631.12

S 46,005.48

S 84,406.19

$ 164,542.13

no bid

Duval
Landscape

$ 41,838.62

$ 81,014.10

$ 37,115.76

$ 76,447.91

$-47,910:01

see Note 1

$ 48,546.62

see Note 2

Earth
Designs

$ 63,380.00

S 57,590.00
incumbent

$ 52,740.00

incumbent

$ 116,270.00

$ 69,020.00

Note 1) zone bid found non-responsible due to disparity with competing bids and historical performance challenges in respective zone

Note 2) Duval is low bid in Zones 3 and 6; recommend award only Zone 3 due to capacity concerns

Hemlock
Lawn Maint

no bid

no bid

$ 44,810.00

no bid

no bid

no bid

Entzion
Prop Mgmt

$ 59,600.00

S 57,140.00
incumbent

$ 69,065.00

incumbent

$ 65,797.00

Infante
Services

no bid

$ 95,879.68

S 82,268.20

S 61,778.90

no bid

no bid
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