CITY OF CLEARWATER

ITB # 41-16, Security Cameras
DUE DATE: July 14, 2016; 10:00 AM
BID TABULATION

Unit of U Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Line # Description Measure ACCI APG Automation GSA Security
1 Axis Q3505-V 9mm IP Camera Each 954.89 1,042.88 813.36
2 Axis Q3505-V 22mm IP Camera Each 1,050.47 1,147.26 894.78
3 Axis P3367-VE IP Camera Each 1,146.06 1,251.65 976.20
4 Axis M3037-PVE — 180 mode IP Camera Each 763.72 834.09 976.20
5 Axis QB6000E (solo) IP Camera Each 1,528.38 no bid 1,464.70
6 Axis QB6000E w/PTZ Q6045-E MK Il IP Camera Each 3,447.70 1,669.21 3,900.00
Axis Communications 64GB microSD Extended
7 Capacity (microSDXC) Each 75.67 86.36 65.05
Axis T8415 (provide to the City following the initial
8 installation) Each 669.60 647.69 487.68
9 Fiber (SM6 strand) Foot 1.01 1.61 0.35
Weather-proof polycarbonate enclosure, L-
10 com.com #NB181608-100 or equal Each 322.29 355.60 425.00
11 Outdoor switch, Antaira LMP-0601G-SFP-T Each 575.00 900.43 735.00
12 Mount for outdoor switch, DIN-RAIL-10 Each 2.99 7.62 6.10
13 Rails for outdoor switch, DR-120-48 Each 94.30 104.14 90.10
14 CAT6a - indoor Foot 0.69 0.88 0.33
15 CAT 6a — outdoor, shielded Foot 0.57 no bid 0.58
16 CAT5e - indoor Foot 0.15 no bid 0.12
17 CATS5e — outdoor, shielded Foot 0.39 no bid 0.46
Outdoor Gel Tape Shielded CAT5e FTP Cable,
18 Shireen #DC-1042 or equal Foot 0.25 no bid 0.25
19 VMS software — per camera license fee Each 286.16 313.38 263.00
VMS software — per camera annual license fee
20 renewal Each n/a 60.18 48.00
Total 10,920.29 8,422.98 11,147.26
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Unit of U Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Line # Description Measure ACCI APG Automation GSA Security
1 Axis Q3505-V 9mm IP Camera Each 95489 [ $ 1,042.88| $ 813.36
2 Axis Q3505-V 22mm IP Camera Each 1,05047 [ $ 1,147.26 | $ 894.78
3 Axis P3367-VE IP Camera Each 1,146.06 | $ 1,251.65| $ 976.20
4 Axis M3037-PVE — 180 mode IP Camera Each 763.72 | $ 834.09 | $ 976.20
Unit of U Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
Line # Description Measure ACCI APG Automation GSA Security
. . . Cost +/-
Miscellaneous materials: terminals, connectors,
21 etc. Percentage +5% +60% +10%
22 BICSI RCDD site supervisor Hour 65.00| $ 185.00| $ 65.00
23 Axis Certified Professional Hour 55.00 | $ 130.00| $ 55.00
Other labor
24 Hour 50.00| $ 100.00| $ 45.00
Other labor
25 Hour no bid no bid electrician $76.50
24 Fire Station 45 Estimate Project 64,893.08 | $ 123,000.00 | $ 49,103.44
25 Fire Station 48 Estimate Project 59,657.35[ $ 102,000.00 | $ 40,455.80
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