
 

PROCUREMENT SERVICES – DIVISION OF OFFICE OF MANAGEMENT AND BUDGET SERVICES 

P.O. BOX 7800 • 315 W. MAIN ST., TAVARES, FL 32778 • P 352.343.9839 • F 352.343.9473 
Board of County Commissioners • www.lakecountyfl.gov 

    

MODIFICATION OF CONTRACT 
 
  Modification Number:Nine (9) 

Effective Date: 3/1/2021 

 
Contract Number: 17-0606G 

Title: Fire Equipment, Parts, Supplies, and Service 

Effective Date: July 1, 2017  
 

Contracting Officer: Amy Munday 

E-mail: amunday@lakecountyfl.gov  

Telephone Number: (352) 343-9389 

 
 Contractor Name and Address: 

 
Name: Municipal Emergency Services (MES)  

Address: 3789 62nd Avenue North 

City: Pinellas Park, Florida 33781 

ATTENTION: Jamie Robinson, Regional VP 

 

Issued By: 
Procurement Services 

Lake County Administration Building 
315 W. Main St., Suite 441 

Tavares, Florida 32778-7800 
 
INSTRUCTIONS: Contractor shall sign Signature Block showing acceptance of the below written modification and return 
this form to Procurement Services within ten (10) days after receipt.  Once fully executed, a copy of this modification will be 
returned to the Contractor to attach to the original Contract. 
 
DESCRIPTION OF MODIFICATION: Contract modification to update the manufacturer list for Akron Brass 

products. SEE ATTACHED: 

 

CONTRACTOR SIGNATURE BLOCK 

Signature:  _______________________________________ 

Print Name:  ______________________________________ 

Title:  ____________________________________________ 

Date:  ____________________________________________ 

E-mail:  ___________________________________________ 

Secondary E-mail: __________________________________     

LAKE COUNTY SIGNATURE BLOCK 

Signature:  _____________________________________ 

Print Name:  ___________________________________ 

Title:  Contracting Officer 

Date:  _________________________________________ 

  

 
 Distribution: 

Original – Bid File 
Copy – Contractor 
Contracting Officer  

 

Jamie Robinson
Regional Vice President

03/11/2021

jrobinson@mesfire.com

Amy Munday

March 12, 2021

mailto:amunday@lakecountyfl.gov




 

PROCUREMENT SERVICES – DIVISION OF OFFICE OF MANAGEMENT AND BUDGET SERVICES 
P.O. BOX 7800 • 315 W. MAIN ST., TAVARES, FL 32778 • P 352.343.9839 • F 352.343.9473 

Board of County Commissioners • www.lakecountyfl.gov 

    

MODIFICATION OF CONTRACT 
 
  Modification Number:Seven (7) 

Effective Date: 11/3/2020 

 
Contract Number: 17-0606G 

Title: Fire Equipment-Parts-Supplies-Service  

Effective Date: July 1, 2017 
 

Contracting Officer: Amy Munday 

E-mail: amunday@lakecountyfl.gov  

Telephone Number: (352) 343-9389 

 
 Contractor Name and Address: 

 
Name: Municipal Emergency Services (MES) 

Address: 3789 62nd Avenue, North 

City: Pinellas Park, FL 33781 

ATTENTION: Jamie Robinson, Regional VP 
 

Issued By: 
Procurement Services 

Lake County Administration Building 
315 W. Main St., Suite 441 

Tavares, Florida 32778-7800 
 
INSTRUCTIONS: Contractor shall sign Signature Block showing acceptance of the below written modification and return 
this form to Procurement Services within ten (10) days after receipt.  Once fully executed, a copy of this modification will be 
returned to the Contractor to attach to the original Contract. 
 
DESCRIPTION OF MODIFICATION: Contract modification to update the attached manufacturing listing: 

 

CONTRACTOR SIGNATURE BLOCK 

Signature:  _______________________________________ 

Print Name:  ______________________________________ 

Title:  ____________________________________________ 

Date:  ____________________________________________ 

E-mail:  ___________________________________________ 

Secondary E-mail: __________________________________     

LAKE COUNTY SIGNATURE BLOCK 

Signature:  _____________________________________ 

Print Name:  ___________________________________ 

Title:  Contracting Officer 

Date:  _________________________________________ 

  

 
 Distribution: 

Original – Bid File 
Copy – Contractor 
Contracting Officer  

 

Jamie Robinson
Regional Vice President
11/3/20

jrobinson@mesfire.com

Amy Munday

November 3, 2020



































































ATTACHMENT 2 – PRICING FORM

Current brands in use by the Fire Rescue Division include the following. Please complete the following information for 
those brands supported by your firm. Enter “yes” or “no” for stocking distributor. If you represent other manufacturers for 
similar fire-related equipment, parts, or supplies not listed, please add the manufacturer and pricing information in the 
blank spaces at end of pricing table. 

Brand  
Discount off 

List Price   
Hourly Rate for 
Repair Service   

Stocking  
Distributor?    

3M COMPANY  15%  N/A No  

ABLE 2 SHO ME  10% N/A No 

ACTION 25% $50 No

AH STOCK  10% $37  No  

AIM   No bid 

AJAX  10% $34  Min order $50 

AKRON BRASS   20% $60  Yes   

ALL AMERICAN FIRE HOSE  No bid

ALLEN SYSTEMS   No bid 

ALCOLITE (SAM CARBIS)  10% $40 No  

AMEREX  Net plus 20% $42.50  Yes 

AMERICAN FIREWEAR   15% $30  Yes 

AMERICAN LAFRANCE  No bid 

ANGUS  20% $48  Yes 

ANSUL FOAMS   15% $35  Yes 

APPLECROFT  No bid 

B & B ENTERPRISES  15% N/A  No  

BIO SYSTEMS  No bid 

BLACKINTON BADGES  10% $16  No  

BOUTON CO   No bid 

BULLARD – HELMETS  20% $32.50  Yes 

BULLARD – OTHER 10% 32.50 Yes



CALIFORNIA MOUNTAIN   No bid        

CARNS & BROTHER   No bid        

CAST PRODUCTS   No bid        

CHARKATE   No bid      

CHUBB (FOAM)   No bid      

CHURCHVILLE    No bid      

CIRCUL AIR   List  $23  No  

CODE 3   20%  $58  No  

COLLIN AXES   No bid      

COLLINS DYNAMICS (ROM  
CORP)   

22%  $51.50  No  

COUNCIL TOOLS   20%  $44  No  

CUTTERS EDGE   No bid (See 
Eastern Fire)  

    

CW NEILSEN   No bid      

DARLEY & CO   No bid      

DAVID CLARK   No bid      

DB SMITH INDIAN TANKS   No bid      

DICKE TOOL   15%  $44  No  

DRAEGER ENGINEERED 
SOLUTIONS   

No bid      

DREXEL    No bid      

DUO SAFETY   No bid      

EDISON   20%  $22  No  

EDWARDS AND CROMWELL   10%  $46  No  

EDWARDS MFG   10%  $22.50  No  

ELKHART BRASS   20%  $36  Yes  

ETI EMERGENCY TECHNOLOGY   No bid      

EXTENDA LITE (AKRON)   No bid      

FEDERAL SIGNAL CORP   20%  $35  No  

FIRE HOOKS UNLIMITED   List  $25  Yes  



FIREDEX   10%  $42.50  Yes  

FIRE POWER   No bid      

FIREQUIP   No bid    

FLAMEFIGHTER   20%  $41.50  No  

FOL-DA-TANK   20%  $36  No  

GEMTOR   20%  $28  Min order $75  

GLASSMASTER WEHR   15%  $22  No  

GLOBE   No bid      

GLOVE CORP   No bid      

GORMAN RUPP PUMPS   No bid      

HALE FIRE PUMPS   List  $45  No  

HANNAY REELS   10%  $30  No  

HARRINGTON   25%  $22  No  

HAZARD CONTROL   No bid      

HEBERT   List  $55  No  

HOLMATRO   No bid      

HONEYWELL – PPE  10%  $45  No  

HONEYWELL HELMETS & PARTS  10%  $37  Yes  

HONEYWELL PRO WARRINGTON  10%  $40  Yes  

HUMAT   List  $20  No  

HUSKY   25%  $45  No  

HYDRA SHIELD   12%  $31  No  

IMPERIAL HOSE   No bid      

IOWA AMERICAN   No bid      

JANESVILLE   No bid      

JUSTRITE   20%  $22  No  

JV MFG   No bid      

KAPPLER   List  $35  No  



KENDALL PRODUCTS   No bid      

KOCHEK   25%  $20  Yes  

KOEHLER MFG CO   20%  $25  Yes  

KUSSMAUL   10%  $55  No  

LACROSSE BOOTS   No bid      

LIFE LINERS   No bid      

LIONS UNIFORMS   10%  $35  No  

LOUIS PRYER   No bid      

LOWELL   No bid      

MAG INSTRUMENTS   10%  $35  No  

MANN AXE   No bid      

MARS SIGNAL LIGHT   No bid      

MC PRODUCTS   No bid      

MORAN (FLASH)   No bid      

MORNING PRIDE   10%  $45  No  

MSA   No bid      

NATALE (CIRCLE D)   15%  $35  No  

NORTH AMERICAN FIRE HOSE   List  $30  No  

NOVA   No bid      

NUPLA   15%  $35  No  

PACIFIC REFLEX   15%  $40  No  

PARATECH   No bid      

PARTNER   No bid      

PAUL CONWAY SHIELDS   10%  $5  No  

PELICAN   List plus 10%  $50  Yes  

PETZL   20%  $38  Yes  

PGI PROTEXALL   5%  $40  No  

PHOENIX   No bid      

PIERCE   No bid      



PIGEON MOUNTAIN INDUSTRIES   10%  $25  No  

PLANO   No bid      

R & B FABRICATORS   10%  $35  No  

RANGER RUBBER   15%  $25  No  

RAWHIDE FIREHOSE   No bid      

REDHEAD BRASS   No bid      

REFLEXITE   No bid      

RICE HYDRO CO   10%  $65  No  

SCBAS   15%  $55  No  

SCOTT AVIATION   No bid      

SECURITEX   No bid      

SENSIBLE MOUNTS   15%  $55  No  

SERVUS BOOTS   No bid      

SHELBY WOLVERINE   List  $50 No  

SNAPTITE   No bid      

SNORKEL   No bid      

SOUTH PARK   20%  $45  No  

SIGNAL VEHICLE PRODUCTS   No bid      

CLASS ONE (SPAN INSTRUMENTS)   No bid      

SPUMIFER   No bid      

STERLING ROPE   15%  $22  Yes  

SUPERVAC   5%  $45  No  

TNT TOOLS   10%  $55  No  

TASK FORCE TIPS (TFT) 5%  $45  Yes  

THOROGOOD/WEINBRENNER/LION 
BOOTS 

15%  $37  No  

SUPERIOR PNEUMATIC   No bid      

TASKMASTER   No bid      

TEAM EQUIPMENT   List  N/A  No  



TELELITE   5%  $55  No  

TEMPEST FANS   10%  $37  No  

TEMPEST FANS – VS series batteries 
and accessories 

List plus 5% $37 No 

TOMAR   No bid      

TOPPS   List plus 10%  $35  No  

TURTLE PLASTICS   List  $35  No  

UNDERWATER KINETICS   List  $35  No  

UNITY LIGHTS   No bid      

VANNER   No bid      

VERIDIAN  - PPE  25%  $35  Yes  

VERTX   No bid      

VETTER   List  $70  No  

WATEROUS   List  $45  No  

WELDON   25%  $33  No  

WHELEN ENGINEERING   15%  $45  No  

WILL BURT   No bid      

WINCO GENERATORS   No bid      

WINDSOL   No bid      

WILLIAMS FOAM   List  N/A  No  

WORDEN   No bid      

ZEPHYR   List  $35  No  

ZIMATIC / ZICO  List  $35  Yes  

OTHER BRANDS NOT LISTED:   

5.11   20%  N/A  Yes  

Anchor Industries (Fire Shelters) 10%  $25  No  

Avon Manufacturing 5% $45 No 

 Black Diamond  15%  $25  Yes  

 Boston Leather  20%  $22.50  Yes  

 CET Pumps  15%  $40  No  



 Chemguard  10%  N/A  Yes  

CMC Rescue  10%  $50 Yes  

CrewBoss  20%  $25  Yes  

Decon Systems (Saunaray)  List  $70  No  

Diamond Wipes (Hero Wipes)  5%  N/A  Yes  

Dragonfire (J Scott Solutions)  20%  $27  Yes  

DuPont 5% $60 No 

Eastern Fire Equipment Services 5% $95 No 

Elbeco  10%  $20  Yes  

Energizer  10%  N/A  Yes  

Ergodyne  20%  $30  Yes  

ESS  20%  $22  Yes  

Euramco (Ram Fan)  15%  $55  Yes  

EVAC Systems 5% $50 No 

Fire Innovations  10%  N/A  No  

Fire Research (FRC)  15%  N/A  No  

Fire Soaps 5%  $N/A No 

Diamond Wipes (Fire Wipes) 5%  N/A  Yes  

Firecom  5%  $50  No  

FireCraft Gas Detecion (Sensit)  5%  $105 No  

FireCraft Gloves  10%  $35 Yes  

First Tactical 10% N/A No 

FSI North America List $85 No 

FoxFire 10% $40 No 

FoxFury  10%  $40  No  

Fresh Gear  5%  N/A  Yes  

Grace Industries List $45 No 

Groves / Red Rack  List  $70  No 



Hale 5% $65 No 

Hammerhead (Gear Keeper)  15%  $12  Yes  

Hero’s Pride 5% N/A No 

HexArmor  15%  N/A  Yes  

Homeland 6 (H6 Tactical) 10%  $25  No  

Honeywell Analytics List plus 5% $95 No 

Hot Shields  5%  $20.50  No  

Hurst  5%  $100 Yes  

Hurst ED/EWXT Service – per tool $200.00 $100 non-warranty 
repairs 

Yes 

Hurst HP Service – per set $780.00 $100 non-warranty 
repairs 

Yes 

Hurst LP Service – per set  $855.00  $100 non-warranty 
repairs 

Yes  

Industrial Scientific – monitors  10%  $105  Yes  

Industrial Scientific – accessories  List  $105  No  

Kroll 10% $33 No 

Lakeland  10%  $25  No  

Leader Fans  10%  $65  No  

Leatherhead Tools  20%  $25  Yes  

Lightning X  10%  $15.50  No  

Little Giant  5%  N/A  No  

Majestic Hoods  20%  $20  Yes  

Majestic Hoods – GORE  List  $20  Yes  

Matex  15%  $30  No  

Mustang Survival 10% $55 No 

National Foam  10%  N/A  Yes  

National River Supply (NRS) 10% $60 No 

OHD List $85 No 

Pacific Helmets 5% $63 No 

Performance Advantage Company (PAC) 10%  $26  No  

Plastix Plus  5%  $30  Yes  



PMI Rope 10% N/A No 

Point Blank  Per NASPO  $55  No  

Protective Industrial Products (PIP) 10% $55 No 

Radians 10% $40 No 

RAE Systems  5%  $70  No  

Redback Boots  20%  $24  Yes  

Rescue 42  5%  $63  Yes  

Ringers List $50 Yes 

RIT Safety Solutions 10% $38 No 

Rock N Rescue 10% N/A No 

Savox List $100 No 

Scott Safety – compressors and parts  5%  $105 No  

Scott Safety – gas detection 5% $90 Yes 

Scott Safety – SCBA and parts 15%  $85  Yes  

Scott Safety – SCBA flow test – per 
SCBA 

$45.00 N/A Yes 

Scott Safety/ISG – Thermal Imagers  5%  $115 Yes  

Scott Safety/ISG – Thermal Imager parts  List  $115  Yes  

Scott/3M Fit testing – per mask $35.00 N/A Yes 

Scott Safety – cylinder hydro testing $35.00 N/A Yes 

Scotty Firefighter 15% $60 No 

Seek Thermal  5%  $45  Yes  

Shelby List $50 No 

Silent Partners List N/A Yes 

Simulaids  5%  $60  No  

SM Smith 5% $35 No 

StatPacks  10%  $25  No  

Steck 10% N/A No 

Streamlight  15%  $55  Yes  

Target Solutions  List  N/A  Yes  



Task Force Tips – Blitzforce series List $45 No 

Tru-Spec  10%  N/A  Yes  

True North (Dragon Fire)  10%  $30  No whe 

Tyco 10% $35 Yes 

UltraTec 15% N/A No 

Veridian – gloves, hoods, accessories  10%  $35  Yes  

Warthog 5% N/A No 

Workrite  10%  $30  Yes  

Yates 5% $37 No 

 

   
 

   






































































