
02/17/26 @ 10 am
BADGER METER, INC. Consolidated Pipe & SuppEmpire Pipe & Supply Com  Ferguson Enterprises LLC

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1
5/8"x 3/4"Double Check Backflow Meter laying 
length (7 1 ⁄2 inches) Potable Water 400 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid $503.58

2
5/8 "x 3/4", Water Meter, Positive Displacement, 
Magnetically driven, Potable Water  2000 Each $67.92 $69.23 $65.00 No Bid

3
1", Water Meter, Positive Displacement, 
Magnetically driven, Potable Water  200 Each $144.04 $211.15 $137.26 No Bid

4
1  1/2", Water Meter, Positive Displacement, 
Magnetically driven, Potable Water  50 Each $395.51 $422.69 $380.00 No Bid

5
2", Water Meter, Positive Displacement, 
Magnetically driven, Potable Water  50 Each $558.00 $520.19 $552.76 No Bid

6
1", Water Meter, Positive Displacement, 
Magnetically driven, Reclaimed Water  200 Each $149.89 $100.15 $137.26 No Bid

7
2", Water Meter, Positive Displacement, 
Magnetically driven, Reclaimed Water  20 Each $563.00 $396.58 $552.76 No Bid
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