
CITY OF CLEARWATER Apparent Low Bidder

ITB # 34-19 - Biosolids Management Services Vendor did not submit price

DUE DATE: July 11, 2019; 10:00 AM
BID TABULATION

Item No. Description Unit Price
 Estimated

Annual
Quantity 

 Total Annual
Price Unit Price

 Estimated
Annual

Quantity 

 Total Annual
Price Unit Price

 Estimated
Annual

Quantity 

 Total Annual
Price Unit Price

 Estimated
Annual

Quantity 

 Total Annual
Price 

1A

Stabilized (Class B) Biosolids (Dewatered 
Cake) to Land Application, removed from 
Northeast WRF  $            43.84 

 9,600
WET
TONS  $                     420,864.00  $            30.00 

 9,600
WET
TONS  $                     288,000.00  $           30.75 

 9,600
WET
TONS  $                     295,200.00  $           25.97 

 9,600
WET
TONS  $                     249,312.00 

1B

Stabilized (Class B) Biosolids (Dewatered 
Cake) to Land Application,
Removed from Marshall Street WRF  $            43.84 

 5,500 
WET 
TONS  $                     241,120.00  $            30.00 

 5,500 
WET 
TONS  $                     165,000.00  $           30.75 

 5,500 
WET 
TONS  $                     169,125.00  $           25.97 

 5,500 
WET 
TONS  $                     142,835.00 

2

Unstabilized Liquid Sludge (approximately 5% 
total solids) from East WRF to NE WRF (est. 
65,000 gallons PER WEEK)  $            0.033 

 3,380,000 
GALLONS  $                     111,540.00  $          0.0344 

 3,380,000 
GALLONS  $                     116,272.00  $         0.0330 

 3,380,000 
GALLONS  $                     111,540.00  $         0.0300 

 3,380,000 
GALLONS  $                     101,400.00 

 $                     773,524.00  $                     569,272.00  $                     575,865.00  $                     493,547.00 

Item No. Description Unit Price
 Estimated

Annual
Quantity 

 Total Annual
Price Unit Price

 Estimated
Annual

Quantity 

 Total Annual
Price Unit Price

 Estimated
Annual

Quantity 

 Total Annual
Price Unit Price

 Estimated
Annual

Quantity 

 Total Annual
Price 

1A

Class B Biosolids Requiring Incorporation, 
from the Marshall Street and/or the Northeast 
WRF (est. 260 wet tons PER WEEK)  NO BID 

 1,040        
WET TONS  NO BID  $            34.00 

 1,040        
WET TONS  $                      35,360.00  $           37.25 

 1,040        
WET TONS  $                      38,740.00  $           27.97 

 1,040        
WET TONS  $                      29,088.80 

2A

Unstabilized Sludge (Dewatered Cake) to 
RMF, from the Marshall Street WRF and/or 
the Northeast WRF  NO BID 

 1,127
WET
TONS  NO BID  $            79.00 

 1,127
WET
TONS  $                      89,033.00  $           64.35 

 1,127
WET
TONS  $                      72,522.45  $           55.87 

 1,127
WET
TONS  $                      62,965.49 

3A

Unstabilized Sludge (Dewatered Cake) to 
Landfill, from the Marshall Street WRF and/or 
the Northeast WRF  $            72.09 

 1,127
WET
TONS  $                      81,245.43  $            81.00 

 1,127
WET
TONS  $                      91,287.00  NO BID 

 1,127
WET
TONS  NO BID  $           71.00 

 1,127
WET
TONS  $                      80,017.00 

4A

Unstabilized Liquid Sludge (approximately 5% 
total solids) from Marshall Street WRF to 
Northeast WRF (additional truck requirement, 
est. 275,000 gallons PER WEEK)  $            0.042 

 1,100,000 
GALLONS  $                      46,200.00  $             0.06 

 1,100,000 
GALLONS  $                      66,000.00  NO BID 

 1,100,000 
GALLONS  NO BID  $         0.0416 

 1,100,000 
GALLONS  $                      45,760.00 

5A

Unstabilized Liquid Sludge (approximately 5% 
(+/- 2%) total solids) from East WRF to 
Marshall Street WRF (est. 75,000 gallons 
PER WEEK)  $            0.054 

 300,000 
GALLONS  $                      16,200.00  $             0.08 

 300,000 
GALLONS  $                      24,000.00  NO BID 

 300,000 
GALLONS  NO BID  $         0.0416 

 300,000 
GALLONS  $                      12,480.00 

6A

Unstabilized Liquid Sludge (approximately 5% 
(+/- 2%) total solids) from Northeast WRF to 
Marshall Street WRF (est. 295,000 gallons 
PER WEEK)  $            0.042 

 1,180,000
GALLONS  $                      49,560.00  $             0.06 

 1,180,000
GALLONS  $                      70,800.00  NO BID 

 1,180,000
GALLONS  NO BID  $         0.0416 

 1,180,000
GALLONS  $                      49,088.00 

 $                     193,205.43  $                     376,480.00  $                     111,262.45  $                     279,399.29 

Items with a star (         ) indicates intent to 
award.

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID TOTAL ALTERNATE BID

Alternate Bid Items

T.Wayne Hill Trucking, Inc.

TOTAL BASE BID

T.Wayne Hill Trucking, Inc.

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID

Base Bid Items

Biosolids Distribution Services, LLC

Synagro South, LLCBiosolids Distribution Services, LLC H & H Liquid Sludge Disposal, Inc.

TOTAL BASE BID TOTAL BASE BID TOTAL BASE BID

H & H Liquid Sludge Disposal, Inc. Synagro South, LLC

TOTAL ALTERNATE BID
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