
Certified Mail

July 14, 2023

NOTICE OF HEARING

MUNICIPAL CODE ENFORCEMENT BOARD
CITY OF CLEARWATER, FLORIDA

Case 69- 23

Owner: Dixon, Josephine Est
207 Pennsylvania Ave. 

Clearwater, FL 33755- 4438

Violation Address: 207 Pennsylvania Ave. 

10- 29- 15- 72000- 002- 0151
Dear Sir/Madam: 

You are hereby formally notified that on Wednesday, August 23, 2023, at 1: 30 p.m. there will be a public
hearing before the Municipal Code Enforcement Board in the Council Chambers, Clearwater Main Library at
100 North Osceola Avenue, Clearwater, Florida, concerning violation of Section 3- 1502. 6 of the Clearwater
City Code. ( See attached Affidavit( s) of Violation). 

You are hereby ordered to appear before the Municipal Code Enforcement Board on the hearing date to
answer these charges and to present your side of the case. Failure to appear may result in the Board
proceeding in your absence. You have the right to obtain an attorney, at your own expense, to represent you
before the Board. If you are absent but represented at the hearing, your representative must present to the
Board your letter authorizing your representative to speak on your behalf. You will have the opportunity to
present witnesses as well as question witnesses against you prior to the Board making a determination. Please
be prepared to present evidence at the hearing concerning the amount of time necessary to correct the alleged
violations should you be found to be in violation of the City Code. 

The case shall be presented to the Board even if the violations described in the attached Affidavit(s) of
Violation are corrected prior to the Board hearing. 

Should you be found in violation of the City Code, the Municipal Code Enforcement Board has the power by
law to levy fines of up to $ 250 a day per violation against you and your property for every day each violation
continues beyond the date set for compliance in an Order of the Board. 

If you wish to have any witnesses subpoenaed, please contact the Secretary of the Municipal Code
Enforcement Board within five ( 5) days at 727- 562- 4097. If you have any questions regarding the cited
violations or if the violations are corrected prior to the hearing, please contact the Inspector whose name
appears on the Affidavit( s) of Violation. 

Sincerely, 

SECRETARY TO TH UNICIPAL CODE ENFORCEMENT BOARD

The Municipal Code Enforcement Board was created pursuant to General Act 80- 300, General Laws of Florida, 
1979, and Ordinance 2169- 80 of the City of Clearwater. 

The City of Clearwater strongly supports and fully complies with the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA). Please
advise us at least 48 hours prior to the hearing if you require special accommodations at 727- 562- 4090. Assisted
Listening Devices are available. Kindly refrain from private conversations, cellular phone use, etc. that
distract meeting participants. 

Any party may appeal a final order of this Board by filing an appeal with the Circuit Court within 30 days of
entry of the order. Appellants need a record of proceedings; a verbatim record of testimony and evidence
that is the basis for the appeal may be required. F. S. § 286. 0105, CDC Sec 7- 104



MUNICIPAL CODE ENFORCEMENT BOARD OF THE CITY OF CLEARWATER, FLORIDA

AFFIDAVIT OF VIOLATION AND REQUEST FOR HEARING
NAME OF VIOLATOR: DIXON, JOSEPHINE EST

CITY CASE#: CDC2023- 00744MAILING ADDRESS: 207 PENNSYLVANIA AVE
CLEARWATER, FL 33755-4438

VIOLATION ADDRESS: 207 PENNSYLVANIA AVE
CLEARWATER, FL

DATE OF OFFICIAL NOTICE OF VIOLATION: 4/21/ 2023

LEGAL DESCRIPTION OF PROPERTY: PLAZA PARK BLK B, N 1/ 2 OF LOTS 15 AND 16
PARCEL #: 10- 29- 15- 72000- 002- 0151

DATE OF INSPECTION: 6/ 26/2023 1: 01: 00 PM

SECTION( S) OF THE CITY CODE WHICH HAVE BEEN VIOLATED: CODE
SECTION VIOLATED

3- 1502. B. - ** EXTERIOR SURFACES*` All building walls shall be maintained in a secure and
attractive manner. All defective structural and decorative elements of any building wall shall be
repaired or replaced in a workmanlike manner to match as closely as possible the original
materials and construction of the building. Exterior surfaces shall be free of mildew; rust; loose
material including peeling paint; and patching, painting or resurfacing shall be accomplished to
match the existing or adjacent surfaces as to material, color, bond and joining. All exterior
surfaces other than decay -resistant wood and other weather durable finishes, shall be protected
from the elements by paint or other protective covering applied and maintained in accord with
manufacturer' s specifications and otherwise treated in a consistent manner. 

SPECIFICALLY, 

During a recent inspection, the above listed condition( s) existed at this property, and must be
addressed in accordance with property maintenance ordinances. To avoid further action
and/ or fines, please address any visible mildew and/ or dirt, peeling or failing paint and/ or
damaged exterior surfaces by the compliance date, an• a pr• • - • a regular

basis. Thank you. 

A violation exists and a request for hearing is b

SWORN AND SUBSCRIBED before me by - ans of '' physical presence or online

notarization on this 7th day of July, 2023, by Gregory Dixon. 
STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF PINELLAS

PERSONALLY KNOWN TO ME

PRsUCED, AAS IDENTIFICATION

Notary Signature) 

V-1C11\ ? I

Type of Identification

Name of Notary ( typed, printed, stamped) 

FILED THIS _ DAY

OFla[
MAil 20

vd_Vialabon



MCEBCASE NO. DIA.3

Secretary, Municlpaf' Code forcement Board

AfedaNu,Vidaticq. 



CITY OF CLEARWATER
PLANNING c Dt1-t:LAW= si .-r' D1; f:MM11 1

I1() s- r Ut'i' ic. t:. Bax 4748, 6t-,umxrbx,' FL 61UTA33752 4748
t A1. SavicE YE 11_'.: 1` t: 100 S6Uni MYRTLE AVENUE. C: i: 1; A1tWn' Il; et. FLiltut) a: i;i756

TF.1.. E' P11r3N1 ( 7`27) 5624720 FAN: ( 72' 6 5624735 .. 

Notice of Violation

DIXON, JOSEPHINE EST
207 PENNSYLVANIA AVE
CLEARWATER, FL 337554438

CDC2023- 00744

ADDRESSOR LOCATION OF VIOLATION:. 207 PENNSYLVANIA AVE

LEGAL DESCRIPTION: PLAZA PARK. BLK. B, N 1120F LOTS 1. 5 AND 16
DATE OF INSPECTION: 4/ 19/ 2023 PARCEL: 10- 29- 15- 72000- 002- 0951

Section of City .Code Violated: 

3- 1502. B. - ** EXTERIOR SURFACES** All building walls shall be' maintained• in a secure and
attractive manner. All defective structural and decorative elements of any building wall shall be
repaired or replaced Ina workmanlike mariner to match as closely as possible the original materials
and construction of the building. Exterior surfaces shall be free of rriildew; rust; loose material including
peeling paint; and patching, painting or resurfacing. shall' b'e accomplished to match -the existing or
adjacent surfaces. as to material, color, bond and joining. All exterior s.Urfaces other than decay - 
resistant Wood and other weather durable finishes.. shall be protected from the elements by paint or
other protective covering applied and maintained in accord with manufacturer' s specifications. and
otherwise. treated . in a: consistent Manner. 

Specifically: During -a: recent inspection, the above listed cotidition( s) existed atthis property,. and must
be addressed in accordancewith property maintenance ordinances. To avoid further.action and/ or fines,. 
please .address any visible mildew and/ or dirt. pe.eling or failing paint and/or damaged exterior surfaces
by the compliance date, and' rriaintain' the property on a. regufar basis. Thank you. 

THIS VIOLATION CITED ABOVE MUST' BE CORRECTED PRIOR TO 5/21/ 2023. FAILU.RE TO
CORRECT THE ABOVE .LISTED VIOLATION BY THE DATE INDICATED, .OR RECURRENCE OF THE
VIOLATION AFTER. CORRECTION, WILL RESULT IN A LEGAL ACTION BY THE CODE
ENFORCEMENT BOARD OF THE CITY. OF CLEARWATER OR B.YTHE PINELLA& COUNTY COURT. 
SUCH ACTION MAY RESULT IN A FINE. THE ALLEGED VIOLATOR. MAY BE LIABLE FOR THE
REASONABLE COSTS OF THE INVESTIGATION, PROSECUTION AND THE ADMINISTRATIVE
HEARING .SHOULD THIS PERSON BE FOUND GUILTY OF THE VIOLATION. 

Date Printed: 4/ 2412023

Inspector: Gregory Dixon
inspector Phone: 727- 562-4785

lQ. AI, bJYUf.'ralkr i": kq) ai' i r2.1arl b:_ 17o. E 11' 1Cilliit` 

NOV_ PropOwn



7/ 7! 23,' 1: 13 PM
Clearwater, PLcommunity Development Code

Section 3- 1592,..- Property maintenance requirements. 

A. Minimum building and fire code requirements. All buildings shall be maintained in accordance

with the Florida Building Code, the Florida Fire Prevention Code, and the International Property
Maintenance Code, 

B. Exterior surfaces. All buil.diing walls shall be maintained in a secure and attractive manner. All

defective structural and decorative elements of any building wall shall be repaired or replaced in
a workmanlike manner to match as closely as possible the original materials and construction of

the building. All exterior surfaces shall be free of: 

1. Mildew; 

2, Rust; 

3. Loose material, including peeling paint; and

4. Patching, painting or resurfacing' shall be accorriplished to. match the existing or adjacent
surfaces. as to materials, color, bond.and joining. 

All cornices, trim' and window frames that are damaged, sagging or otherwise deteriorated shall be

repaired or replaced to be made structurally sound, All exterior surfaces other than decay- resistant Wood
and other weather durable. finishes, shall be protected fromnthe elements by paint or other protective
covering applied :and maintained according to manufacturer' s specificationsand otherwise treated in a
consistent manner. 

C. Doti -rand window openings. 

1. All windows and .doors shall be secured in a tight fittingand weatherproofmanner and have

sashes_of proper size and design. ' 

2. Sashes with rotten wood, broken joints or deteriorated mullions or muntins must be repaired
or replaced. 

3. Windows shall be maintained in an unbroken, and clean state. No windows shall be

permanently removed and enclosed, covered or boarded up unless treated as an integral part

of the building facade using wall materials and window detailing comparable with :any.upper
floors and the building facade in general. All damaged or broken windows shall be promptly
restored, repaired or replaced. All awnings, screens or canopies facing orvisible from the

public right-of-way or any otherparcel shall be maintained in a good and attractive condition

and torn,. loose andlor bleached awnings, screens or canopies shall be promptly replaced, 
repaired or removed. 

4. Doors and windows not facing the public right -of -Way and upper level window and door

openings fronting a public. right-ofway shall be similarly maintained and repaired as the

doors and windows facing the public right-of-way, exceptthat such doors and Windows may

about: blank 119



7/ 7123, 113 PM Clearwater, FL Community Development Cade

be enclosed or removed provided the sills, lintels. and frames are removed 'and the opening properly closed
to match and be compatible with the design,. material and finish of the adjoining wall of whichthe opening
is a part. 

D. Roofs. 

1. All roofs shall be maintained in a safe, secure and watertight condition. 

2. Any new me.chanical equipment,. including replacement equipment placed on a roof, shall be

so located as to be screened from view from the public right -cif -way at street level from
adjoining properties.. 

3. Roofs shall bemaintained in a clean, mildew -free condition and kept free of trash, loose

shingles and debris or any other element, including grass or weeds, which' is not a permanent

part of the building.or a functional element of its mechanical orelectrical system. 

4. Tile roofs with peeling.paint shall be repainted..or have the paint removed. 

5.. Any false roof, mansard or similar roof element or other.auxilia.ry structure on the roof shall
be finished and maintained in .a condition comparable to and compatible with the exterior

side of th.e building wall to .which the roof element abuts. 

E. Auxiliary and _appurtenant structures

1. . Chimneys and elevator shafts, and mechanical and .electrical structures shall be maintained in

a satisfactory state of repair and their exterior finish must be architecturally consistent with

the .exterior side of the building wall from which they can be seen. 

2. Freestanding walls and fences shall be maintained in accordance with the provisions of

section 3- 868 of this development code. 

3. Fountains and other amenities shall be maintained. in good working.order and all structural

components. shall. be maintained in a satisfactory state of repair, free of chipping, pitting, 

cracking, discoloration, peeling or fading. 

F. Exterior storage and display/ nonresidential properties. 

1. All equipment, materials and merchandise shall be stored and located :at all times within an

enclosed structure and no exterior storage of merchandise for -sale shall be permitted unless

expressly authorized pursuant to the provisions of this Development Code. 

2. Garbage .and trash shall be deposited only in d.umpsters or cans or other receptacles

specifically manufactured and intended for such purpose; and secured at all times with a tight

fitting cover or lid. 

G. Exterior storageand display for residential properties. 

1. As provided in Section 3- 913 of this Development. Code,. outdoor storage isprohibited. For the

purposes of this section, carports are subject to the outdoor storage provisions. 

2. 

about: blank 219



7( 7123,' 1: 13 PM
Clearwater, FL Community Development Code

Equipment, materials orfurnishings. not designed for use outdoors, such as automobile parts and tires, 
building materials, and interior furniture, may not be stored outdoors. 

3. Construction materials, unless such materials. are related to an active building permit related
to the property on which the materials are located, sha.Il not be stored..outdoors on a
residentially zoned property. 

4.. Bulk items intended for pick up by the city may not.be placed at the curb more than 24 hours
prior to the :scheduled. pick up. 

5.. Any motor vehicle that Is lawfullyparked and is covered in a manner to protect the motor

vehicle shall allow at least the bottom six inches of each tire to. be visible. The required license

plate shall be clearly visible from the right-of-way or the license plate number shall be printed

legibly on the cover with characters not less than two: inches in height so that it is clearly
visible from the right-of-way, Coversshall not be faded and shall be in good .condition, 
without tears, rips or holes. 

H. Yards and landscape areas

1, All required landscaping materials shall be maintained in accordance with the provisions of
Article 3. Division 12. 

2. Any portion of a.lot not covered by. a building or structure..or otherwise devoted to parking, a
service drive or a walkway shall be landscaped with grass or other appropriateground cover

and shall be maintained in a neat and orderly manner. 

3. All landscape materials, including turf; shrubs, and trees, whether required or optional, shall

be maintained in a. healthy -live condition so as to present a neat and attractive appearance

and soas to discourage the accumulation of trash or debris and/ or infestation by pests.. 
4. No yard, landscape area or growth of landscape material shall encroach upon the public

right-of-way so as to hinder safe and convenient vehicular or pedestrian movement in the

public right- of-way. 

5. No yard shall. be used for dumping or accumulation. of any garbage, rubbish, dead animals, 
trash, waste: vegetable. or animal matter of any kind or construction debris. 

I. Signs. All signs shall be maintained in good condition in the form in which the signs were

originally approved, free of mildew, rust, loose material, including peeling or fadingpaint or
materials. Any loose, broken, peeling or faded parts ofthe sign shall be promptly repaired, 
painted or replaced. 

J. Vacant parcels. 

1. Vacant parcels of land shall be properly maintained consistent with section 3- 1502 H and be
free of weeds, litter, rubble or debris. 

2, 

about:blank
3t9



717123,' 1.: 13 PM . Clea water, FL CornmunityDevelopmentCode

Erosion and sedimentation mitigation measures may be required if it is determined that runoff from a

vacant parcel causes harm to adjacent property, city drainage systems or navigable waters which receive
the runoff. 

3. No temporary or permanent storage of materials or equipment shall be allowed on any
vacant parcel except in compliance' with the regulations for the use ofsuch property asset
forth under Article 2 and Articie•3 Division 9 of this Development Code. 

K. Public rights -of --way and sidewalks and parking surfaces. 

1. Public rights- of-way and sidewalks adjoining an improved parcel of Land which, because of its

location and character, is used as if it were appurtenant to or an. extension ofthe parcel of

land, shall. be maintained in a safe and clean condition by the owner of the parcel of land. The
owner shall, at a minimum, keepsuch rights- of-way and sidewalks clear oflitter, trash, debris, 

equipment, weeds, trees, shrubs and other vegetation and refuse and provide a height

Clea ranee of at least eight feet from the sidewalk pavement measured vertically from the

pavement surface, unless an exception has been granted by the urbanforester for protected

trees, All unpaved areas. shall be landscaped with grass or other ground cover and such areas

shall be regularly mowed or otherwise Maintained in -a neat and attractive condition. 

2. No person shall erect, plate:or locate any structure, -display materials, merchandise, or similar

objects within the limits. of any street right- of-way unless specifically permitted pursuant to
the- provisions of this Development Code. 

3. No trashreceptacles, newspaper racks or other dispensing machines shall be located in a

public right-of-way unless specifically authorized by the city -and other applicable agencies, 

4. Parking lot and drivewaysurfaces shall be maintained in a. safe and clean condition by the

owner of the parcel of land: The owner shall, ata minimum, keep such surface free of pot

holes, litter, trash, debris, equipment, weeds, dead vegetation and refuse and shall promptly
repair cracked or heaved parking lot surfaces. 

S. All sidewalks located on private property shall be maintained in a safe and clean condition by

the owner of the parcel of land. The .owner shall, ata minimum, keep sidewalks clear of litter, 

trash, debris, equipment, weeds, dead vegetation and refuse. Sidewalks that are cracked, 

heaved or otherwise unsafe for pedestrians shall be promptly replaced. 
L. Maintenance ofSeawalls. All seawalls shall be maintained in structurally sound condition and

shall comply with applicable building, and coastal construction codes. 

M. Adoption ofthe International Property Maintenance Code, 2018 edition. There shall be enforced

in the city, by the building official, the " International Property Maintenance Code," 2018 Edition, a

copy of which iskept With the office of the. city clerk, which is incorporated into the Code..end

adopted by reference with the following local amendments: 

about: blank 4/ 9



7/ 7/ 23, 1; 13 PM Clearwater, FL Community Development Code

General amendments. The International Property Maintenance Code, 2.0.18 addition is amended in that

a, Wherever the terms " International Building Code," " International Energy Conservation
Code," " International Existing Building Code," " International Fire Code," " International Fuel

Gas Code," International Mechanical Code." " International . Plumbing Code," " International

Residential. Code," or " international Zoning Code" are found, the term." Florida Building
Code" shall be substituted. 

b. Whenever the term " code official" is found it shall be replaced with the term " building
official. 

2. Section 101. 1 " Title" is amended to read as follows: These regulations shall be known as the

Cityo.f Clearwater Property Maintenance Code, hereinafter referred to -as " this code." 

3. Section 102. 1 " General" is amended to read as follows: Where there is a conflict between a

general requirement and a specific requirement, the specific requirement shall govern. 

Where differences occur between provisions of this code and the Clearwater Code of

Ordinances or the Clearwater Community Development Code and any ordinance of the City

which is not specifically set forth therein, the most. restrictiveshall apply, Where differences
occur between provisions. of this code and a referenced code other than the Clearwater Code

of Ordinances or the Clearwater Community Development Code:and any ordinance of the City

which is not specifically set forth therein, the provisions . of this .code shall apply. Where,. in a

specific case, different sections ofthis code specify different requirements, the most

restrictive shall apply. 

4. Section 102. 3 " Application of other codes" is amended to read as follows: Repairs, additions; 

or alterations to.a structure or changes of occupancy shall be done in accordance with the

provisions of the Florida Building Code, Florida Fuel Ga.s Code, Florida -Mechanical Code,. and

the National Fire Protection Act 70. Any conflict between this code and Chapter 553, Florida

Statutes, as may be amended, the Florida Building Code, and the Florida Fire Prevention -Code

shall be -resolved in favor of Chapter 553, Florida Statutes, the Florida Building Code, or the
Florida Fire Prevention Code and nothing herein shall be deemed to be an amendment to

those provisions of Florida law. 

5. Section 1. 03. 1 " General" is amended to read as follows: The provisions of this code shall be

administered by the building official or such other person or persons designated by the

building official orthe community development coordinator. 

6. Section 103.2 ` Appointment"is deleted in its entirety. 

7. Section 103. 4 " Liability" is amended so that the term " board of appeals" is replaced with the

terms " the municipal code enforcementboard" and " the building/ flood board of adjustment
and appeals." 

8, Section 103.5 " Fees" is deleted in its entirety. 

about: blank 5/9



7/ 7123, 1: 13 PM

about: blank

Clearwater, FL Community. Development Code

9. Section 104: 3 " Right. of entry" is deleted in its entirety. 
10. Section 106.3 " Prosecution ofviolation" is amended to. read as follows: The building official

may, in addition to or in alternative of, any crirninal or civil penalties or seeking injunctive
relief, bring violations of this code for prosecution before the municipal code enforcement
board or the building/ flood board of adjustment and appeals. In any case in which either
board finds that a violation has occurred, the board may order corrective action to be taken. 
bya date certain, which corrective action -may include the repair, irnprovement,: vacation, or

demolition of the building or structure. Both boards may also enter an order declaring that
the city has the right to enter the property and have such work done on behalf of the owner

at the owner's cost, including administrative costs, which shall. become a lien against the

property.as..provided in Section 7- 103( G) of the Clearwater Community Development Code. 
11. Section 107. 1. " Notice to. person responsible" is amended to read as follows; Whenever the

building official determines that there. has been a violation of this code or has.grounds to

believe that a violation has occurred, notice shall be given in the manner prescribed i. n

Sections 107. 2 and 107. 3 to the property owner for the violation as specified in this code: 

Notices for condemnation procedures shall comply with Section 108.3: 
12. Section 107:2 " Form" is amended to read as follows: Such notice prescribed in Section 10771

shall be in accordance with Section 7- 102( B) of the Clearwater Community Development. 
Code. 

13. Section 107: 3 " Method ofService" is amended to read as. follows:: Such notice prescribed in

Section 107.3 shall be served upon the alleged violator as provided in Section 162. 12, Florida

Statutes ( 2018), and all subsequent amendments. 

14. Section 107.6 " Transfer ofownership" is deleted in its entirety. 
15. Section 108. 2 " Closing ofvacant structures" is deleted in its entirety. 
16. Section 108.3 " Notice" is amended to read as follows: Whenever the building official has

condemned a structure or equipment under the provisions of this section, notice shall be

given to the person respon.sibie.in a form substantially similar to that found in Section 7- 

102( B) of the Clearwater Community. Developme. nt Code and served upon the property owner
as provided in Section 162.12, Florida Statutes, and all subsequ.entamendnients. 

17. . Section 109 ' Ernergency Measures" is deleted in its entirety except for Section 109. 2

Temporary. Safeguards" Which is amended to read as follows: Notwithstanding other

provisions of this code, whenever in the opinion. ofthe building official -there is imminent

danger due to an unsafe condition, the building official shall order the necessary work to be
done, including the boarding of openings, to rendersuch building.or structuretemporarily
safe whether or not the legal procedure herein described has been instituted and shall cause

such other action to be taken as the building official deems necessary to meet such

6/9. 



7/ 7123, 1; 13 PM
Clearwater; FL Community Development Code

emergency. Any costs associated with this, including administrative costs, which shall become a lien against
theproperty as provided in Section 7- 103( G) of the Clearwater Cornmu.nity Develop.m.ent.Code. 

18. Section 110.3 " Failure to Comply" is amended to read as follows: If the .owner of.a premises or
the owner' s authorized agent fails to comply with a demolition order or an unsafe notice. 
given pursuantto Section 108. 3 within the time prescribed, the building official in addition to
or in alternative of any criminal or civil penalties or seeking injunctive relief; may request a
hearing before the municipal code enforcement board or thebuilding/flood board of
adjustment and appeals. In any case in which either board finds that a building or structure is

dangerous, unsafe, insanitary, or otherwise unfit for human habitation or occupancy, the
board may order corrective action to be taken by a date certain, which corrective action may
include the repair, improvement, vacation, .or demolition of the building or structure. Both

boards may also enter an order declaring that the.city has the .right to enter the property and
have such work done on behalf of the owner at the owners cost, including. administrative
costs, which.shall become.a lien against the property as provided in. Section 7- 103( G) of the

Clearwater Community Development Code. Both boards may.also issue fines as provided in
Section 7- 103( 8) of the Clearwater Community Development Board. 

19. Section 111 " Means ofAppeal" is deleted in its entirety except for Section 111. 1 " Application
forAppeal'`which is amended to read as follows: Any person directly affected by a decision of
the building official shall have the right to appeal that decision to the building/flood board of
adjustment and appeals as provided in section 47.035 of the Clearwater Community
Development Code, 

20. Section 112, 2 " Issuance" is amended to read as follows.: A.stop work order shall be in writing
and shall be.given to the property owner. Upon issuance of a stop work order, the cited work
shall immediately cease.. The stop work order shall state the reason. for the ord.er and the. 

conditions under which the cited work is authorized to resume. 

21. Section 112. 4 " Failure to comply" is amended to read as follows: any personal who shall
continue any work after having. been served with a stop work order, except such .work .as that

person is directed to perform to remove a violation .or unsafe conditions, shall beprosecuted

in any manner authorized by the Clearwater Code of Ordinances or the Clearwater

Community Development: Code. 

22. Section 302 " Exterior Property Areas" is deleted in its entirety. 
23: Section 303. 2 " Enclosures" is deleted in its entirety. 

24: Section 304. 2 " Protective Treatment" is deleted in its entirety. 

25. Section 304. 3 " Premises identificationis deleted in its entirety. 

26. 

aboutblank 7/ 9



7/ 7/ 23.. 1: 13 FM
Clearwater, FL Community Development Code

Section 304. 14 " Insectscreens" is. amended .to read as follows: Every window in a: residential structure that

is capable of being opened and every door, window, and other outside opening. required for ventilation of
habitable rooms, food preparation areas, food :service areas, or any areas where products to be included .or
utilized in food for human consumption are processed, manufactured, packaged, or stored shall be
supplied with approved tightly fitting screens of not less than 16 mesh per inch ( 16 mesh per 25. -mm), and

every screen door used for insect control shall have a self-closing device in good working condition. Screens
shall not, however, be required where other approved means, such as. air curtains or insect repellent fans, 
are employed. 

27. Section 304. 18. 1 " Doors" is amended to read as follows: Doors providing access to a dwelling
unit, rooming unit, or housekeeping unit that is rented, leased, or let shall be equipped with a

lock designed to be readily operable from the side from which egress is to be made. without

the need for keys, special knowledge, or effort. Such locks shall be installed according to the
manufacturer' s specifications and maintained in good working order. For the purpose of this

section, a: sliding bolt. shall not be considered an acceptable -lock. 

28: Section. 308 " Rubbish and Garbage" is deleted in its entirety. 
29. Section 602. 2 " Residential Occupancies" is amended to read. as' follows: Dwellings shall be

provided with heatingfacilities capable of maintaining a room temperature of 68° F ( 20° C) in

all habitable rooms, bathrooms, and toilet rooms. Cooking appliances shall not be used, nor

shall portable unvented•fuel- burning spate heaters be used .as a' means to provide required

heating. If the heating facility is a portable electric space heater, then it must have a tip -over
switch with automatic shut- off capability and overheat protection with automatic shut- off

capability. 

30. Section 602. 3 " Heat Supply" is amended to require the s.upplyofheat year- round and

Exceptions Number 1 and 2 are hereby deleted in their entirety. 

31. Section 602. 4 " Occupiable Work Spaces" is amended to require the supply of heat year- round. 

32.. Section 603 " Mechanical Equipment" is deleted in its entirety. 
3.3; Section . 6Q6 " Elevators, escalators and durrmbwaiters" is deleted in its entirety. 

34. Sectio:n 607 " Duct Systems" is deleted in its entirety. 

35. Chapter. 7 " FireSafety-Requirements" is deleted in its. entirety except for Section 702 " Means • 
ofEgress" and' Section 704. 1 " Inspection, testing and maintenance." Further, Section 7041. 3

Fire protection systems" is amended' to read as follows: The following fire protection' systems

shall be inspected, maintained, and tested in accordance with the Florida Building Code: 1) 
carbon monoxide alarms. and carbon monoxide detection systems; and 2) single- and

multiple -station smoke alarms. 

36. : Chapter 8 " Referenced Standards" is deleted in its entirety. 

37. 

about: blank 8/ 9



7/ 7/ 23; 1: 13 PM Clearwater; FL Community Development Code

Appendix. A101. 1 " Genera!" is amended to .read as follows: Windows and doors shall be boarded in an

approved Manner to prevent entry. by unauthorized persons. 

38. Appendix A102 " Materia/ s," Appendix A103 Installation." and Appendix A104 " Referenced

Standard" are deleted in their entiretyand replaced with the following specifications; 
To secure. structures; materials to be used are as follows: 

Wire mesh 14 inch hardware cloth 19 gauge,. galvanized to resist rust. Edges must be. finished
with no sharp projections. 

Frame 1" x4" pressure treated wood pre -drilled for screws. 

Installation.: Wire will cover window and or door with mitered corners wood frame on the

outside 2 inches of the perimeter of wire and be screwed no more than 12 inches apart in

center of run and at each end of wood, frame, and screwed to solid surface. of metal, wood, 

and or concrete walls. 

Ord, No. 6526- 00, § 1, 6- 15- 00; Ord. No. 6928- 02, §§ 71--- 75, 5-2-02; Ord. No, 7449- 05, § 20, 12- 15-05; Ord. 

No. 8211- 10, § 11, 10- 5- 10; Ord. No. 8931.- 1. 6, -§ 18, 9- 1- 16; Ord. No. 9349.- 20, § 1, 1- 16- 20) 

about: blank 9/ 9



MUNICIPAL CODE. ENFORCEMENT BOARD QF THE CITY OF CLEARWATER, FLORIDA

AFFIDAVIT OF POSTING

City Case Number; CDC2023- 00744

Site of Violation: 207 PENNSYLVANIA AVE

1. Gregory Dixon, being first duty sworn, .deposes and says: 

2, That I am a Code Inspector employed by the City of Clearwater. 

3 That on the 24thday of April, 2023, a copy of the attached Notice of Violation was posted at CityOf CI - a - er • ffices, 60.0-61. veland St.,. 6th Floor, Clearwater,. Florida and at 207
NNSYLVANIA - . , Cleam=ter, Florida. 

RECEIVED

LUI

21TY CLERI( DEPARTMENT

STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF. PINELLAS

SWORN AND' SUBSCRIBED before me by means. of .: physical presence or: online

notarization on this 24th day of April, 2023., by Gregory Dixon. 

12/PERSONALLY KNOWN TO ME

PROs ED A IeENTIFj;CATION

of Identification

f. Notary (typed, printed, stamped) 

oARY4 CYNTHIA WILLIAMS
o,
r • n Notary Public. 

o  d State of Florida
V41 1.. Comte# > iHQI186 s

OE19' 
Expires 6/ 17/ 2024

Affdavit_ Posting



7/ 12122: 1.17 PM
Property Appraiser General Information. 

Etafj.: u. 

lit&j.;s111-1.3,11cir

10- 2945- 72000- 002- 0151
Compost Prop tdy Record Card

Updated July 12, 2022

Ownership/ Aloiling Address Change Mailing Address iT
DIXON, JOSEPI1INE EST

207 PENNSYLVANIA AVI;: 
CLEARWATER P1. i3735- 4438. 

1

m1_01 Print Radius Search FfiNIN/ W1_114

Site Address • 

207 PENNSYLVANIA AVE . 
CLEARWATER

Cortical Tax DistritO.; CLEARWATER. 1. P.1120ortySit, 0: 01 to ( Single Vaittily. 1- 1otne) Total 986 Total Gross SF: 1, 330 Total Living Units: 1

hcce to hide] Legal Description

PLAZA PARK ADD', CLEARWATER impkovEmENT CO•colut PLAT BLK. B. N ii.2 OF LOTS 15 AND 16
J. 1Ilit1I;!.:; Fiftivr rmoption

202: 2- 2023
Exemption

2022 Parcel Use

fu.: 1: km3c: stead' [ 
0 -- .. .. • 

1 -....,.
e...,---... 

Government: NO No 91-lomestead Oso.Percettlage: 9.00?,c, 
ONon- licattestead Use Percentage; 100. 00% • : 
0 -Classified Agricultural: N6 L

f! lastitunonal,. No

0 No

Parcel Information Latest Notice -or Proposed Prapsay Taxes ( TRIM Notice), ! 
i

1 , r
CEIo Evocuation 7one 5----- Flood Zone , 4Most Recent Recording - ] i Sides ' ttiInu_,_•istip . i Census' rritet : i • " ' .• : 141 4o Plat Book/ Page i 11 gii:-.?T! Y!!!! * 1. N. PYM.!.. P.../.4?! Id..,./Afitf) 1 Aar !ti! q. IPD::

7 Y61,...r evl., 171.* xolic). 

i.; 041E51074 9 .. 1S114 i . n es nen, . ii. 103026' 006 N I AC I Current PEM A Mots ; 1 EL.' 
i

202j Final Vajtieloformoboa
bst hout-' t ) illst, N.,:;; wd value / Nori- UX eft . Catutt'y Taxable Valk School Taxable Value

597, 136 S7-7, 468 577, 468 $ 97,136

Mick here to bidet Value I listory as Certified ( yellow indicates correction . on file) 
i. 1111.1110 , Ito 'Market Villw Ai;sokisk4Valorz. Sshool ' limbic ! little

2021) No S104. 238 '$ 104, 238
i 2010 Ni.k• 578, 625

2018
53003

2017

2016
s.

556,5:

780841
2015

7, 333
2014

S7. 072 . 
2013

54.591
7012' 

2011

1 2,010 654 :: 18

35'
3(

1
2009

53, 589' 1 2008
53, 860

200

21)00

70,425

S64, 021
No 558, 203 $ 58, 203

No• S66284 $ 65, 671

No 5930 1 $ 59, 701
Yes S54. 945 512,833
Yes $ 43, 249 S32, 572

Yes 536. 732 S32.091

Yes 538. 592 $ 31, 555

Yes $ 46. 011 S30, 636
Yes 5(>0. 552 530, 183

Yes S97, 52.8 529, 389. 
Yeq S 01. 700 529, 360
Ves 8158, 500 828, 505
Yes 51' 2.2, 100 S27; 810

1005 Yeii 584, 200 527.000
20114 Y6 573. 400 S26, 200. 

21) 0. 1 Yes 548, 500 525. 700

2i1I/ 2. Yes S42. 20o 525, 100

2001 Ye5. S40, 1 00 524, 700. 

20011 Ye & $ 35, 600 $ 24,000
999 Yes $ 32. 500 523.400
99s• Yck: i ,$ 29, 5Q0

1997 Yes 528, 700 522, 800
1. 096 Yes- 526. 300 s22, 200

Loamy Taxable Volog
570, 425

564, 023

58. 203

65, 071

55,9, 701

S7,333

S7. 072

S6, 591

6, 055

S5, 136. 

4. 683. 

3, 889

53, 860

53,005

2, 33 0. 

1, 300

5700. 

5200. 

SO

50. 

50

2021 T11, Information

Tax Distriet: CW • 
12021 Final ivlillage Rate 20. 3216

po not rary on ,;:urrtart tAlSOS : W On shrove too...JO-to a changer in ownership. A
sit:oak:ant r...har1I11: 10 taxable wawa rne11 occur s her a frantic( nue to a last of

iescrnptsms. rsuot of din Save Oaf Homes ur Of; Cap. andior market condlOoris: 
leicsisr use our new Imgxlmator to etaintate. taxes undo now ownership. 

N/ A

N/ A

N/ A

NIA

N/ A

WA

NIA

N/A

50; NIA

St) : N/ A 501

A4inticipal Taxable Value

S77, 468 i

Municipal Ta): able Value

S70, 425

64, 023 1
S58. 203

565, 671

39.701

7, 333

7,072 1

5. 136 I
4, 68s03

SO1

01
SO1

1 500 1
S7001

ss00S011
501

501
01

Ranked Saks See ail transactions

Sale Date Book/ Page Price DIU

1973 041151 0749 El ; S18, 800 Q
i

i 1971 036141 0800 F3 ' SLOP° 0 . 1

4

VII

2021 Land Information

httpsliwer. w. pcpao, org 1/ 3. 



NER: r;CQMPLETE THIS SECTION. 

Complete: itertis: l ;" 40 3' 
Printi;,your c arise and; address: air the reverse .' 
sathattwe. can return-the`ca0;:t6.}coir. 
Attach his; carcl to the back of the rt7allplece, 
nrOri ,:thefront' ifspace. permits. 

73:— cs 2 (i
COMPr., ETE THIS SECTION ON DELIVERY

IRK JOHNSON

5. 0 DARLOW AVE

JAG. ONVILLE, FL 32277

B. ' Received by (Pitted N,• 

11.1111:111.11111.111111.11111111111111: 1111

0 Agei}t
Addressee

0. Date of:Delivery

addressdifferentiroi • item: 7? . Yes
er.delivery address.below: • p .NO

3:: Servi: e .140
EAduSg, i* 

l3 Pdniity F1a4t••• • • 

igtdiRi• 
D' Adak S.1900sReStiotd rvetY ' O. 14671404. Me. s cted

0 Cettltier! Niall Restricted DeFvery D Return Reeetptfcr

L7 Colttitt 0.60.00/.. o Deo , •: Meghandke:.• 
e.. a. v: rnt:. arrmri from.seryke D Collecton. DeUVay. ded Devy O.StgaeaConrinaf ia a

signatureCor}rrtact70192970 330i 6147 3386 t&F3eGted.,, y: Restricted DetNery: 

s;:rorrri: 381'': ; .Jciiy2̀o.1.5 RSN753D-O2 aoa sn53

NDER: CQMPLETETHIS SECTION. 
omplete, items'., : 2, ani

Pant°.year-narne and address: on the reverse
so theatre can return::the caret to you, 

4itacl'i::ttiis_card;to'.the' back'òf th6 rnaiiA ieco
or ari: tie front ifspace. pertltiis;........-._... 

Domestic Return Receipt

7
COMPLETE THiS

Gan/ Johnson isiz

210 S Meteor Ave "'~` "' iy

9 F2eci y Ipif Na* 

Py• 
dress different frorrm herrn 19: D Yes. 
da.livery; address: beli . p Nc

Agent

CrAddresseo

Clearwater, FL 33765 „. f / 

iu1111m11[ miiiimmsimmi11umu

1µt. lis
p:

p. `cif y Mail E.E0resgiN.
4... . r.

ati. 4.... 

t d 67el1 Adrtti
0904 re RestrictedD€lidery w •' ; GJ: R eggisteredMa i Restricted0..

CertMled Msliej' :: ' 4ertdery. .• a'.
CetL' reed Mag_Restricted Delveryy .Return Receipttoi.` 0 :
Collect on Delivery ' :. Meir .: 11. 

se.: `.:.. .:1.1.,..;,,.:. Thi lrrsiriar.. -- ,., 
e..:..:.::- s .::. n - . .. .... n: nw._a..i Delivery Restricted De;ivety .0SIg! tature, Ccnrm ticm' tat;.: :... !?

Signature. Cornomat[ on 70192 9 7 0 0 [] 0' 1: 13147 3 3 6 2 tall
R tricted t ervery .. a Delty y-:': . ave .. .. ... ... . 

SEhNDER:.

COMPLETE THIS SECTION COMPUTE THIS SECTION ON DELIVERY Completeiter

s1, 2, and. 3 '.. Print' 
your Rattle and address on the reverse sti'
tfiat we;can return: the card. to you, • • • Attaoh
this t and t4.4. ie back of #ie mailpiece,. or
ori: thef i cit if ace: ermits. JANIgE

MARTIN 149

AK VILLAGE DR LPiRGO, 

FL 33778 1111.

1 !IIIIJ 11111111111111111 1111111 95.
90:.:8402;.5668'9308 1:14:' 23 Dat$

of k 

ei4v :;' e RestrtCted

D Vis.... o

0cer ton nDvsDet; 

7_ 
Artii•. EgNirmhor'l'I"mnatorsri•+`...a.:;r.;'ra+;: n':-;:<:r.;:::.;:.:;-:::; Ck. Cnlir+etneHry: RaSht.edp 3v oty- 

tab',::'-'-

z.'•;{i3i;:': z:•; :tis!:: 70192970 00. 01 6147 3379 i liestiicted esrijefyi' c' r: 

PS Fotiir38.:': 205 RSFJ: 7530 02rA00 9853':. SENDER: 

COMPLETE THIS SECTION COMPLETE THIS SECTION ON DELIVERY lete

Completeitems is [?[

irlt: yournameand address onthe revers• e• so
that we coir retum; the cardio yotr '; ; ' " 1

Attach this; card,;to'.':tt a back. o1 the'ma9_Ipiece, MARVN

JOHNSON JR x.

807-1` JADRANGLECT FL

33573 IIIJP.

IJ!JIJIIJJ.jJI1II.t.IlIII. iJIuiiiiuiiio .

delivery YE
9590••

9402: 5668 9308 444•: 62''i 2. 

ArtIchh Ntarihar ITrai,efnr'6•r....'..- ._ . . 70119

2970 00071 67147 3130 01TY

ui
ic... 

AdtSignatvroii_` 
ttSignatisre

Reetncted De, ,. Certltied

141a' l.tiesiricted 17eliveiy. . CoitectonD'
allvery•..,:. ,.:. '•i`:i':?':. .. DOgaryFiestricted,

l)eiwry atdreDuro
Ilail

fieaLicted OeFye R ed Deft


