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Potable and Reclaimed Water Meters

ADDENDA CONFIRMATION

No addenda issued

QUESTIONNAIRE

1. Exceptions*

Proposers shall indicate any and all exceptions taken to the provisions or specifications in this solicitation document. Exceptions that
surface elsewhere and that do not also appear under this section shall be considered invalid and void and of no contractual
significance.

Do you have any exceptions to the provisions or specifications?

No

2. Additional Materials*
Have you included any additional materials?

Yes

DESCRIPTION OF ADDITIONAL MATERIALS*
Provide a brief description of the additional materials included.

Any non-listed meters and parts will be 10% off of list

3. Certified Business*
Are you a Certified Small Business or a Certified Minority, Woman or Disadvantaged Business Enterprise?

No
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4. Vendor Certification*
By submitting this response, the Vendor hereby certifies that:

A.

B.

It is under no legal prohibition on contracting with the City of Clearwater.

It has read, understands, and is in compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions stated herein, as well as its
attachments, and any referenced documents.

It has no known, undisclosed conflicts of interest.

The prices offered were independently developed without consultation or collusion with any of the other vendors or potential
vendors or any other anti-competitive practices.

No offer of gifts, payments or other consideration were made to any City employee, officer, elected official, or consultant who
has or may have had a role in the procurement process for the commodities or services covered by this contract. The Vendor
has not influenced or attempted to influence any City employee, officer, elected official, or consultant in connection with the
award of this contract.

It understands the City may copy all parts of this response, including without limitation any documents or materials copyrighted
by the Vendor, for internal use in evaluating respondent’s offer, or in response to a public records request under Florida’s public
records law (F.S. Chapter 119) or other applicable law, subpoena, or other judicial process; provided that the City agrees not to
change or delete any copyright or proprietary notices.

It hereby warrants to the City that the Vendor and its subcontractors will comply with, and are contractually obligated to comply
with, all federal, state, and local laws, rules, regulations, and executive orders.

It certifies that Vendor is not presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, voluntarily excluded,
or disqualified from participation in this matter from any federal, state, or local agency.

It will provide the commodities or services specified in compliance with all federal, state, and local laws, rules, regulations, and
executive orders if awarded by the City.

It is current in all obligations due to the City.

It will accept all terms and conditions as set forth in this solicitation if awarded by the City.
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L. The signatory is an officer or duly authorized representative of the Vendor with full power and authority to submit binding offers

and enter into contracts for the commodities or services as specified herein.

Confirmed

5. E-Verify System Certification*
PER FLORIDA STATUTE 448.095, CONTRACTORS AND SUBCONTRACTORS MUST REGISTER WITH AND USE THE E-VERIFY SYSTEM TO
VERIFY THE WORK AUTHORIZATION STATUS OF ALL NEWLY HIRED EMPLOYEES.

The affiant, by virtue of confirming below, certifies that:

A.
B.

H.

The Contractor and its Subcontractors are aware of the requirements of Florida Statute 448.095.

The Contractor and its Subcontractors are registered with and using the E-Verify system to verify the work authorization status
of newly hired employees.

The Contractor will not enter into a contract with any Subcontractor unless each party to the contract registers with and uses
the E-Verify system.

The Subcontractor will provide the Contractor with an affidavit stating that the Subcontractor does not employ, contract with,
or subcontract with unauthorized alien.

The Contractor must maintain a copy of such affidavit.

The City may terminate this Contract on the good faith belief that the Contractor or its Subcontractors knowingly violated Florida
Statutes 448.09(1) or 448.095(2)(c).

If this Contract is terminated pursuant to Florida Statute 448.095(2)(c), the Contractor may not be awarded a public contract for
at least 1 year after the date on which this Contract was terminated.

The Contractor is liable for any additional cost incurred by the City as a result of the termination of this Contract.

Confirmed
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6. NSF International certification letter*
IAPMO_R&T Product_Listing_Directory_nsf _listing.pdf

7. References*

Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.
e REFERENCES.pdf

REFERENCES_filled_in.pdf

8. Scrutinized Company Certification*
Please download the below documents, complete, notarize, and upload.

e SCRUTINIZED COMPANIES AND B...

clearwater_scrutinzied_company_endorsed.pdf

9. Compliance with Anti-Human Trafficking Laws*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

e Compliance with 787.06 form...

anti_human_trafficing_clearwater_endorsed.pdf

10. W-9*
Upload your current W-9 form. (available at https://www.irs.gov/pub/irs-pdf/fw9.pdf)

CPS_W9 2025 signed.pdf

PRICE TABLES

[CONSOLIDATED PIPE & SUPPLY] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
Invitation To Bid - Potable and Reclaimed Water Meters
Page 5


https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/118514/e1c890c0-5d5c-470a-85f3-c4c806b0aa36_REFERENCES.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4O47Q5HBA%2F20260217%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20260217T152123Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEIf%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJIMEYCIQC2QzYRUXbvv9nezRY7Do7MDoXlY5oI7eyHxpnFIjyS7gIhAJ2DRsteSg%2Ffh3s%2FDDXTcjT9sYNv9NurapQXLkkcCIq%2BKoUFCE8QAhoMODkyMzY0Njg3NjcyIgwT3rLrs2MVg%2FJW5Rkq4gQRPPtaoIRBSo07vpDiYCHNPXcN9XwGWrPfC7uVqx8VXak%2FVpU3DVY2BJJW2MxOdabR%2FtbdZaDw6qgBO4FePT7xEiQqFYUxiwoCQ991TYOPx1A1MTeAmOhgFY2eF34%2FPANYnJV0%2BY0dJIv63mnCxhNUrJU1WR6jpk%2B2o%2BvgJXykyhkI8zLFJYvjj%2Fp7JQ04NDCOx9d%2BADD65Ml9U3hdvIkuWsSsESeA3LsAL1HeyeBfAuvJqq%2F4Frv1PoopfgDGFi1bBzN05F%2FLkv4yEuvf89kv9o729IvdbgEEukINSap9v58M8ECUF%2F5k9RAKA%2FjLUYplNGCBc0b0qvwmS2TQinth3EWTXgfR8MksPrTXrpw%2B7Ss5rCN1wujDm2MJhZb9UD4zo1Hfn8Pkw5EGHtRpccSiPKmqgjAIJrRgrMHElJKmaf9e2a1Tk8iTxPwqw68lbAn85p2ey999q3mJmRnlAf6nwyF10PoRH8HTlQJKQy6Ts%2BgbZbdd41FEgKX8kcIUS9avAUgT6OwUSPprda1P7FNwM7Zv4Wgkwjs9pLXNfqsyQmDtW5TzdHQWBljRZQFaovMbNE5qrmfPcRQYdTUyYaDVwv1Sh9xYnRhTrNBTI7uIYeXiMQx%2FoapRP4iZsgaDSjkFWJU6uVuBYtmSW9kjSTPDsrYG7ZQbkt%2FCKpjKjvjRJPu5L0qiaCZfsPrhVT%2FttaTsh3p8Q9hiB5vQZw5UzaIvQ5i9lX%2BDkIOlAu3%2BM2H%2FggwJxjG6uq6e4KfvHXRHGv25avbYFmDOYrqoEvtqNukp8He0ZDzSZ%2BjE4Mrk8%2FI2v8H1MJ%2Fx0cwGOpgBlrj02JevUQ2fSX%2FNgUdw%2B5ruIj9iJNDZ7KZXYor19tzefU6YBRk7JhMa2M1Ow8%2F2uptKSctKMZYoPV7zfiv9%2FfGk%2FkVMFNREjXfRTIkOhymmpB9g9HayxhSM0AlMntdShLlsrrwBflRVJS%2FsfdkWLJnYBCE6bPrQhquliXz3PO8%2FiRB4LoQ15YNALsc9kYD2dkVHq3GvFxA%3D&X-Amz-Signature=39b3c12e395eb505c3f67afa965d2fd96466bc880f62a31ccf502752fab24c12&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22REFERENCES.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/106620/d78d78ab-def1-4d4e-8af0-8c51835525ce_SCRUTINIZED_COMPANIES_AND_BUSINESS_OPERATIONS_CERTIFICATION.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4O47Q5HBA%2F20260217%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20260217T152123Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEIf%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJIMEYCIQC2QzYRUXbvv9nezRY7Do7MDoXlY5oI7eyHxpnFIjyS7gIhAJ2DRsteSg%2Ffh3s%2FDDXTcjT9sYNv9NurapQXLkkcCIq%2BKoUFCE8QAhoMODkyMzY0Njg3NjcyIgwT3rLrs2MVg%2FJW5Rkq4gQRPPtaoIRBSo07vpDiYCHNPXcN9XwGWrPfC7uVqx8VXak%2FVpU3DVY2BJJW2MxOdabR%2FtbdZaDw6qgBO4FePT7xEiQqFYUxiwoCQ991TYOPx1A1MTeAmOhgFY2eF34%2FPANYnJV0%2BY0dJIv63mnCxhNUrJU1WR6jpk%2B2o%2BvgJXykyhkI8zLFJYvjj%2Fp7JQ04NDCOx9d%2BADD65Ml9U3hdvIkuWsSsESeA3LsAL1HeyeBfAuvJqq%2F4Frv1PoopfgDGFi1bBzN05F%2FLkv4yEuvf89kv9o729IvdbgEEukINSap9v58M8ECUF%2F5k9RAKA%2FjLUYplNGCBc0b0qvwmS2TQinth3EWTXgfR8MksPrTXrpw%2B7Ss5rCN1wujDm2MJhZb9UD4zo1Hfn8Pkw5EGHtRpccSiPKmqgjAIJrRgrMHElJKmaf9e2a1Tk8iTxPwqw68lbAn85p2ey999q3mJmRnlAf6nwyF10PoRH8HTlQJKQy6Ts%2BgbZbdd41FEgKX8kcIUS9avAUgT6OwUSPprda1P7FNwM7Zv4Wgkwjs9pLXNfqsyQmDtW5TzdHQWBljRZQFaovMbNE5qrmfPcRQYdTUyYaDVwv1Sh9xYnRhTrNBTI7uIYeXiMQx%2FoapRP4iZsgaDSjkFWJU6uVuBYtmSW9kjSTPDsrYG7ZQbkt%2FCKpjKjvjRJPu5L0qiaCZfsPrhVT%2FttaTsh3p8Q9hiB5vQZw5UzaIvQ5i9lX%2BDkIOlAu3%2BM2H%2FggwJxjG6uq6e4KfvHXRHGv25avbYFmDOYrqoEvtqNukp8He0ZDzSZ%2BjE4Mrk8%2FI2v8H1MJ%2Fx0cwGOpgBlrj02JevUQ2fSX%2FNgUdw%2B5ruIj9iJNDZ7KZXYor19tzefU6YBRk7JhMa2M1Ow8%2F2uptKSctKMZYoPV7zfiv9%2FfGk%2FkVMFNREjXfRTIkOhymmpB9g9HayxhSM0AlMntdShLlsrrwBflRVJS%2FsfdkWLJnYBCE6bPrQhquliXz3PO8%2FiRB4LoQ15YNALsc9kYD2dkVHq3GvFxA%3D&X-Amz-Signature=b9328d22e736c31bec7534f7c4c263d84abe46688061ffcbd766dad69e0858cb&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22SCRUTINIZED_COMPANIES_AND_BUSINESS_OPERATIONS_CERTIFICATION.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/118514/954cc164-f3c1-4e40-bda0-893632de7f84_Compliance_with_787.06_form_.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4O47Q5HBA%2F20260217%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20260217T152123Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEIf%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJIMEYCIQC2QzYRUXbvv9nezRY7Do7MDoXlY5oI7eyHxpnFIjyS7gIhAJ2DRsteSg%2Ffh3s%2FDDXTcjT9sYNv9NurapQXLkkcCIq%2BKoUFCE8QAhoMODkyMzY0Njg3NjcyIgwT3rLrs2MVg%2FJW5Rkq4gQRPPtaoIRBSo07vpDiYCHNPXcN9XwGWrPfC7uVqx8VXak%2FVpU3DVY2BJJW2MxOdabR%2FtbdZaDw6qgBO4FePT7xEiQqFYUxiwoCQ991TYOPx1A1MTeAmOhgFY2eF34%2FPANYnJV0%2BY0dJIv63mnCxhNUrJU1WR6jpk%2B2o%2BvgJXykyhkI8zLFJYvjj%2Fp7JQ04NDCOx9d%2BADD65Ml9U3hdvIkuWsSsESeA3LsAL1HeyeBfAuvJqq%2F4Frv1PoopfgDGFi1bBzN05F%2FLkv4yEuvf89kv9o729IvdbgEEukINSap9v58M8ECUF%2F5k9RAKA%2FjLUYplNGCBc0b0qvwmS2TQinth3EWTXgfR8MksPrTXrpw%2B7Ss5rCN1wujDm2MJhZb9UD4zo1Hfn8Pkw5EGHtRpccSiPKmqgjAIJrRgrMHElJKmaf9e2a1Tk8iTxPwqw68lbAn85p2ey999q3mJmRnlAf6nwyF10PoRH8HTlQJKQy6Ts%2BgbZbdd41FEgKX8kcIUS9avAUgT6OwUSPprda1P7FNwM7Zv4Wgkwjs9pLXNfqsyQmDtW5TzdHQWBljRZQFaovMbNE5qrmfPcRQYdTUyYaDVwv1Sh9xYnRhTrNBTI7uIYeXiMQx%2FoapRP4iZsgaDSjkFWJU6uVuBYtmSW9kjSTPDsrYG7ZQbkt%2FCKpjKjvjRJPu5L0qiaCZfsPrhVT%2FttaTsh3p8Q9hiB5vQZw5UzaIvQ5i9lX%2BDkIOlAu3%2BM2H%2FggwJxjG6uq6e4KfvHXRHGv25avbYFmDOYrqoEvtqNukp8He0ZDzSZ%2BjE4Mrk8%2FI2v8H1MJ%2Fx0cwGOpgBlrj02JevUQ2fSX%2FNgUdw%2B5ruIj9iJNDZ7KZXYor19tzefU6YBRk7JhMa2M1Ow8%2F2uptKSctKMZYoPV7zfiv9%2FfGk%2FkVMFNREjXfRTIkOhymmpB9g9HayxhSM0AlMntdShLlsrrwBflRVJS%2FsfdkWLJnYBCE6bPrQhquliXz3PO8%2FiRB4LoQ15YNALsc9kYD2dkVHq3GvFxA%3D&X-Amz-Signature=0187c90b548304e273f60a443e658f0879f448e1e24eeb6c629136367ef9f571&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Compliance_with_787.06_form_.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://www.irs.gov/pub/irs-pdf/fw9.pdf
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Line Descri Quanti Unit of| Unit | Total | No Bid

Item ption ty Measu Cost
re

1 5/8"x Each |No Bid | No Bid X
3/4"D
ouble
Check
Backfl
ow
Meter
laying
length
(71,2
inches
)
Potabl
e
Water

2 5/8"x | 2,000 | Each |$69.23/5138,4
3/4", 60.00
Water
Meter,
Positiv
e

Displa
cemen
t,

Magne
tically
driven,
Potabl
e

Water
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Descri Quanti Unit of| Unit | Total | No Bid

ption ty Measu Cost
re

3 1", 200 Each [$211.1|542,23
Water 5 0.00
Meter,
Positiv
e
Displa
cemen
t,
Magne
tically
driven,
Potabl
e
Water

4 11/2",| 50 Each [$422.6|521,13
Water 9 4.50
Meter,
Positiv
e

Displa
cemen
t,

Magne
tically
driven,
Potabl
e

Water
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Descri Quanti Unit of| Unit | Total | No Bid

ption ty Measu Cost
re

5 2", 50 Each [$520.1(526,00
Water 9 9.50
Meter,
Positiv
e
Displa
cemen
t,
Magne
tically
driven,
Potabl
e
Water

6 1", 200 Each [$100.1|520,03
Water 5 0.00
Meter,
Positiv
e
Displa
cemen
t,
Magne
tically
driven,
Reclai
med
Water
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Line Descri Quanti Unit of| Unit | Total | No Bid

Item ption ty Measu Cost
re

7 2", 20 Each [$396.5|57,931
Water 8 .60
Meter,
Positiv
e
Displa
cemen
t,
Magne
tically
driven,
Reclai
med
Water

TOTAL $255,7
95.60
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IAPMO R&T Product Listing Directory https://plm.iapmo.org/pld#/certificate/6194/2970

IAPMO RESEARCH AND TESTING, INC.

5001 E. Philadelphia Street, Ontario, CA 91761 * Phone (909) 472-4100 « Fax (909) 472-4244 « www.iapmort.org

d ) SCC Accredited
g CB-P/S
ANSI National Accreditation Board ( ;

ACCREDITED n&

; OCPS

PRODUCT CERTIFICATION . ™ Accrédité CCN

BODY e
IAPMO R&T Product Listing

LEAD FREE

This IAPMO R&T Listing is current as of November 13, 2025
File Number:

6194

Issued To:

ZENNER PERFORMANCE METERS, INC

1981 Quality Blvd HUNTSVILLE, TX, United States

Product:
Lead Free Plumbing Products

Products are certified to the following standard(s)
Section 1417(d) of the Safe Drinking Water Act
The lead content requirements of Section 116875 of the California Health & Safety Code
NSF/ANSI/CAN 372-2024

1of8

JTM

11/13/25, 3:18 PM
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Models

IAPMO RESEARCH AND TESTING, INC.
CERTIFICATE OF LISTING

Issued To: ZENNER PERFORMANCE METERS, INC
LEAD FREE File Number: 6194
Product: Lead Free Plumbing Products
This IAPMO R&T Listing is current as of November 13, 2025

Identification:
Each product shall bear permanent and legible markings to identify the manufacturer. This marking shall be the trade

name, trademark, or other mark known to identify the manufacturer. The product shall bear the appropriate IAPMO R&T
certification mark. The product may also bear either "Lead Free" or "Low Lead" above or in close proximity to the IAPMO
R&T certification mark.

Characteristics:
Products may include any pipe, pipe fitting, solder, flux, or other plumbing products providing water for human

consumption. Products listed below are to be installed in accordance with the manufacturer's instruction. These products
have been verified with weighted average lead content <=0.25%; Solder and flux lead content <=0.2%.

Products listed on this certificate have been tested by an IAPMO R&T recognized laboratory. This recognition has been
granted based upon the laboratory's compliance to the applicable requirements of ISO/IEC 17025.

https://plm.iapmo.org/pld#/certificate/6194/2970

11/13/25, 3:18 PM
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Model Number
108112
108151
139642
ETKDi-GL-BR
ETKDi-GL-L
FSM100
MINOMESS 130
PA-500
PA-501
PA-502
PFS04X15G
PFS04X2
PFS04X2T
PFS06X15G
PFS06X3V
PFS06X4
PFS06X4T
PFS06X4V
PFS08X2G
PFS08X4
PFS08X4T
PFS08X4V
PFS10X4
PFS10X4T
PFS12X4
PFS12X4T
PMCO03
PMCO04
PMC06
PMC08
PMCBO02
PMCBO3
PMCBO04
PMCBO06
PMF03
PMF07
PMFO09
PMF12
PMFP03
PMFPO7
PMFP08
PMFP11
PMNO1

PMNO1**+-XXXX-XXX

Description

Tube, Meter Idler, with thread 1-11 1/2NPSM x 190mm
Tube, Meter Idler, with thread 1-11 1/2NPSM x 130mm
Meter Coupling, Plastic, 3/4" (Includes Tail Piece and Nut)
5/8 x 3/4

5/8 x 3/4

1" Fire Service Manifold

Single Jet Water Meter

1/2" Meter Coupling, Brass (Includes Nut, Tail Piece and Gasket)
3/4" Meter Coupling, Brass (Includes Nut, Tail Piece and Gasket)
1" Meter Coupling, Brass (Includes Nut, Tail Piece and Gasket)
4" x 1-1/2" Fire Service Compound Meters

4" x 2" x 3/4" SL Fire Service Compound Meters

4" x 2" x 3/4" SL Fire Service Compound Meters

6" x 1-1/2" Fire Service Compound Meters

6" x 3" x 3/4" Fire Service Compound Meters

6" x 4" x 1" Fire Service Compound Meters

6" x 4" x 1" Fire Service Compound Meters

6" x 4" x 1" Fire Service Compound Meters

8" x 2" Fire Service Compound Meters

8" x 4" x 1" Fire Service Compound Meters

8" x 4" x 1" Fire Service Compound Meters

8" x 4" x 1" Fire Service Compound Meters

10" x 4" x 1" Fire Service Compound Meters

10" x 4" x 1" Fire Service Compound Meters

10" x 4" x 1" Fire Service Compound Meters

10" x 4" x 1" Fire Service Compound Meters

3" x 3/4" SL Performance Compound Meters

4" x 1" Performance Compound Meters

6" x 1-1/2" Performance Compound Meters

8" x 2" Performance Compound Meters

2" Bronze Compound Meter

3" Bronze Compound Meter

4" Bronze Compound Meter

6" Bronze Compound Meter

3/4" SL Residential Fire Meter

1" Residential Fire Meter

1-1/2" Residential Fire Meter

2" Residential Fire Meter

3/4" SL Performance High Pressure Meter

1" Performance High Pressure Meter

1-1/2" Performance High Pressure Meter

2" Performance High Pressure Meter

Nitro | Meter 5/8" x 1/2"

Nitro | Meter 5/8" x 1/2"

https://plm.iapmo.org/pld#/certificate/6194/2970
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Model Number
PMNO02
PMNO2**+-XXXX-XXX
PMNO3
PMNO3**+-XXXX-XXX
PMNO4
PMNO4**+-XXXX-XXX
PMNO5
PMNO5**+-XXXX-XXX
PMNO7
PMNO7**+-XXXX-XXX
PMNO8
PMNO8#**-*-XXXX-XXX
PMNO9

PMN11
PMN11#*-*-XXXX-XXX
PMN12

PMNHO1

PMNHO02

PMNHO03

PMNHO04

PMNHO05

PMNHO07

PMS03

PMS04

PMS06

PMS08

PMS10

PMS12

PMSB02

PMSB02

PMSB02

PMSB03

PMSB03

PMSB04

PMSB04

PMSBO06

PMSB06

PMSB08

PMSB08

PMT02

PMTO03

PMTO4

PMTO6

PMTO08

Description

Nitro | Meter 5/8" x 3/4"

Nitro | Meter 5/8" x 3/4"

SL Nitro | Meter 3/4"

SL Nitro | Meter 3/4"

Nitro | Meter 3/4" x 3/4"

Nitro | Meter 3/4" x 3/4"

Nitro | Meter 3/4" x 1"

Nitro | Meter 3/4" x 1"

Nitro | Meter 1"

Nitro | Meter 1"

Nitro 1 Meter 1 1/2" External thread

Nitro 1 Meter

Nitro | Meter 1 1/2"

Nitro Meter 2" External thread

Nitro Meter

Nitro | Meter 2"

5/8 x 1/2 Inch Hot Water Meter

5/8 X 3/4 Inch Hot Water Meter

3/4SL Inch Hot Water Meter

3/4 X 3/4 Inch Hot Water Meter

3/4 X 1 Inch Hot Water Meter

1 Inch Hot Water Meter

3" Strainer, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

4" Strainer, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

6" Strainer, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

8" Strainer, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

10" Strainer, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

12" Strainer, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

2" Bronze Strainer

2" Strainer, Bronze Housing and Cover, SS Screen
2" Strainer, Bronze Housing and Cover, SS Screen
3" Bronze Strainer

3" Strainer, Bronze Housing and Cover, SS Screen
4" Bronze Strainer

4" Strainer, Bronze Housing and Cover, SS Screen
6" Bronze Strainer

6" Strainer, Bronze Housing and Cover, SS Screen
8" Bronze Strainer

8" Strainer, Bronze Housing and Cover, SS Screen
2" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

3" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

4" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

6" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

8" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

https://plm.iapmo.org/pld#/certificate/6194/2970

11/13/25, 3:18 PM



IAPMO R&T Product Listing Directory

50f8

Model Number
PMT10
PMT12
PMTBO1
PMTBO02
PMTBO03
PMTBO04
PMTBO06
PMTBO08
PPDO03
PPD04
PPDO05
PPDO7
PPDO08
PPDO09
PPD11
PPD12
ZCS02
ZCS03
ZCS04
ZSB02
ZSB03
ZSB04
ZSB06
ZSB08
ZSU02
ZSU03
ZSU04
ZSU06
ZSU08
ZSU10
ZSU12
ZSURO1
ZSURO02
ZSURO03
ZSURO7
ZSURO09
ZSW02
ZSWO03
ZSW04
ZSW06
ZSWO08
ZSW10
ZTMO02

ZTMO03

Description

10" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

12" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Epoxy Coated

1-1/2" Bronze Turbine Meter

2" Bronze Turbine Meter

3" Bronze Turbine Meter

4" Bronze Turbine Meter

6" Bronze Turbine Meter

8" Bronze Turbine Meter

3/4"SL POSITIVE DISPLACEMENT WATER METER

3/4 X 3/4 POSITIVE DISPLACEMENT WATER METER

3/4 X 1 POSITIVE DISPLACEMENT WATER METER

1" POSITIVE DISPLACEMENT WATER METER

1-1/2" Positive Displacement Water Meter, Threaded ends
1-1/2" POSITIVE DISPLACEMENT WATER METER

2" Positive Displacement Water Meter, Threaded ends

2" POSITIVE DISPLACEMENT WATER METER

2" ZENNER Compound Meter Single Housing, Cast Iron

3" ZENNER Compound Meter Single Housing, Cast Iron

4" ZENNER Compound Meter Single Housing, Cast Iron

2" Strainer, Bronze Housing and Cover, SS Screen

3" Strainer, Bronze Housing and Cover, SS Screen

4" Strainer, Bronze Housing and Cover, SS Screen

6" Strainer, Bronze Housing and Cover, SS Screen

8" Strainer, Bronze Housing and Cover, SS Screen

2" Ultrasonic Meter, Cast Iron Housing, 10"LL, Oval Flange
3" Ultrasonic Meter, Cast Iron Housing, 12"LL, Round Flange
4" Ultrasonic Meter, Cast Iron Housing, 14"LL, Round Flange
6" Ultrasonic Meter, Cast Iron Housing, 18"LL, Round Flange
8" Ultrasonic Meter, Cast Iron Housing, 20"LL, Round Flange
10" Ultrasonic Meter, Cast Iron Housing, 17-3/4"LL, Round Flange
12" Ultrasonic Meter, Cast Iron Housing, 19-5/8"LL, Round Flange
5/8" x 1/2" Residential Ultrasonic Meter, Bronze Housing
5/8" x 3/4" Residential Ultrasonic Meter, Bronze Housing
3/4" SL Residential Ultrasonic Meter, Bronze Housing

1" Residential Ultrasonic Meter, Bronze Housing

1-1/2" Residential Ultrasonic Meter, Bronze Housing

2" Strainer, Cast Iron Housing and Cover, SS Screen

3" Strainer, Cast Iron Housing and Cover, SS Screen

4" Strainer, Cast Iron Housing and Cover, SS Screen

6" Strainer, Cast Iron Housing and Cover, SS Screen

8" Strainer, Cast Iron Housing and Cover, SS Screen

10" Strainer, Cast Iron Housing and Cover, SS Screen

2" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing

3" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing

https://plm.iapmo.org/pld#/certificate/6194/2970
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Model Number
ZTM04
ZTMO06
ZTMO08
ZTM10
ZTM12
ZTMBO1
ZTMBO02
ZTMBO3
ZTMB04
ZTMBO06

ZTMBO08

#

M

no "M"

*k

us
CF

CM

+

B

no "B"

Description

4" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing
6" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing
8" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing
10" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing
12" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing
1-1/2" Turbine Meter, Bronze Housing
2" Turbine Meter, Bronze Housing

3" Turbine Meter, Bronze Housing

4" Turbine Meter, Bronze Housing

6" Turbine Meter, Bronze Housing

8" Turbine Meter, Bronze Housing

(if applicable):
Male Thread

Female Thread

meter registration

(if applicable):
bypass valve

without bypass valve

https://plm.iapmo.org/pld#/certificate/6194/2970

Note:  suffix portion -XXXX-XXX refers to various components not in contact with water and therefore will not affect the results for testing to the applicable

standard

Base Model
PPD01US-1234-567-89

PPD02US-1234-567-89

-

»w m X

Description

Standard read meter with no electronics
ETR

Solid State Register

Plastic shroud
Brass shroud

7 digit odometer

Plastic lid

Brass lid

11/13/25, 3:18 PM
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567
NIC
NIC33
ILC
E60
E180
P60
ILC25
TPZ
TPS
VoM
VoS
A103
NM

ESP

89

CA

Base Model

ZTML02-12-34-567
ZTML03-12-34-567
ZTML04-12-34-567
ZTMLO06-12-34-567

ZTML08-12-34-567

12
us
CM

CF

34
XB
EB

567
NIC
NIC33
ILC
E60
E180

P60

https://plm.iapmo.org/pld#/certificate/6194/2970

Brass bottom plate
Plastic bottom plate

Cast iron bottom plate

Nicor Connector

Nicor Connector with 33' of cable

Itron Connector

ETR with 60" of Cable in Encoded Mode
ETR with 180" of Cable in Encoded Mode
ETR with 60" of Cable in Pulse Mode

Itron Connector with 25' cable

ETR with Zenner Pit Pad attached

ETR with Sensus Pit Pad attached

ETR with VL-9M attached in encoded mode
ETR with VL-9S attached in pulse mode
ETR with A103 counter attached in pulse mode
No magnet on sweep hand

ETR with Cable at special length in encoded mode

CTEP configured meter for sub-metering (sometimes this extension is in 567)

Description

2" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing
3" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing
4" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing
6" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing

8" Turbine Meter, Cast Iron Housing

for US Gallon Register
for Cubic Meter Register

for Cubic Feet Register

is for a standard read meter with no electronics and a brass lid

is for a meter configured with an ETR and brass lid

Nicor Connector

Nicor Connector with 33' of cable

Itron Connector

ETR with 60" of Cable in Encoded Mode
ETR with 180" of Cable in Encoded Mode

ETR with 60" of Cable in Pulse Mode

11/13/25, 3:18 PM
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567
ILC25
TPZ
TPS
VoM
VoS
A103
NM

ESP

Itron Connector with 25' cable

ETR with Zenner Pit Pad attached

ETR with Sensus Pit Pad attached

ETR with VL-9M attached in encoded mode
ETR with VL-9S attached in pulse mode

ETR with A103 counter attached in pulse mode
No magnet on sweep hand

ETR with Cable at special length in encoded mode

HYDRANT METER WITH HOUSING & GATE VALVE:

Model Number Description

FHZ20*## FHZ20 Hydrant Meter with FHZ-HSG-2520 Housing

FHZ20*##-GV FHZ20 Hydrant Meter with FHZ-HSG-2520 Housing & 2" Gate Valve
FHZ25*## FHZ25 FHZ25 Hydrant Meter with FHZ-HSG-2525R Housing

FHZ25*##-GV FHZ25 Hydrant Meter with FHZ-HSG-2525R Housing & 2-1/2" Gate Valve
FHZ30*## FHZ30 Hydrant Meter with FHZ-HSG-3030 Housing

Handle configurations

N Stainless Steel Double Handles

P Padlock Single Aluminum Handle

B Barrel Lock Single Aluminum Handle
N No Handles

## Registration

us US Gallons

CF Cubic Feet

CM Cubic Meters

HYDRANT METER WITH FHZ-HSG HOUSING:

https://plm.iapmo.org/pld#/certificate/6194/2970

Model Number Description

FHZD30S##-RP FHZD30S Hydrant Meter with built-in RPZ Backflow and Stand

FHZD30S##-RP-GV FHZD30S Hydrant Meter with built-in RPZ Backflow with Stand and 2-1/2” Gate Valve on the outlet
## Registration

us US Gallons

CF Cubic Feet

CM Cubic Meters

8of 8
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REFERENCES

Instructions: Vendor shall provide with bid a minimum of three (3) customer references for which similar
services have been provided. Additional pages may be added, if needed. Complete and return with
bid submittal. Reference letters are highly encouraged and should accompany this form.

Reference # 1

Project Name: Broward County Contract Value: 3,000,000.00
Date Began: 0/25/24 Date Completed: 0/25/28
Add
ress 2555 West Copans Rd
City/State /Zip | pompano Beach FI 33069
Contact Person: Jonn Wil Email: jwilf@broward.org
ohn Wi
Phone: 954/831-3233 Fax:
Mg, Contract No. OPN2128128B1_1,
Reference # 2
Project Name: City of Tampa Contract Value: 1,000,000.00
Date Began: 9/13/2024 Date Completed: 9/11/2026
Address 2555 E Hanna Avenue
City / State / Zi
W) ¢ S Al D Tampa FL 33610
CaAE Boraa Travis Riley Email: Travis.Riley@tampagov.net
Phone: Fax:
813-399-0766
Notes: Water Meters Rebid, Bid # 21011924

Reference # 3

Project Name: Miami Dade Contract Value: 2,000,000.00
Date Began: Date Completed: i

L 9/29/23 P on going
Address

20900 sw 117th Ave

City / State / Zip Miami FI 33177
Contact Person: | j,an Pelay Email: jpela@miamidade.gov
Phone: 305-547-7004 Fax:
MRles EVN0000002




SCRUTINIZED COMPANIES FORMS

SCRUTINIZED COMPANIES AND BUSINESS OPERATIONS WITH

CUBA AND SYRIA CERTIFICATION FORM
IF YOUR BID/PROPOSAL IS $1,000,000 OR MORE, THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND
SUBMITTED WITH THE BID/PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO SUBMIT THIS FORM AS REQUIRED MAY
DEEM YOUR SUBMITTAL NONRESPONSIVE.

The affiant, by virtue of the signature below, certifies that:

1. The vendor, company, individual, principal, subsidiary, affiliate, or owner is aware of the requirements
of section 287.135, Florida Statutes, regarding companies on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan
List, the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List, or engaging in business
operations in Cuba and Syria; and

2. The vendor, company, individual, principal, subsidiary, affiliate, or owner is eligible to participate in this
solicitation and is not listed on either the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List, the Scrutinized
Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Sector List, or engaged in business operations in Cuba and
Syria; and

3. Business Operations means, for purposes specifically related to Cuba or Syria, engaging in commerce
in any form in Cuba or Syria, including, but not limited to, acquiring, developing, maintaining, owning, selling,
possessing, leasing or operating equipment, facilities, personnel, products, services, personal property, real
property, military equipment, or any other apparatus of business or commerce; and

4, If awarded the Contract (or Agreement), the vendor, company, individual, principal, subsidiary, affiliate,
or owner will immediately notify the City of Clearwater in writing, no later than five (5) calendar days after any of
its principals are placed on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List, the Scrutinized Companies

with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Sector List, or engazed in busi%ration; in Cuba and Syria.

\\\‘:;\2“;"5"3;;?’”&, Authorized Sighature =
o A\ PP »

% Barry Howton
Printed Name

1 B “\\\s“\ Consolidated Pipe & Supply Co. Inc.
:mmtlllll\\ Name of Enlifyfcorporation

STATEIOF  /Vabama

COUNTY OF Jefferson

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me by means of =X physical presence or O online
notarization on, this _13 _day of November ,2025 bEE Barry Howton
(name of person whose signature is being notarized) as the CFO (title) of

-Consolidated Pipe & Supply Co. Inc (name of corporation/entity), personally known X or
produced (type of identification) as identification, and who did/did not take

an oath.
SHERRY L. BURR ,45@/»,, p?{ Leen

My Commission Expires Notary Pubflic
March 13, 2029 Sherry L Burr
Printed Name

My Commission Expires; 03/13/2029
NOTARY SEAL ABOVE




Compliance with Anti-Human Trafficking Laws
Pursuant to Section 787.06 (13), Florida Statutes, this form must be completed by an officer or

representative of a non-governmental entity when a contract is executed, renewed, or extended
between the non-governmental entity and the City of Clearwater.

The undersigned, on behalf of the entity listed below (“Entity”), hereby attests under penalty of
perjury that:

Entity does not use coercion for labor or services as defined in Section 787.06, Florida Statutes.
The undersigned is authorized to execute this form on behalf of Entity.
Date: _ November 13 12025  Signed: @Dﬂnm
Entity: Consolidated Pipe & Supply Co. Inc. Name:  Barry Hotton
Title: CFO

“I'-""""F.l'fff
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Form W'g

(Rev. March 2024)

Department of the Treasury
Internal Revenue Service

Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

Go to www.irs.gov/FormW?9 for instructions and the latest information.

Give form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

Before you begin. For guidance related to the purpose of Form W-9, see Purpose of Form, below.

entity’s name on lineg 2 )

CONSOLIDATED PIPE & SUPPLY COMPANY, INC.

1 Name of entity/individual An entry is required. (For a sole proprietor or disregarded entity, enter the owner's name on line 1, and enter the business/disregardad

2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if dfferent from above.

only one of the following seven boxes

|:| Individual/sole proprietor D C corporation

box for the tax classification of its owner.
[:l Other {see instructions)

3a Check the appropniate box for federal tax classification of the entity/individual whose name Is entered on hre 1, Check

S corporation

D LLC. Enter the tax classification (C = C corporation, S = § corporation, P = Partnership)

Nate: Check the “LLC” box above and, in the entry space, enter the appropriaie code (C, S, or P} for the tax
classification of the LLC, unless it is a disregarded entity. A disregarded entity should instead check the appropnate

4 Exemphans (codes apply only to
certain entities, not indwiduals,

see instructions on page 3):

D Partnership D Trust/estate

Exempt payee code (if any) 5
Exemption from Foreign Account Tax

Compliance Act {FATCA) reporting
code {if any)

Print or type.

3b If on line 3a you chacked “Partnership” or “Trust/estate,” or checked “LLC” and entered “P” as its tax classification,
and you are providing this form to a partnership, trust, or estate in which you have an ownership interest, check
this box if you have any foreign partners. owners, or beneficiaries. See instructions .

{Applies to accounts maintained
outside the United States )

See Spacific Instructions on page 3.

& Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no ). See instructions.

1205 HILLTOP PKWY

Requester's name and address {optional)

& City, state, and ZIP code
BIRMINGHAM, AL 35204

7 List account number(s) here {optional)

REMIT TO: DEPT 3147 P O BOX 2153 BIRMINGHAM, AL 35287-3147

Taxpayer Identification Number (TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avoid
backup withhelding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN}). However, for a
resident alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the instructions for Part |, later. For other
entities, it is your employer identification number (EIN). If you do not have a number, see How to gef a

TIN, later.

Note: If the account is in mare than one name, see the instructions for line 1. See also What Name and
Number To Give the Requester for guidelines en whose number to enter.

| Social security numbaer

or
Employer identification number

6/3(-(0|4|1/8/3 |84

m Certification

Under penalties of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number {or | am waiting for a number to be issued to me}); and

2.1 am not subject to backup withholding because (a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or {) | have not been notified by the Internal Revenue
Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or () the IRS has notified me that | am

no longer subject to backup withholding; and
3. 1am a U.5. citizen or other U.S. person (defined below); and

4, The FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that | am exempt from FATCA reporting is correct.

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above 1f you have been nofified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withholding
because you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply. For mortgage interest paid,
acquisition or abandonment of secured praperty, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement arrangement {IRA), and, generally, payments

other than interest and dividends, you are not re

ired to sign the certification, but you must provide your correct TIN. See the instructions for Part I, later.

)

Sign Signature of
Here U.S. person

iAol

b //7, /7/07/§

V_ U /
General Instructions

Section references are to the Internal Revenue Code unless otherwise
noted.

Future developments. For the latest information about developments
related to Form W-9 and its instructions, such as legislation enacted
after they were published, go to www.rs.gov/iFormIVa.

What’s New

Line 3a has been modified to clarify how a disregarded entity completes
this line. An LLC that is a disregarded entity should check the
appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner. Otherwise, it
should check the "LLC” box and enter its appropriate tax classification.

New line 3b has been added to this form. A flow-through entity is
required to complete this line to indicate that it has direct or indirect
foreign partriers, owners, or beneficiaries when it provides the Form W-2
to another flow-through entity in which it has an ownership interest. This
change is intended to provide a flow-through entity with information
regarding the status of its indirect foreign partners, owners, or
beneficiaries, so that it can satisfy any applicable reporting
requirements. For example, a partnership that has any indirect foreign
partners may be required to complete Schedules K-2 and K-3. See the
Partnership Instructions for Schedules K-2 and K-3 (Form 1065).

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-8 requester) who is required to file an
information return with the IRS is giving you this form because they

Cat. No. 10231X

Form W=9 (Rev. 3-2024)




