
Zone 1 West Zone 2 Countryside Zone 3 East Zone 4 Northwest Zone 5 Southwest Zone 6 Ballfields Total

$168,538.00 $98,525.00 $105,166.00 $104,539.00 $83,079.00 $50,400.00 $610,247.00

$158,550.00 $120,320.00 No Bid No Bid $90,515.00 $47,520.00 $416,905.00

$168,174.00 $76,766.00 $126,225.00 $133,040.00 $84,960.00 $61,920.00 $651,085.00

No Bid $79,699.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $45,280.00 $124,979.00

$402,302.00 $260,968.00 $257,047.00 $316,555.00 $266,251.00 No Bid $1,503,123.00

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $119,680.00 $119,680.00

Primary
Secondary
Withdrew 
bid for Zone 
1

Yellowstone Landscape

Vendor Name:

Average Joe Landscape

Botanical Dimensions Inc

J & J Diversified, LLC  (dba) Diversified 
Landscape Maintenance

MMM Property Maintenance and Lawn Care LL

Superior Landscaping & Lawn Service Inc.
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