
"Offers from the vendors listed herein are the only offers

RFP  DUE DATE: February 11, 2019 received timely as of the above receiving date and time.
RFP DUE TIME: 2:30 P.M. All other offers submitted in response to this solicitation,
RFP No.:  011-2515-19/IT if any, are hereby rejected as late"

VENDORS Business Name: Environmental Products Group Business Name: GT Supplies, Inc. Business Name: Petersen Industries Business Name: RDK Truck Sales

Address: 2525 Clacona Rd Address: 7010 Barbour Road Address: 4000 S.R. 60 West Address: 3214 Adamo Dr.
 Apopka, FL 32703 Riviera Beach, FL 33407 Lake Wales, FL 33859 Tampa, FL 33605

Tel: 561-719-1395 Tel: 561-881-8101 Tel: 863-676-1493 Tel: 813-241-0711
Email:  phart@myepg.com Email: tr@gtsupplies.com Email: nfiler@petersenind.com Email: joanie@rdk.com

MONTHLY RENTAL RATE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $6,500.00
DELIVERY CHARGE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $500.00

PICK-UP FEE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $500.00

MONTHLY RENTAL RATE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $6,500.00
DELIVERY CHARGE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $500.00

PICK-UP FEE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $500.00

MONTHLY RENTAL RATE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $6,500.00
DELIVERY CHARGE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $500.00

PICK-UP FEE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $500.00

MONTHLY RENTAL RATE: $8,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,500.00
DELIVERY CHARGE: $750.00 $0.00 $566.00 $500.00

PICK-UP FEE: $750.00 $0.00 $566.00 $500.00

MONTHLY RENTAL RATE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $6,500.00
DELIVERY CHARGE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $500.00

PICK-UP FEE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $500.00

MONTHLY RENTAL RATE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $6,500.00
DELIVERY CHARGE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $500.00

PICK-UP FEE: No-Bid No-Bid No-Bid $500.00

Opened and tabulated by: Eric Marmer, 2/11/19
Witnessed by: I. Triestman

TRUCK RENTALS

ITEM 1:  RENTAL OF 26 - 35 CUBIC YARD 
AUTOMATIC SIDE LOADER REFUSE 
COMPACTOR TRUCK WITH JOYSTICK 

ITEM 2:  RENTAL OF ROLL OFF (CAB OVER 
OR CONVENTIONAL)

ITEM 3:  RENTAL OF 26 - 35 CUBIC YARD 
COMMERCIAL FRONT LOAD 

ITEM 4:  RENTAL OF 22 - 31 CUBIC YARD 
CHERRY PICKER

ITEM 5:  RENTAL OF 30-40 YARD TRASH 
HAULER BODY REFUSE TRUCK

Item 5 & 6 Gross Vehicle Weights both 66,000k

ITEM 6:  RENTAL OF 27 – 30 CUBIC YARD 
REAR LOADER REFUSE TRUCK WITH 2 CART 
TIPPERS 

COMMENTS:


