

Light Duty

			2396: Tampa Spring Co	Collision Auto Pros	Dayton Andrews Inc	Ferman of Countryside LL	FINAL TOUCH COLLISION
Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
GENERAL REPAIR	Light Duty						
	Preventative Maintenance						
1A-1	Inspections	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$85.00	\$0.00	\$150.00	\$90.00
1A-2	Mechanical	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$85.00	\$199.99	\$150.00	\$90.00
1A-3	Electrical	Per Hour	No Bid	\$95.00	\$199.99	\$150.00	\$95.00
1A-4	Diagnostics (Non-OEM Specific)	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$110.00	\$159.99	\$150.00	\$110.00
GENERAL REPAIR	Medium Duty						
	Preventative Maintenance						
1B-1	Inspections	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$95.00	\$0.00	\$150.00	\$98.00
1B-2	Mechanical	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$95.00	\$249.99	\$150.00	\$98.00
1B-3	Electrical	Per Hour	No Bid	\$105.00	\$249.99	\$150.00	\$105.00
1B-4	Diagnostics (Non-OEM Specific)	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$115.00	\$179.99	\$150.00	\$115.00
GENERAL REPAIR	Heavy Duty						
	Preventative Maintenance						
1C-1	Inspections	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$110.00	\$0.00	\$175.00	\$125.00
1C-2	Mechanical	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$110.00	\$249.99	\$175.00	\$125.00
1C-3	Electrical	Per Hour	No Bid	\$130.00	\$249.99	\$175.00	\$135.00
1C-4	Hydraulic Systems	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$140.00	No Bid	\$175.00	\$145.00
1C-5	Diagnostics (Non-OEM Specific)	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$140.00	\$179.99	\$175.00	\$145.00
1C-6	Welding/Fabrication	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$249.99	No Bid	\$150.00

Light Duty

HARBORSIDE FLEET SOLU	mercado motors llc	Nexttran Truck Centers	R&B Autobody Transport	Rush Truck Centers of Flo	SOUTHWEST COLLISION	Sunset Garage Auto Work
Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost

No Bid	\$49.95	No Bid	\$56.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$56.00
No Bid	\$119.50	No Bid	\$65.00	No Bid	\$90.00	\$95.00
No Bid	\$119.50	No Bid	\$65.00	No Bid	\$90.00	\$95.00
No Bid	\$99.50	No Bid	\$64.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$95.00

--	--	--	--	--	--	--

\$150.00	\$49.95	\$211.00	\$56.00	\$186.00	No Bid	\$60.00
\$150.00	\$119.50	\$211.00	\$65.00	\$186.00	\$90.00	\$95.00
\$150.00	\$119.50	\$211.00	\$65.00	\$186.00	\$90.00	\$95.00
\$150.00	\$99.50	\$211.00	\$54.00	\$186.00	No Bid	\$95.00

--	--	--	--	--	--	--

\$150.00	No Bid	\$211.00	\$56.00	\$186.00	No Bid	\$70.00
\$150.00	No Bid	\$211.00	\$65.00	\$186.00	\$90.00	\$110.00
\$150.00	No Bid	\$211.00	\$65.00	\$186.00	\$90.00	\$110.00
\$150.00	No Bid	\$211.00	\$65.00	\$186.00	No Bid	\$110.00
\$150.00	No Bid	\$211.00	\$56.00	\$186.00	No Bid	\$110.00
\$150.00	No Bid	\$211.00	\$65.00	\$186.00	\$78.00	\$95.00

Light Duty

Supersport Classics LLC	Trucks & Parts of Tampa	Walker Ford	Xtreme Precision Auto Collision Llc
Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost

No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	\$50.00
No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	\$85.00
No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	\$46.00
No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	\$46.00

--	--	--	--

No Bid	\$155.00	\$195.00	\$50.00
No Bid	\$155.00	\$195.00	\$85.00
No Bid	\$155.00	\$195.00	\$46.00
No Bid	\$155.00	\$195.00	\$46.00

--	--	--	--

No Bid		\$155.00	No Bid		\$46.00
No Bid		\$155.00	No Bid		\$85.00
No Bid		\$155.00	No Bid		\$46.00
No Bid		\$155.00	No Bid		\$85.00
No Bid		\$155.00	No Bid		\$46.00
	\$125.00	\$155.00	No Bid		\$60.00

Medium Duty

			2396: Tampa Spring Co	Collision Auto Pros	Dayton Andrews Inc	Ferman of Countryside LL	FINAL TOUCH COLLISION
Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
COLLISION REPAIR	Light						
1A-5	Body	Per Hour	No Bid	\$47.00	\$56.00	\$60.00	\$48.00
1A-6	Refinishing/Paint	Per Hour	No Bid	\$47.00	\$56.00	\$60.00	\$48.00
1A-7	Structural/Frame	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$70.00	\$56.00	\$120.00	\$75.00
1A-8	ADAS Calibration	Per Hour	No Bid	\$95.00	\$158.33	\$150.00	\$95.00
1A-9	Glass Replacement	Per Hour	No Bid	\$60.00	\$92.00	\$150.00	\$60.00
COLLISION REPAIR	Medium						
1B-5	Body	Per Hour	No Bid	\$50.00	\$150.00	\$60.00	\$50.00
1B-6	Refinishing/Painting	Per Hour	No Bid	\$50.00	\$150.00	\$60.00	\$50.00
1B-7	Structural/Frame	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$70.00	\$150.00	\$120.00	\$80.00
1B-8	ADAS Calibration	Per Hour	No Bid	\$95.00	\$158.33	\$150.00	\$95.00
1B-9	Glass Replacement	Per Hour	No Bid	\$65.00	\$126.00	\$150.00	\$70.00
COLLISION REPAIR	Heavy						
1C-7	Body	Per Hour	No Bid	\$95.00	\$150.00	\$60.00	\$99.00
1C-8	Refinishing/Painting	Per Hour	No Bid	\$95.00	\$150.00	\$60.00	\$99.00
1C-9	Structural/Frame	Per Hour	\$150.00	\$105.00	\$150.00	\$120.00	\$99.00
1C-10	ADAS Calibration	Per Hour	No Bid	\$140.00	\$158.33	\$150.00	\$140.00
1C-11	Glass Replacement	Per Hour	No Bid	\$85.00	\$126.00	\$150.00	\$90.00

Medium Duty

mercado motors llc	Nextran Truck Centers	R&B Autobody Transport	Rush Truck Centers of Flo	SOUTHWEST COLLISION	Sunset Garage Auto Work	Sunshine Automotive Inc	Supersport Classics LLC
Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
\$119.50	No Bid	\$56.00	\$102.00	\$48.00	\$56.00	\$54.00	No Bid
\$119.50	No Bid	\$56.00	\$102.00	\$48.00	\$56.00	\$54.00	No Bid
No Bid	No Bid	\$55.00	\$102.00	\$70.00	\$60.00	\$54.00	No Bid
No Bid	No Bid	\$56.00	\$102.00	\$110.00	\$95.00	\$100.00	No Bid
No Bid	No Bid	\$56.00	\$102.00	\$56.00	\$59.00	\$54.00	No Bid
\$119.50	\$135.00	\$56.00	\$102.00	\$48.00	\$60.00	\$54.00	\$125.00
\$119.50	\$135.00	\$56.00	\$102.00	\$48.00	\$60.00	\$54.00	\$125.00
No Bid	\$135.00	\$56.00	\$102.00	\$70.00	\$70.00	\$54.00	\$125.00
No Bid	\$135.00	\$56.00	\$102.00	\$110.00	\$95.00	\$100.00	\$125.00
No Bid	No Bid	\$56.00	\$101.00	\$55.00	\$95.00	\$54.00	\$75.00
No Bid	\$135.00	\$65.00	\$102.00	\$77.00	\$75.00	\$54.00	\$125.00
No Bid	\$135.00	\$65.00	\$102.00	\$77.00	\$75.00	\$54.00	\$125.00
No Bid	\$135.00	\$65.00	\$102.00	\$90.00	\$75.00	\$54.00	\$125.00
No Bid	\$135.00	\$65.00	\$102.00	\$110.00	\$95.00	\$100.00	\$125.00
No Bid	No Bid	\$65.00	\$102.00	\$56.00	\$75.00	\$54.00	\$75.00

Medium Duty

Trucks & Parts of Tampa	Walker Ford	Xtreme Precision Auto Co
Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
No Bid	\$60.00	\$46.00
No Bid	\$60.00	\$46.00
No Bid	\$60.00	\$85.00
No Bid	\$60.00	\$50.00
No Bid	\$0.00	\$50.00
\$155.00	\$60.00	\$46.00
\$155.00	\$60.00	\$46.00
\$155.00	\$60.00	\$85.00
\$155.00	\$60.00	\$50.00
\$155.00	\$60.00	\$50.00
\$155.00 No Bid		\$46.00
\$155.00 No Bid		\$46.00
\$155.00 No Bid		\$85.00
\$155.00 No Bid		\$50.00
\$155.00 No Bid		\$50.00

Heavy Duty

			2396: Tampa Springs	Collision Auto Pros	Dayton Andrews Inc	Ferman of Countryside LLC	FINAL TOUCH COLLISION
Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
OEM-SPECIFIC REPAIR	Light Duty						
1A-10	OEM-Certified Inspections	Per Hour	No Bid	\$120.00	\$0.00	\$150.00	\$120.00
1A-11	OEM-Specific Mechanical	Per Hour	No Bid	\$130.00	\$199.99	\$150.00	\$130.00
1A-12	OEM-Specific Electrical	Per Hour	No Bid	\$140.00	\$199.99	\$150.00	\$140.00
1A-13	OEM-Specific Diagnostics	Per Hour	No Bid	\$150.00	\$159.99	\$150.00	\$150.00
OEM-SPECIFIC REPAIR	Medium Duty						
1B-10	OEM-Certified Inspections	Per Hour	No Bid	\$130.00	\$0.00	\$150.00	\$130.00
1B-11	OEM-Specific Mechanical	Per Hour	No Bid	\$140.00	\$249.99	\$150.00	\$140.00
1B-12	OEM-Specific Electrical	Per Hour	No Bid	\$150.00	\$249.99	\$150.00	\$150.00
1B-13	OEM-Specific Diagnostics	Per Hour	No Bid	\$160.00	\$179.99	\$150.00	\$150.00
OEM-SPECIFIC REPAIR	Heavy Duty						
1C-12	OEM-Certified Inspections	Per Hour	No Bid	\$140.00	\$0.00	\$150.00	\$140.00
1C-13	OEM-Specific Mechanical	Per Hour	No Bid	\$150.00	\$249.99	\$150.00	\$150.00
1C-14	OEM-Specific Electrical	Per Hour	No Bid	\$160.00	\$249.99	\$150.00	\$160.00
1C-15	OEM-Specific Diagnostics	Per Hour	No Bid	\$170.00	\$179.99	\$150.00	\$170.00

Heavy Duty

HARBORSIDE FLEET SOLU	mercado motors llc	Nexttran Truck Centers	R&B Autobody Transport	Reliable Transmission Ser	Rush Truck Centers of Flo	Southwest Collision
Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost	Unit Cost
\$150.00	\$49.95 No Bid		\$56.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
\$150.00	\$119.50 No Bid		\$65.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
\$150.00	\$119.50 No Bid		\$65.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
\$150.00	\$99.50 No Bid		\$56.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid
\$150.00	\$49.95	\$211.00	\$56.00	\$215.00	\$186.00	No Bid
\$150.00	\$119.50	\$211.00	\$65.00	\$215.00	\$186.00	No Bid
\$150.00	\$119.50	\$211.00	\$65.00	\$215.00	\$186.00	No Bid
\$150.00	\$99.50	\$211.00	\$56.00	\$215.00	\$186.00	No Bid
\$150.00 No Bid		\$211.00	\$65.00	\$215.00	\$186.00	No Bid
\$150.00 No Bid		\$211.00	\$65.00	\$215.00	\$186.00	No Bid
\$150.00 No Bid		\$211.00	\$65.00	\$215.00	\$186.00	No Bid
\$150.00 No Bid		\$211.00	\$65.00	\$215.00	\$186.00	No Bid

Heavy Duty

Sunset Garage Auto Work	Sunshine Automotive Inc	Supersport Classics LLC	Trucks & Parts of Tampa I	Walker Ford	Xtreme Precision Auto Co
Unit Cost	Unit Cost			Unit Cost	Unit Cost
\$95.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	\$50.00
\$95.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	\$85.00
\$95.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	\$46.00
\$95.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$175.00	\$50.00
\$95.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00	\$50.00
\$95.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00	\$85.00
\$95.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00	\$46.00
\$95.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00	\$50.00
\$110.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$50.00
\$110.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$85.00
\$110.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$46.00
\$110.00 No Bid		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$50.00

Parks Markup

			2396: Tampa Spring Co	Collision Auto Pros	Dayton Andrews Inc	Ferman of Countryside LL	FINAL TOUCH COLLISION
Line Item	Description	Unit of Measure	Percentage	Percentage	Percentage	Percentage	Percentage
2-A	OEM Parts	Percent	28.%	15.%	40.%	20.%	18.%
2-B	Aftermarket Parts	Percent	28.%	15.%	40.%	20.%	18.%
2-C	Remanufactured Parts	Percent	28.%	20.%	40.%	20.%	18.%

Parks Markup

HARBORSIDE FLEET SOLU	mercado motors llc	Nexttran Truck Centers	R&B Autobody Transport	Reliable Transmission Ser	Rush Truck Centers of Flo	SOUTHWEST COLLISION
Percentage	Percentage	Percentage	Percentage	Percentage	Percentage	Percentage
25.%	40.%	18.%	20.%	40.%	35.%	-15.%
35.%	66.%	28.%	20.%	30.%	20.%	20.%
35.%	66.%	18.%	20.%	30.%	20.%	20.%

Parks Markup

Sunset Garage Auto Work	Sunshine Automotive Inc	Supersport Classics LLC	Trucks & Parts of Tampa I	Walker Ford	Xtreme Precision Auto Co
Percentage	Percentage	Percentage	Percentage	Percentage	Percentage
25.%	25.%	20.%	20.%	20.%	0.%
15.%	30.%	20.%	20.%	20.%	0.%
15.%	25.%	20.%	20.%	20.%	20.%