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EVALUATION TABULATION 
ITB No. 06-25 

Supply and Delivery of Various Athletic Field Materials 
RESPONSE DEADLINE: February 18, 2025 at 10:00 am 

Report Generated:  Wednesday, April 23, 2025 
 
GROUP 1 - BALLFIELD CLAY   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Big Earth 
Landscape Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource 

Recovery, Inc a 
Veransa Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer 
& Chemical 

Company, Inc 

SiteOne 
Landscape Supply 

The SOS Team 

Line Item Description Estimated Annual 
Usage by Unit 

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

1.01 Baseball Clay 
80/20 Mix 

500 Cubic Yards $59.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $49.50 $66.24 

 

GROUP 2 - TURFACE   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Big Earth 
Landscape Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource 

Recovery, Inc a 
Veransa Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer 
& Chemical 

Company, Inc 

SiteOne 
Landscape Supply 

The SOS Team 

Line Item Description Estimated Annual 
Usage by Unit 

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

2.01 Turface All Sport 
Calcined Clay 

(MVP) 

800 50 lb. Bag No Bid No Bid $10.15 No Bid $10.65 $30.00 

 

GROUP 3 - INFIELD TOP DRESSING/CONDITIONERS   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 
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 Big Earth 
Landscape Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource 

Recovery, Inc a 
Veransa Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer 
& Chemical 

Company, Inc 

SiteOne 
Landscape Supply 

The SOS Team 

Line Item Description Estimated Annual 
Usage by Unit 

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

3.01 Premium Red 
Infield Top 
Dressing 

150 Tons No Bid No Bid $164.00 No Bid $166.65 $166.536 

3.02 DuraEdge 
Professional 
Infield Mix 

Conditioner 

200 Tons No Bid No Bid $171.50 No Bid $182.00 $74.016 

3.03 DuraEdge 
Platinum Infield 

Conditioner 

800 50 lb. Bag No Bid No Bid $10.49 No Bid $10.25 $24.00 

3.04 DuraEdge Pro 
Slide Playball 

Infield 
Conditioner 

1600 50 lb. Bag No Bid No Bid $9.97 No Bid $9.85 $36.00 

3.05 DuraEdge Field 
Saver 75 

Amendment 

75 Tons No Bid No Bid $255.00 No Bid $269.21 $960.00 

 

GROUP 4 - TOP DRESSING SAND   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Big Earth 
Landscape Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource 

Recovery, Inc a 
Veransa Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer 
& Chemical 

Company, Inc 

SiteOne 
Landscape Supply 

The SOS Team 

Line Item Description Estimated Annual 
Usage by Unit 

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

4.01 Sportsfield Top 
Dressing Sand 

240 Tons $65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $44.412 
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 Big Earth 
Landscape Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource 

Recovery, Inc a 
Veransa Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer 
& Chemical 

Company, Inc 

SiteOne 
Landscape Supply 

The SOS Team 

Line Item Description Estimated Annual 
Usage by Unit 

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

4.02 USGA Top 
Dressing Sand 

100 Tons $65.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid $41.67 $51.816 

4.03 Command Top 
Dressing 1/4 Fine 

Compost 

400 Cubic Yards $72.00 $29.00 

Substitution. Does 
not meet 

specifications. 

$55.72 $54.53 $53.65 $769.164 

4.04 Top Soil 120 50 lb. Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.00 $1.65 $4.44 

4.05 CommandScape 
Landscape mix 

40 Cubic Yards No Bid $43.75 $49.75 $43.13 $46.65 $51.816 

4.06 Comand 40x45 lb. 
Bags (1/8 Pure 

Compost) 

80 Pallet $13.99 No Bid $386.00 $10.75 $530.00 $769.164 

 

GROUP 5 - FIELD MARKING CHALK   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Big Earth 
Landscape Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource 

Recovery, Inc a 
Veransa Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer 
& Chemical 

Company, Inc 

SiteOne 
Landscape Supply 

The SOS Team 

Line Item Description Estimated Annual 
Usage by Unit 

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

5.01 White Field 
Marking Chalk 

1000 50 lb. Bag $10.99 No Bid $8.25 $7.95 $5.85 $14.808 

 

GROUP 6 - MOUND & PLATE CLAY   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

Commented [KC1]: Substitution. This product does not meet 
the specifications required by the department.    
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 Big Earth 
Landscape Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource 

Recovery, Inc a 
Veransa Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer 
& Chemical 

Company, Inc 

SiteOne 
Landscape Supply 

The SOS Team 

Line Item Description Estimated Annual 
Usage by Unit 

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

6.01 Black Stick Mound 
Clay 

750 50 lb. Bag No Bid No Bid $19.50 No Bid $17.35 $22.20 

6.02 Turface All 
Purpose Clay 

1200 50 lb. Bag No Bid No Bid $10.50 $12.22 $12.65 $17.772 

 

GROUP 7 - WARNING TRACK MATERIAL   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 

 Big Earth 
Landscape Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource 

Recovery, Inc a 
Veransa Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer 
& Chemical 

Company, Inc 

SiteOne 
Landscape Supply 

The SOS Team 

Line Item Description Estimated Annual 
Usage by Unit 

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

7.01 Premium Red 
Warning Track 

Material 

192 Tons No Bid No Bid $153.00 No Bid $156.00 $1,421.112 

7.02 White Warning 
Track Shell 

Screenings 250 
Sand 

140 Tons $56.79 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $74.016 

 

GROUP 8 - RYE SEED   
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray 
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 Big Earth 
Landscape Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource 

Recovery, Inc a 
Veransa Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer 
& Chemical 

Company, Inc 

SiteOne 
Landscape Supply 

The SOS Team 

Line Item Description Estimated Annual 
Usage by Unit 

Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost 

8.01 3 Way Blend 
Perennial Rye 

Seed 

720 50 lb. Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.15 $44.412 

8.02 Double Eagle Rye 
Seed 

50 50 lb. Bag No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.35 $51.816 

 

GROUP 9 - CATALOG DISCOUNT   

 Big Earth 
Landscape 

Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource 
Recovery, 

Inc a 
Veransa 

Company 

Ewing 
Irrigation 
Products 

Inc 

Howard 
Fertilizer & 
Chemical 
Company, 

Inc 

SiteOne 
Landscape 

Supply 

The SOS 
Team 

Line 
Item 

Description Unit of 
Measure 

Percentage 
Amount 

Percentage 
Amount 

Percentage 
Amount 

Percentage 
Amount 

Percentage 
Amount 

Percentage 
Amount 

9.01 Percentage off Catalog for Group 1: Ballfield Clay Percentage No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid 5% 

9.02 Percentage off Catalog for Group 2: Turface Percentage No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid No Bid 5% 

9.03 Percentage off Catalog for Group 3: Infield Top 
Dressing/Conditioners 

Percentage No Bid No Bid 15% No Bid No Bid 5% 

9.04 Percentage off Catalog for Group 4: Top Dressing Sand Percentage No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 

9.05 Percentage off Catalog for Group 5: Field Marking Chalk Percentage No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid 5% 

9.06 Percentage off Catalog for Group 6: Mound & Plate Clay Percentage No Bid No Bid 20% No Bid No Bid 5% 
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 Big Earth 
Landscape 

Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource 
Recovery, 

Inc a 
Veransa 

Company 

Ewing 
Irrigation 
Products 

Inc 

Howard 
Fertilizer & 
Chemical 
Company, 

Inc 

SiteOne 
Landscape 

Supply 

The SOS 
Team 

Line 
Item 

Description Unit of 
Measure 

Percentage 
Amount 

Percentage 
Amount 

Percentage 
Amount 

Percentage 
Amount 

Percentage 
Amount 

Percentage 
Amount 

9.07 Percentage off Catalog for Group 7: Warning Track 
Material 

Percentage No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 

9.08 Percentage off Catalog for Group 8: Rye Seed Percentage No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 5% 

9.09 Percentage off Catalog for items not listed above Percentage No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15% 5% 
 

VENDOR QUESTIONNAIRE PASS/FAIL 

Question Title Big Earth Landscape 
Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource Recovery, 

Inc a Veransa 
Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer & 
Chemical Company, 

Inc 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply 

The SOS Team 

Exceptions Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 
Exceptions Taken No Response No Response No Response No Response No Response No Response 

Additional Materials Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 
Description of 

Additional Materials 
No Response No Response No Response No Response No Response No Response 

Certified Business Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 
Certified Business 

Type 
No Response No Response No Response No Response No Response Pass 

Certifying Agency No Response No Response No Response No Response No Response Pass 
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Question Title Big Earth Landscape 
Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource Recovery, 

Inc a Veransa 
Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer & 
Chemical Company, 

Inc 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply 

The SOS Team 

Certification 
Documentation 

No Response No Response No Response No Response No Response Pass 

Vendor Certification Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 
E-Verify System 

Certification 
Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 

References Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 
Scrutinized Company 

Certification 
Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Compliance with 
Anti-Human 

Trafficking Laws 

Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 

W-9 Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 
Upload Product 

labels and/or Safety 
Data Sheets (SDS) 
per Section 4.3, 

Vendor 
Responsibility 

 Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 

Does your bid 
contain Substitutions 

and Proven 
Equivalents? 

Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass Pass 
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Question Title Big Earth Landscape 
Supply 

Consolidated 
Resource Recovery, 

Inc a Veransa 
Company 

Ewing Irrigation 
Products Inc 

Howard Fertilizer & 
Chemical Company, 

Inc 

SiteOne Landscape 
Supply 

The SOS Team 

Upload Substitutions 
and Proven 

Equivalents, per 
section 4.8 

Substitutions and 
Proven Equivalents 

No Response No Response No Response No Response Pass No Response 
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