City of Clearwater

Procurement

Jay Ravins, Department Director
100 South Myrtle Avenue, Clearwater, FL 33756

SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS
Primary award cells are green and Backup award cells are gray

Agni Enterprises, LLC (dba) Head to

EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB No. 11-25
Swimming Pool Chemicals

RESPONSE DEADLINE: March 13, 2025 at 10:00 am
Report Generated: Wednesday, April 9, 2025

Aqua Triangle 1 Corp Commercial Energy Specialists, LLC Harcros Chemicals Inc

Heels Safety Supplies (A division of Aquafinity)
Line Iltem Description | Quantity = PerUnit | Unit Cost | Delivery Form Unit Cost | Delivery Form Unit Cost  Delivery Form Unit Cost  Delivery Form
Location Location Location Location
1 Accutabs 3" 26 60 Ib. $331.59 CP, CLP Tablets $297.95 Tablets $262.41 CP, CLP Tablets No Bid CP, CLP Tablets
Calcium bucket
Hypochlorite
2 Big Splash 40 22 |b. bag No Bid RN, NG Fiber $128.66 RN, NG Fiber No Bid RN, NG Fiber
Aquapearl (for filter
tank)
3 Calcium 75 50 Ib. bags | $51.77 CB, NG, Granular Granular CB, NG, Granular CB, NG, Granular
Chloride RN RN RN RN
(Hardness
for pool
surface)
4 Calcium 4 100 Ib. $239.70 CB, NG, | Granular | $395.95 CB, NG, | Granular | $413.88 CB, NG, | Granular | Sierefe) CB, NG, | Granular
Hypochlorite drum (use RN RN RN RN
(shock) in outdoor
pools
only)




EVALUATION TABULATION
ITB No. 11-25
Swimming Pool Chemicals

Agni Enterprises, LLC (dba) Head to Aqua Triangle 1 Corp Commercial Energy Specialists, LLC Harcros Chemicals Inc
Heels Safety Supplies (A division of Aquafinity)
Line ltem Description | Quantity = PerUnit | Unit Cost | Delivery Form Unit Cost | Delivery Form Unit Cost  Delivery Form Unit Cost  Delivery Form
Location Location Location Location
5 Cyanuric 24 50 Ib. $203.58 CB,MS, | Granular | $188.95 CB,MS, | Granular [SEVAESS Granular $99.50 CB, MS, | Granular
Acid drum (use RN, NG
(Stabilizer) in outdoor
pools
only)
6 Cyanuric 1 100 Ib. $180.43 Various Granular Various Granular [FSEEEI0) Various Granular Various Granular
Acid drum (use
(Stabilizer) in outdoor
pools
only)
7 Jack's Magic 40 22 Ib. bag | $159.95 $144.95 $128.66 CB, MS Fiber No Bid CB, MS Fiber
filter (for filter
tank)
8 Muriatic 55 55 -gallon | $507.56 LC Liquid $402.10 LC Liquid $208.00 LC Liquid
Acid drums
9 Muriatic 75 15-gallon | $252.55 | CLP,CP, | Liquid [SSEEMSN CLP,CP, | Liquid | $202.55 | CLP,CP, | Liquid SSZMOMN CLP,CP, | Liquid
Acid drums LC LC LC LC
10 Muriatic 35 4x1 CB, LC, Liquid $30.00 CB, LC, Liquid $28.72 CB, LC, Liquid No Bid CB, LC, Liquid
Acid gallon NG, RN NG, RN NG, RN NG, RN
(case)
11 Muriatic 35 1-gallon $16.82 Various Liquid No Bid Various Liquid $13.64 Various Liquid No Bid Various Liquid
Acid
12 Pool 25 1- gallon $138.15 CB, LC, Liquid CB, LC, Liquid $76.874 CB, LC, Liquid No Bid CB, LC, Liquid
Enzymes NG, RN NG, RN NG, RN NG, RN
(cleaner)
13 Pool 5 15-gallon [SHMOZERER  LC, NG Liquid No Bid LC, NG Liquid [EEEFAM LC, NG Liquid No Bid LC, NG Liquid
Enzymes drum
(cleaner)
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EVALUATION TABULATION

ITB No. 11-25

Swimming Pool Chemicals

Line Item Description | Quantity

Per Unit

Agni Enterprises, LLC (dba) Head to

Heels Safety Supplies

Unit Cost

Delivery

Location

Form ‘ Unit Cost

Delivery

Location

Aqua Triangle 1 Corp

Form

Commercial Energy Specialists, LLC

(A division of Aquafinity)

Unit Cost

Delivery
Location

Form

Harcros Chemicals Inc

Unit Cost

Delivery
Location

Form

Sodium 50 Ib. bags Granular Granular $39.88 Granular $25.00 Granular
Bicarbonate MS, NG, MS, NG, MS, NG,
(baking RN RN RN
soda)
15 Sodium 50 50 Ib. bag | $292.49 CB, LC, Granular | $155.95 CB, LC, Granular [SlerAo) Granular CB, LC, Granular
Thiosulfate or drum MS, NG, MS, NG, MS, NG,
(Chlorine RN RN RN
Neutralizer)
16 Sulfuric Acid 1 1- gallon $29.04 ‘ Various Liquid No Bid Various Liquid Various Various Liquid
17 Sulfuric Acid 75 15-gallon $748.80 CB, MS, Liquid CB, MS, Liquid No Bid CB, MS, Liquid No Bid CB, MS, Liquid
drums NG,RN NG,RN NG,RN NG,RN
18 Sulfuric Acid 1 55 - gallon | $2,404.80 | Various Liquid No Bid Various Liquid No Bid Various Liquid $360.00 Various Liquid
drums
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