City of Clearwater
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Jay Ravins, Department Director
100 South Myrtle Avenue, Clearwater, FL 33756
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https://www.ferguson.com/industry-solutions/waterworks
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[FERGUSON ENTERPRISES LLC] RESPONSE DOCUMENT REPORT
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Potable and Reclaimed Water Meters

ADDENDA CONFIRMATION

No addenda issued

QUESTIONNAIRE

1. Exceptions*

Proposers shall indicate any and all exceptions taken to the provisions or specifications in this solicitation document. Exceptions that
surface elsewhere and that do not also appear under this section shall be considered invalid and void and of no contractual
significance.

Do you have any exceptions to the provisions or specifications?

No

2. Additional Materials*
Have you included any additional materials?

No

3. Certified Business*
Are you a Certified Small Business or a Certified Minority, Woman or Disadvantaged Business Enterprise?

No

4. Vendor Certification*
By submitting this response, the Vendor hereby certifies that:

A. ltis under no legal prohibition on contracting with the City of Clearwater.
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B. It has read, understands, and is in compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions stated herein, as well as its
attachments, and any referenced documents.

C. It has no known, undisclosed conflicts of interest.

D. The prices offered were independently developed without consultation or collusion with any of the other vendors or potential
vendors or any other anti-competitive practices.

E. No offer of gifts, payments or other consideration were made to any City employee, officer, elected official, or consultant who
has or may have had a role in the procurement process for the commodities or services covered by this contract. The Vendor
has not influenced or attempted to influence any City employee, officer, elected official, or consultant in connection with the
award of this contract.

F. It understands the City may copy all parts of this response, including without limitation any documents or materials copyrighted
by the Vendor, for internal use in evaluating respondent’s offer, or in response to a public records request under Florida’s public
records law (F.S. Chapter 119) or other applicable law, subpoena, or other judicial process; provided that the City agrees not to
change or delete any copyright or proprietary notices.

G. It hereby warrants to the City that the Vendor and its subcontractors will comply with, and are contractually obligated to comply
with, all federal, state, and local laws, rules, regulations, and executive orders.

H. It certifies that Vendor is not presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, voluntarily excluded,
or disqualified from participation in this matter from any federal, state, or local agency.

l. It will provide the commodities or services specified in compliance with all federal, state, and local laws, rules, regulations, and
executive orders if awarded by the City.

J. ltiscurrentin all obligations due to the City.

K. It will accept all terms and conditions as set forth in this solicitation if awarded by the City.

L. Thesignatory is an officer or duly authorized representative of the Vendor with full power and authority to submit binding offers
and enter into contracts for the commodities or services as specified herein.

Confirmed
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5. E-Verify System Certification*
PER FLORIDA STATUTE 448.095, CONTRACTORS AND SUBCONTRACTORS MUST REGISTER WITH AND USE THE E-VERIFY SYSTEM TO
VERIFY THE WORK AUTHORIZATION STATUS OF ALL NEWLY HIRED EMPLOYEES.

The affiant, by virtue of confirming below, certifies that:

A. The Contractor and its Subcontractors are aware of the requirements of Florida Statute 448.095.

B. The Contractor and its Subcontractors are registered with and using the E-Verify system to verify the work authorization status
of newly hired employees.

C. The Contractor will not enter into a contract with any Subcontractor unless each party to the contract registers with and uses
the E-Verify system.

D. The Subcontractor will provide the Contractor with an affidavit stating that the Subcontractor does not employ, contract with,
or subcontract with unauthorized alien.

E. The Contractor must maintain a copy of such affidavit.

F. The City may terminate this Contract on the good faith belief that the Contractor or its Subcontractors knowingly violated Florida
Statutes 448.09(1) or 448.095(2)(c).

G. If this Contract is terminated pursuant to Florida Statute 448.095(2)(c), the Contractor may not be awarded a public contract for
at least 1 year after the date on which this Contract was terminated.

H. The Contractor is liable for any additional cost incurred by the City as a result of the termination of this Contract.

Confirmed

6. NSF International certification letter*
screencapture-info-nsf-org-Certified-PwsComponents-Listings-asp-2025-10-17-09_54 22.pdf

7. References*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

REFERENCES.pdf
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https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/118514/e1c890c0-5d5c-470a-85f3-c4c806b0aa36_REFERENCES.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4O47Q5HBA%2F20260217%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20260217T152123Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEIf%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJIMEYCIQC2QzYRUXbvv9nezRY7Do7MDoXlY5oI7eyHxpnFIjyS7gIhAJ2DRsteSg%2Ffh3s%2FDDXTcjT9sYNv9NurapQXLkkcCIq%2BKoUFCE8QAhoMODkyMzY0Njg3NjcyIgwT3rLrs2MVg%2FJW5Rkq4gQRPPtaoIRBSo07vpDiYCHNPXcN9XwGWrPfC7uVqx8VXak%2FVpU3DVY2BJJW2MxOdabR%2FtbdZaDw6qgBO4FePT7xEiQqFYUxiwoCQ991TYOPx1A1MTeAmOhgFY2eF34%2FPANYnJV0%2BY0dJIv63mnCxhNUrJU1WR6jpk%2B2o%2BvgJXykyhkI8zLFJYvjj%2Fp7JQ04NDCOx9d%2BADD65Ml9U3hdvIkuWsSsESeA3LsAL1HeyeBfAuvJqq%2F4Frv1PoopfgDGFi1bBzN05F%2FLkv4yEuvf89kv9o729IvdbgEEukINSap9v58M8ECUF%2F5k9RAKA%2FjLUYplNGCBc0b0qvwmS2TQinth3EWTXgfR8MksPrTXrpw%2B7Ss5rCN1wujDm2MJhZb9UD4zo1Hfn8Pkw5EGHtRpccSiPKmqgjAIJrRgrMHElJKmaf9e2a1Tk8iTxPwqw68lbAn85p2ey999q3mJmRnlAf6nwyF10PoRH8HTlQJKQy6Ts%2BgbZbdd41FEgKX8kcIUS9avAUgT6OwUSPprda1P7FNwM7Zv4Wgkwjs9pLXNfqsyQmDtW5TzdHQWBljRZQFaovMbNE5qrmfPcRQYdTUyYaDVwv1Sh9xYnRhTrNBTI7uIYeXiMQx%2FoapRP4iZsgaDSjkFWJU6uVuBYtmSW9kjSTPDsrYG7ZQbkt%2FCKpjKjvjRJPu5L0qiaCZfsPrhVT%2FttaTsh3p8Q9hiB5vQZw5UzaIvQ5i9lX%2BDkIOlAu3%2BM2H%2FggwJxjG6uq6e4KfvHXRHGv25avbYFmDOYrqoEvtqNukp8He0ZDzSZ%2BjE4Mrk8%2FI2v8H1MJ%2Fx0cwGOpgBlrj02JevUQ2fSX%2FNgUdw%2B5ruIj9iJNDZ7KZXYor19tzefU6YBRk7JhMa2M1Ow8%2F2uptKSctKMZYoPV7zfiv9%2FfGk%2FkVMFNREjXfRTIkOhymmpB9g9HayxhSM0AlMntdShLlsrrwBflRVJS%2FsfdkWLJnYBCE6bPrQhquliXz3PO8%2FiRB4LoQ15YNALsc9kYD2dkVHq3GvFxA%3D&X-Amz-Signature=39b3c12e395eb505c3f67afa965d2fd96466bc880f62a31ccf502752fab24c12&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22REFERENCES.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
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Customer_References_City_of Clearwater_from_2022.pdf
8. Scrutinized Company Certification*
Please download the below documents, complete, notarize, and upload.
e SCRUTINIZED COMPANIES AND B...
SCRUTINIZED_COMPANIES _AND_BUSINESS OPERATIONS_CERTIFICATION.pdf

9. Compliance with Anti-Human Trafficking Laws*
Please download the below documents, complete, and upload.

e Compliance with 787.06 form...

Compliance_with_787.06_form_.pdf

10. W-9*
Upload your current W-9 form. (available at https://www.irs.gov/pub/irs-pdf/fw9.pdf)

FERGUSON_ENTERPRISES, LLC_W-9_&_ DBA_Subsidiary_List.pdf

PRICE TABLES
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https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/106620/d78d78ab-def1-4d4e-8af0-8c51835525ce_SCRUTINIZED_COMPANIES_AND_BUSINESS_OPERATIONS_CERTIFICATION.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4O47Q5HBA%2F20260217%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20260217T152123Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEIf%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJIMEYCIQC2QzYRUXbvv9nezRY7Do7MDoXlY5oI7eyHxpnFIjyS7gIhAJ2DRsteSg%2Ffh3s%2FDDXTcjT9sYNv9NurapQXLkkcCIq%2BKoUFCE8QAhoMODkyMzY0Njg3NjcyIgwT3rLrs2MVg%2FJW5Rkq4gQRPPtaoIRBSo07vpDiYCHNPXcN9XwGWrPfC7uVqx8VXak%2FVpU3DVY2BJJW2MxOdabR%2FtbdZaDw6qgBO4FePT7xEiQqFYUxiwoCQ991TYOPx1A1MTeAmOhgFY2eF34%2FPANYnJV0%2BY0dJIv63mnCxhNUrJU1WR6jpk%2B2o%2BvgJXykyhkI8zLFJYvjj%2Fp7JQ04NDCOx9d%2BADD65Ml9U3hdvIkuWsSsESeA3LsAL1HeyeBfAuvJqq%2F4Frv1PoopfgDGFi1bBzN05F%2FLkv4yEuvf89kv9o729IvdbgEEukINSap9v58M8ECUF%2F5k9RAKA%2FjLUYplNGCBc0b0qvwmS2TQinth3EWTXgfR8MksPrTXrpw%2B7Ss5rCN1wujDm2MJhZb9UD4zo1Hfn8Pkw5EGHtRpccSiPKmqgjAIJrRgrMHElJKmaf9e2a1Tk8iTxPwqw68lbAn85p2ey999q3mJmRnlAf6nwyF10PoRH8HTlQJKQy6Ts%2BgbZbdd41FEgKX8kcIUS9avAUgT6OwUSPprda1P7FNwM7Zv4Wgkwjs9pLXNfqsyQmDtW5TzdHQWBljRZQFaovMbNE5qrmfPcRQYdTUyYaDVwv1Sh9xYnRhTrNBTI7uIYeXiMQx%2FoapRP4iZsgaDSjkFWJU6uVuBYtmSW9kjSTPDsrYG7ZQbkt%2FCKpjKjvjRJPu5L0qiaCZfsPrhVT%2FttaTsh3p8Q9hiB5vQZw5UzaIvQ5i9lX%2BDkIOlAu3%2BM2H%2FggwJxjG6uq6e4KfvHXRHGv25avbYFmDOYrqoEvtqNukp8He0ZDzSZ%2BjE4Mrk8%2FI2v8H1MJ%2Fx0cwGOpgBlrj02JevUQ2fSX%2FNgUdw%2B5ruIj9iJNDZ7KZXYor19tzefU6YBRk7JhMa2M1Ow8%2F2uptKSctKMZYoPV7zfiv9%2FfGk%2FkVMFNREjXfRTIkOhymmpB9g9HayxhSM0AlMntdShLlsrrwBflRVJS%2FsfdkWLJnYBCE6bPrQhquliXz3PO8%2FiRB4LoQ15YNALsc9kYD2dkVHq3GvFxA%3D&X-Amz-Signature=b9328d22e736c31bec7534f7c4c263d84abe46688061ffcbd766dad69e0858cb&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22SCRUTINIZED_COMPANIES_AND_BUSINESS_OPERATIONS_CERTIFICATION.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://government-project.s3.us-west-2.amazonaws.com/118514/954cc164-f3c1-4e40-bda0-893632de7f84_Compliance_with_787.06_form_.pdf?X-Amz-Algorithm=AWS4-HMAC-SHA256&X-Amz-Content-Sha256=UNSIGNED-PAYLOAD&X-Amz-Credential=ASIA47RIURE4O47Q5HBA%2F20260217%2Fus-west-2%2Fs3%2Faws4_request&X-Amz-Date=20260217T152123Z&X-Amz-Expires=72000&X-Amz-Security-Token=IQoJb3JpZ2luX2VjEIf%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2F%2FwEaCXVzLXdlc3QtMiJIMEYCIQC2QzYRUXbvv9nezRY7Do7MDoXlY5oI7eyHxpnFIjyS7gIhAJ2DRsteSg%2Ffh3s%2FDDXTcjT9sYNv9NurapQXLkkcCIq%2BKoUFCE8QAhoMODkyMzY0Njg3NjcyIgwT3rLrs2MVg%2FJW5Rkq4gQRPPtaoIRBSo07vpDiYCHNPXcN9XwGWrPfC7uVqx8VXak%2FVpU3DVY2BJJW2MxOdabR%2FtbdZaDw6qgBO4FePT7xEiQqFYUxiwoCQ991TYOPx1A1MTeAmOhgFY2eF34%2FPANYnJV0%2BY0dJIv63mnCxhNUrJU1WR6jpk%2B2o%2BvgJXykyhkI8zLFJYvjj%2Fp7JQ04NDCOx9d%2BADD65Ml9U3hdvIkuWsSsESeA3LsAL1HeyeBfAuvJqq%2F4Frv1PoopfgDGFi1bBzN05F%2FLkv4yEuvf89kv9o729IvdbgEEukINSap9v58M8ECUF%2F5k9RAKA%2FjLUYplNGCBc0b0qvwmS2TQinth3EWTXgfR8MksPrTXrpw%2B7Ss5rCN1wujDm2MJhZb9UD4zo1Hfn8Pkw5EGHtRpccSiPKmqgjAIJrRgrMHElJKmaf9e2a1Tk8iTxPwqw68lbAn85p2ey999q3mJmRnlAf6nwyF10PoRH8HTlQJKQy6Ts%2BgbZbdd41FEgKX8kcIUS9avAUgT6OwUSPprda1P7FNwM7Zv4Wgkwjs9pLXNfqsyQmDtW5TzdHQWBljRZQFaovMbNE5qrmfPcRQYdTUyYaDVwv1Sh9xYnRhTrNBTI7uIYeXiMQx%2FoapRP4iZsgaDSjkFWJU6uVuBYtmSW9kjSTPDsrYG7ZQbkt%2FCKpjKjvjRJPu5L0qiaCZfsPrhVT%2FttaTsh3p8Q9hiB5vQZw5UzaIvQ5i9lX%2BDkIOlAu3%2BM2H%2FggwJxjG6uq6e4KfvHXRHGv25avbYFmDOYrqoEvtqNukp8He0ZDzSZ%2BjE4Mrk8%2FI2v8H1MJ%2Fx0cwGOpgBlrj02JevUQ2fSX%2FNgUdw%2B5ruIj9iJNDZ7KZXYor19tzefU6YBRk7JhMa2M1Ow8%2F2uptKSctKMZYoPV7zfiv9%2FfGk%2FkVMFNREjXfRTIkOhymmpB9g9HayxhSM0AlMntdShLlsrrwBflRVJS%2FsfdkWLJnYBCE6bPrQhquliXz3PO8%2FiRB4LoQ15YNALsc9kYD2dkVHq3GvFxA%3D&X-Amz-Signature=0187c90b548304e273f60a443e658f0879f448e1e24eeb6c629136367ef9f571&X-Amz-SignedHeaders=host&response-content-disposition=attachment%3B%20filename%3D%22Compliance_with_787.06_form_.pdf%22&x-id=GetObject
https://www.irs.gov/pub/irs-pdf/fw9.pdf
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Line Descri Quanti Unit of| Unit | Total | No Bid

Item ption ty Measu Cost
re

1 5/8"x 400 | Each [$503.5(5201,4
3/4"D 8 32.00
ouble
Check
Backfl
ow
Meter
laying
length
(71,2
inches
)
Potabl
e
Water

2 5/8 "x Each |No Bid | No Bid X
3/4",
Water
Meter,
Positiv
e
Displa
cemen
t,
Magne
tically
driven,
Potabl
e
Water
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Descri Quanti Unit of| Unit | Total | No Bid

ption ty Measu Cost
re

3 1" Each |No Bid | No Bid X
Water
Meter,
Positiv
e

Displa
cemen
t,
Magne
tically
driven,
Potabl
e

Water

4 11/2", Each |No Bid | No Bid X
Water
Meter,
Positiv
e
Displa
cemen
t,
Magne
tically
driven,
Potabl
e
Water
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Descri Quanti Unit of| Unit | Total | No Bid

ption ty Measu Cost
re

5 2", Each |No Bid | No Bid X
Water
Meter,
Positiv
e

Displa
cemen
t,

Magne
tically
driven,
Potabl
e

Water

6 1", Each |No Bid | No Bid X
Water
Meter,
Positiv
e
Displa
cemen
t,
Magne
tically
driven,
Reclai
med
Water
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Line Descri Quanti Unit of| Unit | Total | No Bid

Item ption ty Measu Cost
re

7 2", Each |No Bid | No Bid X
Water
Meter,
Positiv
e
Displa
cemen
t,
Magne
tically
driven,
Reclai
med
Water

TOTAL $201,4
32.00
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CLOSE WINDOW TO EXIT NSF LISTINGS

The Public Health and Safety Organization

NSF Product and Service Listings

These MSF Official Listings are current as of Friday, October 17, 2025 at 12:15 a.m. Eastern Time. Please contact M5F to confirm the status of any Listing, report errors, or make suggestions.

Alert: N5F is concerned about fraudulent downloading and manipulation of website text. Always confirm this information by clicking on the below link for the most accurate information:
http:/ finfo.nsf.org/ Certified /PwsComponents/ Listings.asp?Company=409408:5tandard=061&

NSF/ANSI/CAN 61
Drinking Water System Components - Health Effects

NOTE: Unless otherwise indicated for Materials, Certification is only for the Water Contact Material shown in the Listing. Click here for a list of Abbreviations used in these Listings. Click here for
the definitions of Water Contact Temperatures denoted in these Listings. Products certified to NSF/ANSI/CAM 61 comply with the health effects criteria in NSF/ANSI/CAN 600.

Neptune Technology Group, Inc.

1600 Alabama Highway 229
Tallaszee, AL 36078

United States
334-283-7321

Facility : Tallassee, AL

Mechanical Devices

Water Water
Contact Contact
Trade Designation Size Temp Material

Water Meters[1] [G]

Mach10 EUTXCCHBIX[Z] 625" - 1" CLD 23 MLTPL
Mach10 EUTICGHBZH[Z] 625" - 1" CLD 23 MLTPL
Meptune Agquity Meter 5/8 -7 CLD 23 MLTPL
Meptune HP Tru/Flo Compound Meters ra CLD 23 MLTPL
Neptune HP Turbine Meters -1 CLD 23 MLTPL
Neptune HP Turbine Meters 1.5"-2° CLD 23 MLTPL
Neptune MACH 10[3] 5/8-12" CLD 23 MLTPL
Meptune Strainers 1.5" - 10" CLD 23 MLTPL
Neptune T-10 Meters 5/8°-2° CLD 23 MLTPL
Meptune Tru/Fle Compound Meters - CLD 23 MLTPL
Meptune® HP Protectus Il Meter Assembly 4" - 10" CLD 23 MLTPL
Meptune® HP Protectus lIl § Meter Assembly 4" - 10 CLD 23 MLTPL

[1

Only products bearing the NSF Mark on the product, product packaging, and/or
documentation shipped with the product are Certified.
EULXOO0E 00

X1 - Size

X2 - Technology

X3 - Consumption Rate

X4 - Options

B - Machl@

X5 - Pressure (1 - No, 2 - Yes)

X6 - Switch (A = remote shut off valve)

The trade name may be followed by an alpha character (A-I), which denotes the following
connection size x

length and type:

- 1-1/2 x 13 flange

1-1/2 x 18 flange

- 1-1/2 x 12-5/8 screw

- 1-1/2 x 12-5/8 thread

-2 17 flange

1@ flange

15-1/4 flange

15-1/4 screw

15-1/4 thread

12 flange

17 flange

14 flange

20 flange

18 flange

24 flange

28 flange

1@ x 26 flange

12 x 19 flange

Product is Certified to NSF/ANSI/CAN 372 and conforms with the lead content reguirements

[z

[3

GG o fs B Wk R R RS
Mo oM oM oM oM oMM oM oM oMM

[G




for "lead free® plumbing as defined by California, Vermont, Maryland, and Louisiana
state laws and the U.S. Safe Drinking Water Act.

Mumber of matching Manufacturers is 1
Mumber of matching Products is 12
Processing time was 0 seconds

CONNECT WITHKSF | k8. ﬁ m '“B‘

2012 MSF International. All rights reserved.




REFERENCES

Instructions: The bidder shall submit a minimum of three (3) customer references forwhich the vendor
has recently performed similar services within the last two (2) years. Additional pages may be added, if
needed.

Complete and return with bid submittal.

Reference # 1

Project Name: Manatee County Utilities Contract Value:

Date Began: Date Completed: Ongoing
Address 4410 66th Street West

City / State /ZIp Bradenton FL 34210

Contact Person: Matt Vanlandingham Email: | a4t vanlandingham@mymanatee.org
Phone: 941-792-881 ext. 5401 | Fa%:

Notes: Manatee County Utilities purchases Neptune water meter products off of their contract annually including

T10 Positive Displacement water meters and ProCoder registers. Manatee County has an ongoing meter
replacement program.

Reference # 2

Proj N : . Value:

roject Name Clty of Lakeland Contract Value
Date Began: Date Completed: Ongoing
Address

1140 East Parker Street
City / State / Zip Lakeland FL 33801
Contact Person: . Email: .
David Klue david.klue@lakelandgov.net

Phone: 863-834-6708 Fax:
Notes: The City of Lakeland purchases Neptune water meter products off of their contract annually including

T10 Positive Displacement water meters and ProCoder registers. The City of Lakeland has an ongoing
meter replacement program.

Reference # 3
Project Name:

Hernando County Utilities Contract Value:

D Began: D mpl : .
ate Bega ate Completed Ongoing
Addr
ddress 15365 Cortez Blvd
City / State / Zip Brooksville FL 34613
Contact Person: : Email: : .
Josh Martin jmartin@hernandocounty.us
Phone: Fax:
352-754-4490
Notes: Hernando County Utilities purchases Neptune water meter products off of their contract annually including
T10 Positive Displacement water meters and ProCoder registers. The City of Lakeland has an ongoing
meter replacement program.
Vendor Name Ferguson Waterworks Date:

POTABLE & RECLAIMED WATER METERS 28 ITB #50-22




SCRUTINIZED COMPANIES FORMS

SCRUTINIZED COMPANIES AND BUSINESS OPERATIONS WITH
CUBA AND SYRIA CERTIFICATION FORM
IF YOUR BID/PROPOSAL IS $1,000,000 OR MORE, THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND
SUBMITTED WITH THE BID/PROPOSAL. FAILURE TO SUBMIT THIS FORM AS REQUIRED MAY
DEEM YOUR SUBMITTAL NONRESPONSIVE.

The affiant, by virtue of the signature below, certifies that:

1. The vendor, company, individual, principal, subsidiary, affiliate, or owner is aware of the requirements
of section 287.135, Florida Statutes, regarding companies on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan
List, the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Energy Sector List, or engaging in business
operations in Cuba and Syria; and

2. The vendor, company, individual, principal, subsidiary, affiliate, or owner is eligible to participate in this
solicitation and is not listed on either the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List, the Scrutinized
Companies with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Sector List, or engaged in business operations in Cuba and
Syria; and

3. Business Operations means, for purposes specifically related to Cuba or Syria, engaging in commerce
in any form in Cuba or Syria, including, but not limited to, acquiring, developing, maintaining, owning, selling,
possessing, leasing or operating equipment, facilities, personnel, products, services, personal property, real
property, military equipment, or any other apparatus of business or commerce; and

4. If awarded the Contract (or Agreement), the vendor, company, individual, principal, subsidiary, affiliate,
or owner will immediately notify the City of Clearwater in writing, no later than five (5) calendar days after any of
its principals are placed on the Scrutinized Companies with Activities in Sudan List, the Scrutinized Companies
with Activities in the Iran Petroleum Sector List, or engaged in business operations in Cuba and Syria.

Wplfhewr Kiyzo

Authorized Signature

Matthew Rizzo
Printed Name

Director of Meter and Automation
Title

Ferguson Enterprises LLC, dba Ferguson Waterworks
Name of Entity/Corporation

STATE OF Texas

COUNTY OF  Tarrant

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me by means of [ physical presence or ¥ online

notarization on, this _27th day of October , 2025 , by Matthew Rizzo
(name of person whose signature is being notarized) as the Director of Meter and Automation(title) of
Ferguson Enterprises LLC, dba Ferguson Waterworks  (name of corporation/entity), personally known , or
produced _ DRIVER LICENSE (type of identification) as identification, and who did/did not take
an.oath Notary Public, State of Texas
iy,
%&“\,\:\:ﬁ‘ Pltlz///':’//@/ John D Clark
A R
5. N — Notary Public /
2% RIS 13240917-9
XGRS COMMISSION EXPIRES Printed Name
///’//////umu\\\\\\\\\\\\\ March 18, 2028

My Commission EXpires: 03/18/2028
NOTARY SEAL ABOVE

Electronically signed and notarized online using the Proof platform.



AuditTrailVersion = 1.1 proof.com

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:57:53 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: Electronically signed and notarized online using the Proof platform.
Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 188.9333203125, 36.10664062500018
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:57:37 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Seal Added

Notarial Act: acknowledgement

Annotation Type: image

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 70.533330078125, 179.0399804687502
Notarial Act Principals: 1c33b133-3f41-4f14-9518-61703b887b03
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:57:33 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: 03/18/2028

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 202.8, 100.6399804687501
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:57:30 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: John D Clark

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 347.86666015625, 148.6399804687501
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:57:26 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: Notary Public, State of Texas

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 373.99998046875, 187.0399609374999
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:57:25 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Signature Added

Signature Type: Image

Annotation Type: vector_graphic

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 300.4, 187.5733203125001
Witness Names:

ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:57:24 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: DRIVER LICENSE

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 132.399990234375, 193.4399609375
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:57:16 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Text Updated

Text: Director of Meter and Automation

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 362.26666015625, 215.8399609375
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:57:12 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Annotation Type: text
Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 362.26666015625, 215.8399609375

ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:57:01 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Text Updated

Text: Ferguson Enterprises LLC, dba Ferguson Waterworks

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 18.79999267578125, 203.5733203125001
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:56:57 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Annotation Type: text
Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 18.79999267578125, 203.5733203125001

ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:56:53 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Deleted

Annotation Gid: at2a4e9129-9997-4149-a213-b083c30809c4

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 21.99999267578125, 202.506640625
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:56:47 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Annotation Type: text
Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 21.99999267578125, 202.506640625

ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:56:39 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: Matthew Rizzo

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 420.93333984375, 227.5733007812501
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:56:31 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: 2025

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 266.0, 227.5733007812501
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:56:31 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: 27th

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 166.0, 227.5733007812501
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:56:31 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: October

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 216.0, 227.5733007812501
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:56:30 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Annotation Type: checkmark
Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 504.66666015625, 253.17330078125

ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:56:27 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: Tarrant

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 150.0, 263.83998046875
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:56:26 UTC
Matthew Rizzo

customer

Signature Added

Signature Type: Image

Annotation Type: vector_graphic

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 318.0, 428.0
Witness Names:

ProofSignerWeb

98.250.18.134

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:56:25 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: Texas

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 2, Page Type: doc, Point: 142.533330078125, 287.83998046875
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:55:18 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: Electronically signed and notarized online using the Proof platform.
Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 151.6, 23.57332031250007
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:55:05 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Seal Added

Notarial Act: acknowledgement

Annotation Type: image

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 50.26666015625, 195.84
Notarial Act Principals: 1c33b133-3f41-4f14-9518-61703b887b03
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:54:59 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: 03/18/2028

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 195.86666015625, 115.84
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:54:55 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: Notary Public, State of Texas
Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 419.33333984375, 195.83999999999992

ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:54:54 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Signature Added

Signature Type: Image

Annotation Type: vector_graphic

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 328.13333984375, 191.04
Witness Names:

ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:54:52 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: DRIVER LICENSE

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 129.733330078125, 205.9733203124999
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:54:44 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Text Updated

Text: Ferguson Enterprises LLC, dba Ferguson Waterworks
Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 33.7333251953125, 218.24
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:54:40 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Annotation Type: text
Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 33.7333251953125, 218.24

ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:54:22 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Text Updated

Text: Director of Meter and Automation

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 367.06666015625, 230.5066601562501
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:54:17 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Annotation Type: text
Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 367.06666015625, 230.5066601562501

ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:54:04 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: Matthew Rizzo

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 420.93333984375, 242.24
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:53:55 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: 2025

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 270.26666015625, 243.83999999999992
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:53:55 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: 27th

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 170.26666015625, 243.83999999999992
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:53:55 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: October

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 220.26666015625, 243.83999999999992
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:53:53 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Annotation Type: checkmark
Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 503.06666015625, 268.37333984375

ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:53:51 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: Tarrant

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 146.8, 278.5066601562501
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:53:51UTC
Matthew Rizzo

customer

Signature Added

Signature Type: Image

Annotation Type: vector_graphic

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 319.0, 442.0
Witness Names:

ProofSignerWeb

98.250.18.134

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:53:50 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Annotation Added

Text: Texas

Annotation Type: text

Location: Page: 1, Page Type: doc, Point: 139.86666015625, 301.97333984375
ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:53:20 UTC
Matthew Rizzo

customer

Agreed to electronic agreement for signature

ProofSignerWeb

98.250.18.134

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:52:36 UTC
John D Clark

customer

Identification Verified

Pkn: false
Acting User Full Name: John D Clark

ProofSignerWeb

41.90.177.14






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:51:25 UTC
Matthew Rizzo

customer

Document Accessed
Acting User Full Name: Matthew Rizzo
ProofSignerWeb

98.250.18.134

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:51:04 UTC
Matthew Rizzo

customer

Credential Authenticated

ProofSignerWeb

34.67.4.225

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:49:42 UTC
Matthew Rizzo

customer

KBA Passed
Acting User Full Name: Matthew Rizzo
ProofSignerWeb

98.250.18.134

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:49: 1M UTC
Matthew Rizzo

customer

Signing location address updated

Old Address: {“”ne’l“:"","Iinez“:"",“City":"","State":"","postalu:"","COUntry":""}

New Address: {"line1":"","line2":"","city":"Troy
ProofSignerWeb

98.250.18.134

,"state":"MI","postal":"","country":"US"}






Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:48:24 UTC

Matthew Rizzo

customer

Document Accessed

Acting User Full Name: Matthew Rizzo

ProofSignerWeb

98.250.18.134

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

Performed By System Name

IP Address

2025-10-27 11:48:20 UTC
Guest

customer

Document Created
Acting User Full Name: Guest
BusinessAPI

98.250.18.134

Action Timestamp

Performed By User Name
Performed By User Role
Performed By Participant Type
Action Type

Action Description

2025-10-27 11:59:41 UTC
John D Clark

notary

Digital Certificate Applied to Document

Signature Type: Digital

Signature Algorithm: 1.2.840.10045.4.3.2

Certificate Validity Not Before: 2025-09-13 04:52:27 UTC

Certificate Validity Not After: 2026-09-13 05:02:26 UTC

Certificate Serial Number: 1D19F040222C3DAAB3E4DF47BDFCF673

Certificate Issuer: C = US, O = Proof.com, CN = Proof.com Document Signing ECC CA 2

Performed By System Name ProofSignerWeb

IP Address 41.90.177.14







SCRUTINIZED COMPANIES FORMS

SCRUTINIZED COMPANIES THAT BOYCOTT ISRAEL LIST CERTIFICATION FORM

THIS FORM MUST BE COMPLETED AND SUBMITTED WITH THE BID/PROPOSAL.
FAILURE TO SUBMIT THIS FORM AS REQUIRED MAY DEEM YOUR SUBMITTAL
NONRESPONSIVE.

The affiant, by virtue of the signature below, certifies that:

1. The vendor, company, individual, principal, subsidiary, affiliate, or owner is aware of the requirements
of section 287.135, Florida Statutes, regarding companies on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott
Israel List, or engaged in a boycott of Israel; and

2. The vendor, company, individual, principal, subsidiary, affiliate, or owner is eligible to participate in this
solicitation and is not listed on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List, or engaged in a
boycott of Israel; and

3. “Boycaott Israel” or “boycott of Israel” means refusing to deal, terminating business activities, or taking
other actions to limit commercial relations with Israel, or persons or entities doing business in Israel or
in Israeli-controlled territories, in a discriminatory manner. A statement by a company that it is
participating in a boycott of Israel, or that it has initiated a boycott in response to a request for a boycott
of Israel or in compliance with, or in furtherance of, calls for a boycott of Israel, may be considered as
evidence that a company is participating in a boycott of Israel; and

4. If awarded the Contract (or Agreement), the vendor, company, individual, principal, subsidiary, affiliate,
or owner will immediately notify the City of Clearwater in writing, no later than five (5) calendar days
after any of its principals are placed on the Scrutinized Companies that Boycott Israel List, or engaged

in a boycott of Israel.

Authorized Signature

Matthew Rizzo
Printed Name

Director of Meter and Automation

Title
Ferguson Enterprises LLC, dba Ferguson Waterworks

Name of Entity/Corporation

STATE OF __ Texas

COUNTY OF Tarrant

The foregoing instrument was acknowledged before me by means of O physical presence or [Yonline

notarization on, this 27th day of October ,2025 | by Matthew Rizzo

(name of person whose signature is being notarized) as the Director of Meter and Automation (title) of
Ferguson Enterprises LLC, dba Ferguson Waterworks (name of corporation/entity), personally known ,or

produced __ DRIVER LICENSE (type of identification) as identification, and who did/did not take

an.qath tary Public, State of Texas

W

i, -
e, John D Clark Notary Public /
John D Clark

Printed Name

ID NUMBER
13240917-9
COMMISSION EXPIRES

i

7
Wy

////”/’/fmuu\\\\‘\“\\\\\ March 18, 2028
My Commission EXpires: 03/18/2028
NOTARY SEAL ABOVE

Electronically signed and notarized online using the Proof platform.



Compliance with Anti-Human Trafficking Laws

Pursuant to Section 787.06 (13), Florida Statutes, this form must be completed by an officer or
representative of a non-governmental entity when a contract is executed, renewed, or extended

between the non-governmental entity and the City of Clearwater.

The undersigned, on behalf of the entity listed below (“Entity”), hereby attests under penalty of
perjury that:

Entity does not use coercion for labor or services as defined in Section 787.06, Florida Statutes.
The undersigned is authorized to execute this form on behalf of Entity.

Date: October 17 ,20 25 Signed: ,ﬁ‘w/ l%“;/

Ferguson Enterprises LLC, :
Entity: dba Ferguson Waterworks Name: Matthew Rizzo

Title: Director of Meter and Automation




Form w-g

(Rev. October 2018)

Department of the Treasury
Internal Revenue Service

Request for Taxpayer
Identification Number and Certification

P Go to www.irs.gov/FormW9 for instructions and the latest information.

Give Form to the
requester. Do not
send to the IRS.

FERGUSON US HOLDINGS, INC

1 Name (as shown on your income tax return). Name is required on this line; do not leave this line blank.

2 Business name/disregarded entity name, if different from above

FERGUSON ENTERPRISES, LLC (FEIN 54-1211771)

following seven boxes.

[ individua/sole proprietor or C Corporation

single-member LLC

Print or type.

[] Other (see instructions) »

D S Corporation

[:| Limited liability company. Enter the tax classification (C=C corporation, S=S corporation, P=Partnership) >

Note: Check the appropriate box in the line above for the tax classification of the single-member owner. Do not check | Exemption from FATCA reporting
LLC if the LLC is classified as a single-member LLC that is disregarded from the owner unless the owner of the LLC is
another LLC that is not disregarded from the owner for U.S. federal tax purposes. Otherwise, a single-member LLC that
is disregarded from the owner should check the appropriate box for the tax classification of its owner.

3 Check appropriate box for federal tax classification of the person whose name is entered on line 1. Check only one of the | 4 Exemptions (codes apply only to

certain entities, not individuals; see
instructions on page 3):
D Partnership E] Trust/estate

Exempt payee code (if any) 5

code (if any) E

(App'es to accounts maintained outside the U.S.)

5 Address (number, street, and apt. or suite no.) See instructions.

751 LAKEFRONT COMMONS

See Specific Instructions on page 3.

Requester’s name and address (optional)

6 City, state, and ZIP code
NEWPORT NEWS, VA 23606

7 List account number(s) here (optional)

ﬁ Taxpayer Identification Number (TIN)

Enter your TIN in the appropriate box. The TIN provided must match the name given on line 1 to avoid
backup withholding. For individuals, this is generally your social security number (SSN). However, for a
resident alien, sole proprietor, or disregarded entity, see the instructions for Part |, later. For other - -
entities, it is your employer identification number (EIN). If you do not have a number, see How to get a

TIN, later.

Note: If the account is in more than one name, see the instructions for line 1. Also see What Name and

Number To Give the Requester for guidelines on whose number to enter.

Social security number I

or
| Employer identification number

5(4| -|1(4|7|3|3(3(8

Certification

Under penalties of perjury, | certify that:

1. The number shown on this form is my correct taxpayer identification number (or | am waiting for a number to be issued to me); and
2.1 am not subject to backup withholding because: (a) | am exempt from backup withholding, or (b) | have not been notified by the Internal Revenue
Service (IRS) that | am subject to backup withholding as a result of a failure to report all interest or dividends, or (c) the IRS has notified me that | am

no longer subject to backup withholding; and
3. 1am a U.S. citizen or other U.S. person (defined below); and

4. The FATCA code(s) entered on this form (if any) indicating that | am exempt from FATCA reporting is correct.

Certification instructions. You must cross out item 2 above if you have been notified by the IRS that you are currently subject to backup withholding because
you have failed to report all interest and dividends on your tax return. For real estate transactions, item 2 does not apply. For mortgage interest paid,
acquisition or abandonment of secured property, cancellation of debt, contributions to an individual retirement arrangement (IRA), and generally, payments
other than interest and dividends, you are not required to sign the certification, but you must provide your correct TIN. See the instructions for Part I, later.

Sign Signature of
Here U.S. person P

Date > //;0/1,0 2’3

General Instructions

Section references are to the Internal Revenue Code unless otherwise
noted.

Future developments. For the latest information about developments
related to Form W-9 and its instructions, such as legislation enacted
after they were published, go to www.irs.gov/FormWa.

Purpose of Form

An individual or entity (Form W-9 requester) who is required to file an
information return with the IRS must obtain your correct taxpayer
identification number (TIN) which may be your social security number
(SSN), individual taxpayer identification number (ITIN), adoption
taxpayer identification number (ATIN), or employer identification number
(EIN), to report on an information return the amount paid to you, or other
amount reportable on an information return. Examples of information
returns include, but are not limited to, the following.

* Form 1099-INT (interest earned or paid)

4
¢ Form 1099-DIV (dividends, 'réluding those from stocks or mutual
funds)

¢ Form 1099-MISC (various types of income, prizes, awards, or gross
proceeds)

* Form 1099-B (stock or mutual fund sales and certain other
transactions by brokers)

* Form 1099-S (proceeds from real estate transactions)

¢ Form 1099-K (merchant card and third party network transactions)
¢ Form 1098 (home mortgage interest), 1098-E (student loan interest),
1098-T (tuition)

¢ Form 1099-C (canceled debt)

¢ Form 1099-A (acquisition or abandonment of secured property)

Use Form W-8 only if you are a U.S. person (including a resident
alien), to provide your correct TIN.

If you do not return Form W-9 to the requester with a TIN, you might
be subject to backup withholding. See What is backup withholding,
later.

Cat. No. 10231X

Form W-9 (Rev. 10-2018)



Ferguson Enterprises, LLC utilizes the following DBA names;
Current and Former dba Names

Entity Name Tax ID No. Entity Name Tax 1D No.

AP Supply Company 54-1211771 1& G Products 54-2211771
ACF Ervaironmental 54-1211771 1 D Daddano Company 54-1211771
Action Automation 54-1211771 loseph G Poliard Co 541211771
Action Plurnbing Supply 54-1211771 Karl's Apphances 54-1211771
Action Supply Co 541211771 Kitchen Art 54-1231771
ADL 54-1211771 Lighting and Apphance 54-1211771
Arefeo 54-1211771 Lighting Design Center 54-1211771
Alaska Pipe & Supply 54-1211771 Lighting Plus 54-1211771
AMS Steam Products 54-1211771 Lighting Unbkimited 54-1211771
Andrews Lighting & Hardware Gallery 54-1211771 Lincoln Products 54-1211771
BAC Apphance Center 54-1211771 Linwood Pipe and Supply 54-1211771
Bath + Beyond 54-1211771 towsiana Unilities Supply Company 54-1211771
Blackman Plumbing Supply 54-1211771 LUSCo 54-1211771
Brock-McVey 54-1211771 McFarland Supply 54-1211771
Bruce-Rogers Company 54-1211771 Meyer Appltance 54-1211771
Cal-Steam 54-1211771 Michigan Meter 54-1211771
Capital Distributing 54-1211771 Mission Valley Pipe 54-1211771
Caynan Pipe & Supply 54-17211771 Mississippr Utility Supply Co (MUSCO)  54-1211771
CEp 54-3211771 Mouore industrial Supply 54-1211771
City Lights Dessgn Showroom 54-3211771 Oid Dominion Supply 54-1211771
Chine Contract Sales 54-1211771 PL Sourcing 54-1211771
Custom Lighting & Hardware 54-1211771 Plumb Source 54-1211771
Davies Water 54-1211771 Plumbers Supply Company of $t Louis 54-1211771
Dealernet 54-1211771 Plumbing Decor 54-1211771
Dulug Stainless 54-1211771 Pollardwater 54-1211771
Equarlus Waterworks, Meter & Automation Group 54-1211771 Powell Pipe & Supply Co 54-1211771
Factory Direct Appliance 54-1211771 Power Pracess Equipment 54-1211771
Ferguson Bath & Kitchen Gallery 54-1211771 Professional's Bath Source 54-1211771
Ferguson Bath, Kitchen and Lighting Gallery 54-1211771 PV Sullivan Supply 54-1211771
Ferguson Direct 54-1211771 Ramapo Wholesalers 54-1211771
Ferguson Enterprises of Virgima, LIC 54-1211771 Redlon & lohnson 54-31211771
Ferguson Facihtles Supply 54-121177% Reese Kitchen, Bath & Lighting Gallery 541211771
Ferguson Fire & Febrication Jnternational 54-1211771 Rencor Controls 54-12131771
Ferguson Heating & Cooling 54-1211771 Renwes Sales 54-1211771
Ferguson Hosprtality Sales 54-1211771 Robertsan Supply 54-1211771
Ferguson HVAC 54-1211771 Rybak Engineering 54-1211771
Ferguson HVAC - Lyon Conkin 54-1211771 SW Anderson 54.-12131771
Ferguson HVAC- Awr Cold 54-1211771 SG Supply Co 54-1211771
Ferguson HVAC- EastWest Awr 54-1211771 S05 Sales 54-1231771
Ferguson Industral 54-1211771 Sunstate Meter & Supply 54-1231771
Ferguson integrated Services 54-1211771 Tarpon Wholesale Supplies 54-1231771
Ferguson International 54-1211771 The Ar-jay Center 54-1211771
Ferguson Parts & Packaging 54-1211771 The Kitchen Showcase 541231771
Ferguson Valve & Automation 54-1211771 The Plumbing Source 54-1211771
Ferguson Waterworks 54-1211771 The Stack Market 54-1211771
Ferguson Waterwarks EPPCO 541211771 TPW Kitchen & Bath 54-1211771
Ferguson Waterworks international 54-1211771 Triton Environmental 541211771
Ferguson Waterworks Muniaipal Pipe 54-31211771 Uncle Sam Piping Solutions 54-121177%
Ferguson Waterworks - Red Head 54-1211771 Wallwork 54-1211771
Ferguson com 54-1231771 Waterworks Industres 54-1211771
Founders Kitchen and Bath 54-1211771 Webhb Distributors 54-1211771
Galleria Bath & Kitchen Showglace 54-1211771 Western A Supply 541211771
Grand Iunction Pipe 54-1211771 Westfield Lighting 54-1211771
Guanno Distributmg 54-1211771 Wolseley Financiai Services 54-1211771
Henry Kitchen and Bath 54-1211771 Wolseley Industrial Group 54-1211771
Hot Water Products 54-1211771 WPCC Forwarding 54-1211771
industriai Hub of the Carolinas 54-1211771 Wright Plumbsng Supply 54-1211771
Inovative Soll Solutions 54-1211771

***Last updated 01 06 23*+*



FERG# (Maln branch number)
PO Box 100286
Atlanta, GA 30384-0286

FERG# (Maln branch number)
PO Box 417592
Boston, MA 02241-7592

OVERNIGHT - PKGS
Bank of America Lockbox Services

FERG# (Main Branch Number)
Lockbox # 100286

6000 Feldwood Road

College Park, GA 30349

OVERNIGHT - PKGS

Bank of America Lockbox Services
FERG# (Main Branch Number) LB#
417592

MA5-527-02-07
2 Morrissey Blvd.
Dorchester, MA 02125

BOA- Dallas - 847411
FERG# (Main branch number)

PO Box 847411
Dallas, TX 75284-7411

FERG# (Mam branch number)
PO BOX 740827
Los Angeles, CA 90074-0827

OVERNIGHT - PKGS

Bank of America Lockbox Services
FERG# (Main branch number)
Lockbox # 847411

1950 N Stemmons Frwy. Ste. 5010
Dallas, TX 75207

OVERNIGHT - PKGS

Bank of America Lockbox Services
FERG# (Main branch number)
Lockbox # 740827

2706 Media Center Drive

Los Angeles, CA 90065

PNC - Chicago - 802817 Midwest
FERG# (Main branch number)

PO Box 802817

Chicago, IL 60680-2817

PNC - Pittsburgh - 644054
FERG# (Main branch number)

PO Box 644054
Pittsburgh, PA 15264-4054

OVERNIGHT - PKGS

PNC Bank Lockbox Services
FERG# (Main branch number)
Lockbox 802817

350 East Devon Avenue
Itasca, IL 60143

Overnight Address
PNC Bank Lockbox Services

FERG# (Main branch number) LB# 644054

Firstside Center
500 First Avenue
Pittsburgh, PA 15219




£ FERGUSON'

12500 Jefferson Ave
Newport News, VA 23602
757-874-7795

www.ferguson.com

To Whom it May Concern:

Effective March 31, 2019, Ferguson Enterprises, Inc. became Ferguson Enterprises, LL.C
(Ferguson). As a result of the name change, we would like to provide you with the most recent
W-9 Form attached for your records.

This change for Income tax purposes requires the corporate income tax form the LLC to be
reported under the parent company, now Ferguson US Holdings Inc (FUSHI). As a result of this
change all federal documents, like W-9’s and 1099s etc., are required to follow this rule and
therefore, will show the parent company. At the time of the entity conversion Wolseley
Investments Inc. (WII) was Fergusons parent company. Because of this federal W-9 requirement
it was determined that we should also change the parent company name to Ferguson US
Holdings, Inc. for consistency when providing W-9’s to vendors. Effective May 2019, we
changed the name of WII to Ferguson US Holdings, Inc.

Contracts and exemption certificates may still be under Ferguson Enterprises LLC since that is
the company doing the business, however we are unable to provide a W-9 that allows Ferguson
as the company on line 1 will the corresponding EIN. We can provide other backup from the IRS
identifying Ferguson Enterprises LL.C and its corresponding EIN of 54-1211771. Please find
attached a copy of the IRS confirmation letter for Ferguson Enterprises LLC and its EIN. In
addition, the W-9 does provide a section for disregarded entities & DBA’s on line 2 which we
have entered Ferguson Enterprises LLC to show the relationship.

If you have any questions, please feel free to contact me at ask.tax@ferguson.com.

Regards,

Jennier Pabon
Indirect Tax Manager
Ferguson Enterprises LL.C
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FERGUSON BNTERPRISES LLC
12500 JERFERSON AVE
NHEWPORT HBWR VA RBAUZ-4814

Taxpoygr idantifiontipn htmber: B4-121177X
: URZ23G8BSAG

Dear Texpsyere

Taank you fTop ypur correapondance dated Aprdl 8, 2019,

He have updaked veur accaunt Yo reflect vour sthte conversion. Ue
hava gbprovead yaur alection fo he clasaifiad ns s disressrdes mepsvaie
ahtity With an affactive date of Herch 31, 2019,

IF¥ you nasd any Torms, schedules; or publicastione mentioned Ain this
datter, you pan get them by visitiny our website at

Win . Ars.gbv/forpapubs op by calllag toll~free alt O0U~TAL~FURM
{BDO~B2Y-BRY6S .,

I¥ vou have guestipns, ¥ou oor 4811 the Entity Dept. at
BU1~620-6448 betwasn L230) a.uty and [1:59 p.o HDT.

IT wou prefer, vou can wrilte o tha sddress 5t The tap of the Fiest
pagn of this letter,

Whan vou write, includs a cvopy of this lstter, and provids vour
tnlephung humber and the hours We oan raach yvou in the spucey huloy,

Telephona number {3 flouprs

Keap n oopy 9t this letier for vour racords.

Thank woud for your coaperation.
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FERBUSDR ENTERPRIGES LLE
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