
Bid Tabluation
ITB 31-25 Citywide Fencing
Bids Due: June 6, 2025

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 4'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $18.00 $22.25 $25.00
2 6'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $23.00 $29.20 $34.00
3 6'0" with tension wire L.F. $24.00 $26.50 $28.00

4
6'0" with top rail and 3 strands of barb wire

L.F. $25.50 $31.00 $35.00

5 7'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $28.00 $38.00 $46.00
6 8'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $28.00 $39.50 $50.00
7 10'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $36.00 $47.50 $61.00
8 12'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $50.00 $55.00 $71.00
9 Deduction to exclude Top Rail L.F. $1.00 $2.25 $2.00

10 Addition of bottom rail (and hardware) L.F. $1.50 $6.95 $15.00
11 Addition of middle rail (and hardware) L.F. $1.50 $6.95 $15.00

Total $236.50 $305.10 $382.00
Average $21.50 $27.74 $34.73

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 4'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $18.00 $27.75 $30.00
2 6'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $23.00 $36.30 $41.00
3 6'0" with tension wire L.F. $24.00 $31.25 $29.00

Award:
Primary 

Secondary 
Tertiary 
No Bid 

Group 1A: 
Installed price of hot dip galvanized chain link fencing 
system, fabric w/ 1.2 oz zinc coating per ASTM standard 
(pricing by the linear foot installed)

Group 1B: 
Installed price of black vinyl-coated chain link fence 
system, fabric w/pvc coating per ASTM standard (pricing 
by the linear foot installed)



4
6'0" with top rail and 3 strands of barb wire

L.F. $25.50 $39.75 $35.00

5 7'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $28.00 $42.25 $45.00
6 8'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $32.00 $47.00 $59.00
7 10'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $40.00 $61.45 $62.00
8 12'0" with line posts and top rails L.F. $54.00 $72.50 $71.00
9 Deduction to exclude Top Rail L.F. $1.00 $3.95 $2.00

10 Addition of bottom rail (and hardware) L.F. $1.00 $8.45 $17.00
11 Addition of middle rail (and hardware) L.F. $1.00 $8.45 $17.00

Total $247.50 $379.10 $408.00
Average $22.50 $34.46 $37.09

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 4' end posts EA $26.00 $148.00 $155.00
2 4' pull posts EA $26.00 $206.00 $211.00
3 4' corner posts EA $26.00 $206.00 $211.00
4 6' end posts EA $26.00 $171.00 $175.00
5 6' pull posts EA $26.00 $232.00 $239.00
6 6' corner posts EA $26.00 $232.00 $239.00
7 7' end posts EA $28.00 $280.00 $329.00

8
7' pull posts

EA $28.00 $426.00 $485.00

9 7' corner posts EA $28.00 $426.00 $485.00
10 8' end posts EA $30.00 $307.00 $361.00
11 8' pull posts EA $30.00 $446.00 $525.00
12 8' corner posts EA $30.00 $446.00 $525.00
13 10'0" end posts EA $30.00 $334.00 $400.00
14 10'0" corner posts EA $30.00 $480.00 $575.00
15 12'0" end posts EA $33.00 $360.00 $450.00
16 12'0" pull posts EA $33.00 $515.00 $600.00
17 12'0" corner posts EA $33.00 $515.00 $600.00

18
Addition of Welded Plate to Post w/ Anchors, 
includes hardware EA $4.00 $65.00 $75.00

Total $493.00 $5,795.00 $6,640.00
Average $27.39 $321.94 $368.89

Group 2A: 
End & corner posts hot dip galvanized, complete w/ 
braces per specifications



Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company

Line 
Item

Description Unit of 
Measure

Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 4' end posts EA $27.00 $175.00 $188.00
2 4' pull posts EA $27.00 $220.00 $188.00
3 4' corner posts EA $27.00 $220.00 $188.00
4 6' end posts EA $27.00 $201.00 $222.00
5 6' pull posts EA $27.00 $265.00 $222.00
6 6' corner posts EA $27.00 $265.00 $222.00
7 7' end posts EA $29.00 $361.00 $425.00
8 7' pull posts EA $29.00 $562.00 $525.00
9 7' corner posts EA $29.00 $562.00 $525.00

10 8' end posts EA $31.00 $384.00 $582.00
11 8' pull posts EA $31.00 $589.00 $582.00
12 8' corner posts EA $31.00 $589.00 $582.00
13 10'0" end posts EA $31.00 $413.00 $475.00
14 10'0" corner posts EA $31.00 $624.00 $700.00
15 12'0" end posts EA $33.00 $488.50 $525.00
16 12'0" pull posts EA $33.00 $719.00 $750.00
17 12'0" corner posts EA $33.00 $719.00 $750.00

18
Addition of Welded Plate to Post w/ Anchors, 
includes hardware EA $5.00 $65.00 $75.00

Total $508.00 $7,421.50 $7,726.00
Average $28.22 $412.31 $429.22

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 6' PVC tounge and groove fence system 
(including gates and hardware)

Cost + Markup 60.% 40.% 25.%

2 6' PT Wood privacy fence system (including 
gates and hardware)

Cost + Markup 60.% 40.% 25.%

3
IDEAL ALUMINUM (Panel= C-300 Long 
Islander 68.5"w x 48"h) + (Post= 2.5" sq x 
72"h) +(Cap) All items Color= Black

Cost + Markup 60.% 40.% 25.%

4
IDEAL ALUMINUM (Panel= C-300 Long 
Islander 68.5"w x 60"h) + (Post= 2.5" sq x 
102"h) +(Cap) All items Color= Black

Cost + Markup 60.% 40.% 25.%

Group 3: 
Vinyl and wood privacy fence, aluminum decorative fence 
systems (percent over markup on materials)

Group 2B: 
End & corner posts black vinyl-coated, complete w/ braces 
per specifications



5
IDEAL ALUMINUM (Panel= C-300 Long 
Islander 68.5"w x 72"h) + (Post= 2.5" sq x 
102"h) +(Cap) All items Color= Black

Cost + Markup 60.% 40.% 25.%

6 IDEAL ALUMINUM (Panel= I-400 Alamo 
68.5"w x 48"h) + (Post= 2.5" sq x 72"h) 
+(Cap) All items Color= Aluminum Anodized

Cost + Markup 60.% 40.% 25.%

7 IDEAL ALUMINUM (Panel= I-400 Alamo 
68.5"w x 60"h) + (Post= 2.5" sq x 102"h) 
+(Cap) All items Color= Aluminum Anodized

Cost + Markup 60.% 40.% 25.%

8 IDEAL ALUMINUM (Panel= I-400 Alamo 
68.5"w x 72"h) + (Post= 2.5" sq x 102"h) 
+(Cap) All items Color= Aluminum Anodized

Cost + Markup 60.% 40.% 25.%

9
ANY FENCING MATERIAL OR SYSTEM NOT 
LISTED BUT REQUESTED BY THE CITY Cost + Markup 60.% 40.% 30.%

Average 60% 40% 25.55%



Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company
Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1
6' Privacy Fencing Material, PDS vinyl slat

L.F. $12.00 $15.00 $16.00

2
8' Privacy Fencing Materials, PDS vinyl slat

L.F. $15.00 $19.00 $20.00

3
6' Wood Stockade (Pressure Treated Pine)

L.F. $23.00 $20.00 $30.00

4
8" Wood Stockade (Pressure Treated Pine)

L.F. $30.00 $24.00 $55.00

6 Barbed Wire, metallic 50' Roll $8.00 $245.00 $450.00
7 Barbed Wire, PVC coated 50' Roll $10.00 $450.00 $600.00
8 Top or Bottom Tension Wire L.F. $0.10 $0.75 $4.00
9 Roller Chain #40 Steel L.F. $6.50 $12.00 $125.00

Total $104.60 $785.75 $1,300.00
Average $11.62 $87.31 $144.44

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl Coated 
Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

1 16' cantilever gate EA $4,400.00 $4,800.00 $2,582.00 $3,056.00 $2,660.00 $3,100.00
2 20' cantilever gate EA $5,500.00 $5,900.00 $2,781.00 $3,319.00 $2,850.00 $3,500.00
3 24' cantilever gate EA $6,600.00 $7,000.00 $2,980.00 $3,582.00 $3,050.00 $3,750.00
4 12' single swing gate EA $1,800.00 $1,900.00 $758.00 $944.00 $850.00 $1,100.00
5 10' single swing gate EA $1,500.00 $1,600.00 $650.00 $853.00 $725.00 $1,000.00
6 8' single swing gate EA $1,200.00 $1,300.00 $581.00 $704.00 $685.00 $800.00
7 6' single swing gate EA $900.00 $1,000.00 $512.00 $591.00 $650.00 $700.00
8 4' single swing gate EA $600.00 $700.00 $422.00 $534.00 $575.00 $600.00

Total $22,500.00 $24,200.00 $11,266.00 $13,583.00 $12,045.00 $14,550.00
Average $2,812.50 $3,025.00 $1,408.25 $1,697.88 $1,505.63 $1,818.75

Group 5A: 
Gates, including posts & hardware for 4' 0" fence

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC

Group 4: 
Additional Fencing Materials

Smith Fence Company



Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl Coated 
Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

1 16' cantilever gate EA $4,400.00 $4,800.00 $3,086.00 $3,719.00 $3,240.00 $4,500.00
2 20' cantilever gate EA $5,500.00 $5,900.00 $3,385.00 $4,110.00 $3,530.00 $4,900.00
3 12' single swing gate EA $1,800.00 $1,800.00 $989.00 $1,216.00 $1,050.00 $1,750.00
4 10' single swing gate EA $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $839.00 $1,090.00 $850.00 $1,500.00
5 8' single swing gate EA $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $736.00 $902.00 $800.00 $1,000.00
6 6' single swing gate EA $900.00 $900.00 $633.00 $773.00 $730.00 $875.00
7 4' single swing gate EA $600.00 $600.00 $503.00 $607.00 $625.00 $700.00
8 20' slide gate EA $5,500.00 $5,900.00 $1,450.00 $1,986.00 $1,860.00 $3,000.00

Total $21,400.00 $22,600.00 $11,621.00 $14,403.00 $12,685.00 $18,225.00
Average $2,675.00 $2,825.00 $1,452.63 $1,800.38 $1,585.63 $2,278.13

Line 
Item Description

Unit of 
Measure

Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl Coated 
Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

1 16' cantilever gate EA $5,200.00 $6,000.00 $3,189.00 $3,889.00 $3,450.00 $5,000.00
2 24' cantilever gate EA $7,800.00 $8,600.00 $3,710.00 $4,524.00 $4,150.00 $6,100.00
3 12' single swing gate EA $2,100.00 $2,400.00 $1,032.00 $1,258.00 $1,100.00 $2,000.00
4 10' single swing gate EA $1,750.00 $2,050.00 $920.00 $1,122.00 $1,035.00 $1,800.00
5 8' single swing gate EA $1,400.00 $1,650.00 $795.00 $970.00 $950.00 $1,500.00
6 6' single swing gate EA $1,050.00 $1,250.00 $648.00 $790.00 $785.00 $1,300.00
7 4' single swing gate EA $700.00 $900.00 $536.00 $654.00 $715.00 $1,100.00

Total $20,000.00 $22,850.00 $10,830.00 $13,207.00 $12,185.00 $18,800.00
Average $2,857.14 $3,264.29 $1,547.14 $1,886.71 $1,740.71 $2,685.71

Group 5B: 
Gates, including posts & hardware for 6' 0" fence

Group 5C: 
Gates, including posts & hardware for 7' 0" fence

Cardinal Fence LLC

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC

Ballfer Service Corp Smith Fence Company

Smith Fence Company



Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl Coated 
Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

1 16' cantilever gate EA $5,600.00 $6,000.00 $3,294.00 $4,020.00 $3,725.00 $5,250.00
2 24' cantilever gate EA $8,400.00 $8,800.00 $4,051.00 $4,991.00 $4,525.00 $6,500.00
3 12' single swing gate EA $2,400.00 $2,800.00 $1,145.00 $1,368.00 $1,190.00 $2,100.00
4 10' single swing gate EA $1,900.00 $2,300.00 $1,004.00 $1,268.00 $1,090.00 $1,900.00
5 8' single swing gate EA $1,600.00 $2,000.00 $877.00 $1,029.00 $1,100.00 $1,175.00
6 6' single swing gate EA $1,200.00 $1,500.00 $708.00 $869.00 $825.00 $1,025.00
7 4' single swing gate EA $900.00 $1,200.00 $580.00 $708.00 $750.00 $875.00

Total $22,000.00 $24,600.00 $11,659.00 $14,253.00 $13,205.00 $18,825.00
Average $3,142.86 $3,514.29 $1,665.57 $2,036.14 $1,886.43 $2,689.29

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl Coated 
Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

1 16' cantilever gate EA $6,000.00 $6,400.00 $3,727.00 $4,429.00 $4,225.00 $6,000.00
2 24' cantilever gate EA $8,800.00 $9,200.00 $4,668.00 $6,375.00 $5,230.00 $7,700.00
3 12' single swing gate EA $2,800.00 $3,200.00 $1,515.00 $1,732.00 $1,350.00 $2,500.00
4 10' single swing gate EA $2,300.00 $2,700.00 $1,199.00 $1,532.00 $1,250.00 $2,200.00
5 8' single swing gate EA $2,000.00 $2,400.00 $1,040.00 $1,332.00 $1,150.00 $1,900.00
6 6' single swing gate EA $1,600.00 $2,000.00 $820.00 $1,135.00 $925.00 $1,700.00
7 4' single swing gate EA $1,300.00 $1,700.00 $661.00 $852.00 $825.00 $1,400.00

Total $24,800.00 $27,600.00 $13,630.00 $17,387.00 $14,955.00 $23,400.00
Average $3,542.86 $3,942.86 $1,947.14 $2,483.86 $2,136.43 $3,342.86

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl Coated 
Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

Hot Dipped 
Galvanized

Black Vinyl 
Coated 

Group 5D: 
Gates, including posts & hardware for 8' 0" fence

Group 5E: 
Gates, including posts & hardware for 10' 0" fence

Group 5F: 
Gates, including posts & hardware for 12' 0" fence

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC

Smith Fence Company

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC

Smith Fence Company

Smith Fence Company



1 16' cantilever gate EA $6,400.00 $6,800.00 $4,159.00 $5,636.00 $4,730.00 $7,200.00
2 24' cantilever gate EA $9,200.00 $9,600.00 $5,285.00 $7,108.00 $5,930.00 $8,750.00
3 12' single swing gate EA $3,200.00 $3,600.00 $1,574.00 $2,103.00 $1,515.00 $3,200.00
4 10' single swing gate EA $2,700.00 $3,100.00 $1,383.00 $1,863.00 $1,395.00 $2,700.00
5 8' single swing gate EA $2,400.00 $2,700.00 $1,191.00 $1,465.00 $1,275.00 $2,200.00
6 6' single swing gate EA $2,000.00 $2,400.00 $933.00 $1,155.00 $1,000.00 $1,900.00
7 4' single swing gate EA $1,700.00 $2,100.00 $741.00 $918.00 $885.00 $1,500.00

8 Wheel Assembly, 5", for Roll Gate, w/ 
hardware

EA $175.00 $225.00 $75.00 $75.00 $215.00 $215.00

9
Wheel Assembly, 8", for Roll Gate, w/ 
hardware EA $250.00 $300.00 $105.00 $105.00 $230.00 $230.00

Total $28,025.00 $30,825.00 $15,446.00 $20,428.00 $17,175.00 $27,895.00
Average $3,113.89 $3,425.00 $1,716.22 $2,269.78 $1,908.33 $3,099.44



Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1
4' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - SINGLE WALK) 
Long Islander - Price per foot of opening - 
(Color - Black)  

L.F. $250.00 $338.00 $230.00

2
4' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - SINGLE WALK) 
Alamo - Price per foot of opening - (Color - 
Anodized Aluminum)  

L.F. $350.00 $372.00 $250.00

3
4' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - DOUBLE 
WALK) Long Islander - Price per foot of 
opening - (Color - Black)  

L.F. $250.00 $338.00 $250.00

4 4' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - DOUBLE 
WALK) Alamo - Price per foot of opening - 
(Color - Anodized Aluminum ) 

L.F. $350.00 $372.00 $270.00

5 4' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - BOTTOM 
TRACK CANTILEVER) Long Islander - Price per 
foot of opening - (Color - Black)  

L.F. $250.00 $750.00 $800.00

6 4' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - BOTTOM 
TRACK CANTILEVER) Alamo - Price per foot of 
opening - (Color - Anodized Aluminum ) 

L.F. $350.00 $825.00 $830.00

7
4' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - ESTATE) Long 
Islander - Price per foot of opening - (Color - 
Black)  

L.F. $250.00 $520.00 $410.00

8
4' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - ESTATE) Alamo 
- Price per foot of opening - (Color - Anodized 
Aluminum ) 

L.F. $350.00 $572.00 $430.00

9
5' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - SINGLE WALK) 
Long Islander - Price per foot of opening - 
(Color - Black)  

L.F. $250.00 $365.00 $245.00

10
5' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - SINGLE WALK) 
Alamo - Price per foot of opening - (Color - 
Anodized Aluminum)  

L.F. $350.00 $402.00 $265.00

11
5' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - DOUBLE 
WALK) Long Islander - Price per foot of 
opening - (Color - Black)  

L.F. $250.00 $365.00 $270.00

12
5' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - DOUBLE 
WALK) Alamo - Price per foot of opening - 
(Color - Anodized Aluminum)  

L.F. $350.00 $402.00 $290.00

Group 5G: Gates, including posts, tracks, and all hardware 
for ideal aluminum fence (price per L.F. of gate opening 
price includes material and installation)



13 5' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - BOTTOM 
TRACK CANTILEVER) Long Islander - Price per 
foot of opening - (Color - Black)  

L.F. $250.00 $802.00 $830.00

14

5' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - 
BOTTOMTRACK CANTILEVER) Alamo - Price 
per foot of opening - (Color - Anodized 
Aluminum)  

L.F. $350.00 $882.00 $860.00

15
5' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - ESTATE) Long 
Islander - Price per foot of opening - (Color - 
Black)  

L.F. $250.00 $559.00 $445.00

16
5' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - ESTATE) Alamo 
- Price per foot of opening - (Color - Anodized 
Aluminum)  

L.F. $350.00 $615.00 $475.00

17
6' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM SINGLE WALK) 
Long Islander - Price per foot of opening - 
Color  

L.F. $250.00 $386.00 $255.00

18
6' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - SINGLE WALK) 
Alamo - Price per foot of opening - (Color - 
Anodized Aluminum)  

L.F. $350.00 $425.00 $280.00

19
6' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - DOUBLE 
WALK) Long Islander - Price per foot of 
opening - (Color - Black)  

L.F. $250.00 $386.00 $285.00

20 6' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - DOUBLE 
WALK) Alamo - Price per foot of opening - 
(Color - Anodized Aluminum ) 

L.F. $350.00 $425.00 $310.00

21 6' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - BOTTOM 
TRACK CANTILEVER) Long Islander - Price per 
foot of opening - (Color - Black)  

L.F. $250.00 $842.00 $860.00

22 6' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - BOTTOM 
TRACK CANTILEVER) Alamo - Price per foot of 
opening - (Color - Anodized Aluminum ) 

L.F. $350.00 $925.00 $890.00

23
6' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - ESTATE) Long 
Islander - Price per foot of opening - (Color - 
Black)  

L.F. $250.00 $614.00 $480.00

24
6' Height (IDEAL ALUMINUM - ESTATE) Alamo 
- Price per foot of opening - (Color - Anodized 
Aluminum ) 

L.F. $350.00 $675.00 $510.00

Total $7,200.00 $13,157.00 $11,020.00
Average $300.00 $548.21 $459.17



Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 New - Pedestrain/Bicycle Railing w/ 
hardware (Steel) - FDOT Index No. 515-052 

L.F. No Bid No Bid $97.00

2 New - Pedestrian/Bicycle Railing w/hardware 
(Aluminum) - FDOT Index No. 515-062

L.F. No Bid No Bid $96.00

3 New - Pipe Gaurdrail w/hardware 
(Aluminum) - FDOT Index No. 515-070

L.F. No Bid No Bid $95.00

4 New - Pipe Gaurdrail w/hardware (Steel) - 
FDOT Index No. 515-080

L.F. No Bid No Bid $94.00

5 Replace - Pedestrain/Bicycle Railing w/ 
hardware (Steel) - FDOT Index No. 515-052 

L.F. No Bid No Bid $100.00

6
Replace - Pedestrian/Bicycle Railing 
w/hardware (Aluminum) - FDOT Index No. 
515-062

L.F. No Bid No Bid $99.00

7 Replace - Pipe Gaurdrail w/hardware 
(Aluminum) - FDOT Index No. 515-070

L.F. No Bid No Bid $99.00

8
Replace - Pipe Gaurdrail w/hardware (Steel) - 
FDOT Index No. 515-080 L.F. No Bid No Bid $97.00

Total $777.00

Average $97.13

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
SMITH FENCE 

COMPANY

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Percentage Percentage Percentage

1
Automatic gate opener (Unit per linear foot 
of gate being opened)

L.F. 25% 40% 30%

Group 6: 
Handrail/guardrail - pedestrian and bicycle (L.F. price 
includes material and installation)

Group 7: 
Gate operators (pricing based on percentage mark up 
from cost)



Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 Removal and disposal of 4' fencing any 
material

L.F. $6.50 $5.00 $5.00

2 Removal and disposal of 5' fencing any 
material

L.F. $6.50 $5.00 $5.00

3 Removal and disposal of 6' fencing any 
material

L.F. $6.50 $6.00 $5.00

4 Removal and disposal of 7' fencing any 
material

L.F. $6.50 $7.00 $10.00

5 Removal and disposal of 8' fencing any 
material

L.F. $6.50 $8.00 $10.00

6 Removal and disposal of 9' fencing any 
material

L.F. $7.00 $9.00 $10.00

7 Removal and disposal of 10' fencing any 
material

L.F. $7.00 $15.00 $10.00

8 Removal and disposal of 11' fencing any 
material

L.F. $7.00 $16.50 $15.00

9 Removal and disposal of 12' fencing any 
material

L.F. $9.00 $18.00 $15.00

Group 8: 
Removal and disposal of old fence 4'-16' height any 
material



10 Removal and disposal of 13' fencing any 
material

L.F. $9.00 $19.50 $15.00

11 Removal and disposal of 14' fencing any 
material

L.F. $9.00 $21.00 $15.00

12 Removal and disposal of 15' fencing any 
material

L.F. $10.50 $22.50 $15.00

13
Removal and disposal of  16' fencing any 
material L.F. $10.50 $24.00 $15.00

Total $101.50 $176.50 $145.00
Average $7.81 $13.58 $11.15

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1
Rate Charges Monday Through Friday 8:00 
A.M. - 5:00 P.M. (Straight Time) Hour $28.50

$150.00
$200.00

2
Rate Charges Monday Through Friday (After 
Hours 5:01P.M - 7:59A.M) Hour $42.75

$210.00
$250.00

3
Rate Charges Saturday, Sunday, Emergency 
Work Or Holiday Hour $50.00

$210.00
$250.00

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 6' pvc tounge and groove privacy fence 
system (including gates)

L.F. $12.00 $8.00 $10.00

2 6' pt wood privacy fence system (including 
gates)

L.F. $14.00 $8.00 $10.00

3 4' decorative aluminum fence system 
(excluding gates)

L.F. $12.00 $8.00 $10.00

4 5' decorative aluminum fence system 
(excluding gates)

L.F. $12.00 $8.00 $10.00

5
6' decorative aluminum fence system 
(excluding gates) L.F. $12.00 $8.00 $10.00

Total $62.00 $40.00 $50.00
Average $12.40 $8.00 $10.00

Group 10: Installation of pvc tongue and groove privacy, 
pt wood privacy, and decorative aluminum fence systems 
(installation per L.F.)

Group 9: 
Hourly installation, repair, replacement of fencing and 
gate operators



Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company

Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 6' Chainlink Temporary Fence Panels with 
Stands and Hardware

L.F. No Bid No Bid $5.50

2 6' Chainlink Temporary Fence with line posts 
and FDOT top wire

L.F. No Bid No Bid $6.50

3 6' Windscreen L.F. No Bid No Bid $3.00

4 6' Temporary Gates L.F. No Bid No Bid $30.00

5 4' Crowd Control Barriers L.F. No Bid No Bid $4.00

6 Gate Wheels EA No Bid No Bid $50.00

7 Sand Bag EA No Bid No Bid $10.00

8 Corner Post EA No Bid No Bid $25.00

9 Support Post EA No Bid No Bid $25.00

10
Per Job Weekend or Emergency Install or 
Removal Fee EA No Bid No Bid $750.00

Total $909.00
Average $90.90

Group 11: Temporary fence system installation, rental, 
removal, additional items



Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company
Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1 Chainsaw with Operator Hour No Bid No Bid $215.00

2 Clearing with Skidsteer and Grapple Hour No Bid No Bid $375.00

3 Clearing with Excavator Hour No Bid No Bid $375.00

4 Clearing with Forestry Mulcher Hour No Bid No Bid $450.00

Total $1,415.00
Average $353.75

Ballfer Service Corp Cardinal Fence LLC
Smith Fence 

Company
Line 
Item

Description
Unit of 

Measure
Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1
Permit submission from initial application to 
final inspection (when required)

Per Occurance $500.00 $300.00 $750.00

2
Coordination for utility locate for all public 
underground utilities (responsibility of 
awarded contractor)

Per Occurance No Bid $100.00 $100.00

3
Coordination for utility locate for all private 
underground utilities (when requested)

Per Occurance No Bid $100.00 $100.00

4
Temporary Traffic Control (TTC) (when 
required)

Per Occurance No Bid $2,500.00 $1,850.00

5 Utility locate private company provider Per Occurance No Bid $1,000.00 $2,100.00

6
Unspecified work not listed but requested by 
City

Cost + Markup No Bid 40% 25%

Group 12: Additional clearing per hour

Group 13: Additional services
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