CITY OF CLEARWATER

ITB # 45-21; Biosolids Management Services
DUE DATE: September 9, 2021; 10:00 AM
BID TABULATION

H& A Liquid Sludge Disposal, inc.

Merrell Bros, Inc.

Revinu, Inc.

Synagro South, LLC

P.0. Box 390 8811 West 500 North 4050 Dundee Road 435 Williams Court, Suite 100
Branford, FL 32008 Kokomo, IN 46901 Winter Haven, FL 33884 Baltimore, MD 21220
N Est. Quantity Unit Price N Unit Price N Unit Price N Unit Price N
Item No. Base Bid ltems ) (it Total Weekly Price e Total Weekly Price e Total Weekly Price e Total Weekly Price
i. Northeast WRF Biosolids (Dewatered Cake) to RMF 190 $68.00 $ 12.920.00 $57.55 $ 10.934.50 $73.81 $ 14,023.90 $67.50 $ 12.825.00
ii. | Marshall Street WRF Biosolids (Dewatered Cake) to RMF 60 $68.00 $ 4,080.00 $57.63 $ 3,457.80 $73.81 $ 4,428.60 $67.50 $ 4,050.00
Tiquid Sludge (Approx. 5% Total Solids) from East WRF to
iii. Northeast WRF 55.000 $0.040 $ 2.200.00 $0.033 $ 1.815.00 $0.035 $ 1.925.00 $0.280 $ 15.400.00
Tiquid Sludge (Approx. 5% fotal solids) from East WRF 0 :
iv. Marshall Street WRF $0.055 $ 3,025.00 $0.033 $ 1,815.00 $0.035 $ 1,925.00 $0.280 $ 15,400.00
Total Base Bid Items:| $ 22.225.00 $ 18,022.30 $ 22.302.50 $ 47.675.00
N Est. Quantity Unit Price N Unit Price N Unit Price N Unit Price N
Item No. Alternate Bid ltems ) (it Total Weekly Price e Total Weekly Price e Total Weekly Price e Total Weekly Price
i. Dewatered Class B Biosolids to Land Appl 250 $43.50 $ 10.875.00 NO BID $ - $73.81 $ 18.452.50 NO BID $ -
ii. Dewatered Class B Biosolids to Landfill 250 $68.00 $ 17,000.00 NO BID $ - $90.00 $ 22,500.00 NO BID $ -
Tiquid Biosolids (Approx. 5% Total Solids) from Northeast
iii. WRF to Marshall Street WRF 275,000 $0.035 $ 9.625.00 $0.040 $ 11,000.00 $0.055 $ 15.125.00 NO BID -
Tiquid Biosolids (Approx. 5% Total Solids) from Marshall
iv. Street WRF to Northeast WRF 275,000 $0.035 $ 9,625.00 $0.040 $ 11,000.00 $0.055 $ 15,125.00 NO BID $
The Removal and Disposal by Incorporation of Dewatered
v. Class B Biosolids 1 $46.00 $ 1.058.00 NO BID $ - NO BID $ - NO BID $ -
Total Alernate Bid Items:| $ 48,183.00 $ 22,000.00 $ 71,202.50 NO BID
Total Bid: $ 70.408.00 Total Bid: $ 40.022.30 Total Bid: $ 93.505.00 Total Bid: $ 47.675.00

Page10f1



