
Brenntag 
Mid-

South, Inc.

Harcros 
Chemicals

Odyssey 
Manufacturing 

Co

Thatcher 
Chemical of 
Florida, Inc.

Univar 
Solutions 
USA LLC

Line Item Description Unit of Measure Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost Unit Cost

1
Sodium 
Hydroxide Per Gallon $2.27 $2.83 $2.55 No Bid $1.9574
Total $2.27 $2.83 $2.55 No Bid $1.9574

Line Item Description

 Estimated 
Annual 
Quantity Per 
Gallon

Unit of 
Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit CostTotal

7 Sodium Bisulfite 133590 Per Gallon $1.67 $223,095.30 No Bid No Bid $2.30 $307,257.00 $2.12 $283,210.80 No Bid No Bid
8 Sodium Bisulfite 133590 Per Pound No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $.2035 $27,185.565 $.1881 $25,128.279 No Bid No Bid
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