CITY OF CLEARWATER

ITB 30-24, Vehicle/Equipment Repair and Maintenance Services
DUE DATE: April 18, 2024; 10:00 AM

BID TABULATION

PRICING FOR AUTOMOBILES, SEDANS, LIGHT DUTY TRUCKS / SUV’S

" Innovative
Cummins Inc. dba Dynamic Diesel Equipment Services Tampa Sprin,
CATEGORY 1 - AUTOMOBILES / SEDANS Blackwater Diesel LLC |  Cummins Sales & U Ferman Ford of CWT | P A Walker Ford
; Works dba CASE Power & Company *
* Service .
Equip
Shop Labor Hourly Rate Per Hr S 100.00 | $ 185.00 no bid S 180.00 no bid no bid S 175.00
Emergency Hourly Rate Per Hr S 150.00 | $ 239.10 no bid S 180.00 no bid no bid S 175.00
Service/Road Call Rate (if applicable) Per Hr S 200.00 | $ 215.07 no bid S 180.00 no bid no bid S 175.00
Pick-up/delivery (if applicable) Per Hr S 60.00 no bid no bid S 180.00 no bid no bid S 175.00
R Innovative
CATEGORY 2 - LIGHT DUTY TRUCK/SUV Cummins Inc. dba Dynamic Diesel Equipment Services Tampa Sprin
Blackwater Diesel LLC Cummins Sales & U Ferman Ford of CWT KR L SIS Walker Ford
CLASS 1-3 (0 -14,000 LBS) Service Works dba CASE Power & Company .
* Equip
Shop Labor Hourly Rate Per Hr S 100.00 | $ 185.00 no bid S 180.00 no bid no bid S 175.00
Emergency Hourly Rate Per Hr S 150.00 | $ 239.10 no bid S 180.00 no bid no bid S 175.00
Service/Road Call Rate (if applicable) Per Hr S 200.00 | $ 215.07 no bid S 180.00 no bid no bid S 175.00
Pick-up/delivery (if applicable) Per Hr S 60.00 no bid no bid S 180.00 no bid no bid S 175.00
PRICING FOR MEDIUM AND HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS, CONSTRUNTION /OFF ROAD EQUIPMENT AND TRAILERS
i Innovative
CATEGORY 1 - MEDIUM/HEAVY DUTY TRUCKS CLASS 4-8 (14,001 Cummins Inc. dba Dynamic Diesel Equipment Services Tampa Sprin
’ Blackwater Diesel LLC Cummins Sales & U Ferman Ford of CWT KR LIS Walker Ford
33,001+ LBS) * Service Works dba CASE Power & * Company
* Equip
Shop Labor Hourly Rate Per Hr S 100.00 | $ 185.00 | $ 120.00 | $ 220.00 no bid S 100.00 no bid
Emergency Hourly Rate Per Hr S 150.00 | $ 239.10 no bid S 220.00 no bid S 195.00 no bid
Service/Road Call Rate (if applicable) Per Hr S 200.00 | $ 215.07 | $ 89.99 | S 220.00 no bid no bid no bid
Pick-up/delivery (if applicable) Per Hr S 60.00 no bid Based on tow bill S 220.00 no bid no bid no bid
. Innovative
Cummins Inc. dba Dynamic Diesel Equipment Services Tampa Sprin
CATEGORY 2 - CONSTRUCTION/OFF ROAD lackwater Diesel LLC |  Cummins Sales & U Ferman Ford of CWT | ~ 0P [RSTIIE Walker Ford
. Works dba CASE Power & Company
Service .
Equip
Shop Labor Hourly Rate Per Hr S 100.00 | $ 185.00 | $ 150.00 no bid S 175.00 | $ 100.00 no bid
Emergency Hourly Rate Per Hr S 150.00 | $ 239.10 no bid no bid S 175.00 | $ 195.00 no bid
Service/Road Call Rate (if applicable) Per Hr S 200.00 | $ 215.07 | $ 89.99 no bid S 175.00 no bid no bid
Pick-up/delivery (if applicable) Per Hr no bid no bid Based on tow bill no bid TBD no bid no bid
. Innovative
Cummins Inc. dba Dynamic Diesel Equipment Services Tampa Sprin
CATEGORY 3 - WALKING FLOOR AND STANDARD TRAILER Blackwater Diesel LLC Cummins Sales & Y Ferman Ford of CWT quip pa Spring Walker Ford
. Works dba CASE Power & * Company
* Service .
Equip
Shop Labor Hourly Rate Per Hr S 100.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid S 100.00 no bid
Emergency Hourly Rate Per Hr S 150.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid S 195.00 no bid
Service/Road Call Rate (if applicable) Per Hr S 200.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Pick-up/delivery (if applicable) Per Hr S - no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
Parts and Materials Mark-up will not be utilized for determination of award
Parts and Materials Mark-up from cost % 25% | 65% | 25% | 20% | 25% 30% 20%




