
Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 2 INCH STEEL PIPE 200 Foot No Bid No Bid $22.50 $4,500.00 No Bid No Bid
2 3 INCH STEEL PIPE 40 Foot No Bid No Bid $28.50 $1,140.00 No Bid No Bid
3 4 INCH STEEL PIPE 200 Foot No Bid No Bid $38.50 $7,700.00 No Bid No Bid
4 6 INCH STEEL PIPE 40 Foot No Bid No Bid $49.90 $1,996.00 No Bid No Bid
5 6 INCH STEEL PIPE WITH 0.280 WALL THICKNESS 40 Foot No Bid No Bid $49.90 $1,996.00 No Bid No Bid
6 8 INCH STEEL PIPE 40 Foot No Bid No Bid $75.00 $3,000.00 No Bid No Bid
7 12 INCH STEEL PIPE 200 Foot No Bid No Bid $124.50 $24,900.00 No Bid No Bid
8 16 INCH STEEL PIPE 200 Foot No Bid No Bid $156.45 $31,290.00 No Bid No Bid
9 18 INCH STEEL PIPE 40 Foot No Bid No Bid $180.00 $7,200.00 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $83,722.00 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 INCH WELD FLANGE (SLIP ON) 125# RAISED FACE 5 Each No Bid No Bid $8.64 $43.20 No Bid No Bid
2 2 INCH WELD FLANGE (SLIP ON) 125# RAISED FACE 150 Each No Bid No Bid $9.86 $1,479.00 No Bid No Bid
3 3 INCH WELD FLANGE (SLIP ON) 125# RAISED FACE 25 Each No Bid No Bid $14.20 $355.00 No Bid No Bid
4 3 X 2 INCH WELD FLANGE (SLIP ON) 125# RAISED FACE 50 Each No Bid No Bid $36.52 $1,826.00 No Bid No Bid
5 4 INCH WELD FLANGE (SLIP ON) 125# RAISED FACE 10 Each No Bid No Bid $17.05 $170.50 No Bid No Bid
6 4 X 2 INCH WELD FLANGE (SLIP ON) 125# RAISED FACE 5 Each No Bid No Bid $37.05 $185.25 No Bid No Bid
7 4 X 3 INCH WELD FLANGE (SLIP ON) 125# RAISED FACE 10 Each No Bid No Bid $39.10 $391.00 No Bid No Bid
8 6 INCH WELD FLANGE (SLIP ON) 125# RAISED FACE 20 Each No Bid No Bid $27.30 $546.00 No Bid No Bid
9 6 X 4 INCH WELD FLANGE (SLIP ON) 125# RAISED FACE 5 Each No Bid No Bid $95.61 $478.05 No Bid No Bid

10 8 INCH WELD FLANGE (SLIP ON) 125# RAISED FACE 20 Each No Bid No Bid $56.78 $1,135.60 No Bid No Bid
11 1 INCH THREADED FLANGE 125# 5 Each No Bid No Bid $15.70 $78.50 No Bid No Bid
12 2 INCH THREADED FLANGE 125# 20 Each No Bid No Bid $14.76 $295.20 No Bid No Bid
13 3 INCH THREADED FLANGE 125# 5 Each No Bid No Bid $16.50 $82.50 No Bid No Bid
14 3 X 2 INCH THREADED FLANGE 125# 10 Each No Bid No Bid $45.22 $452.20 No Bid No Bid
15 4 INCH THREADED FLANGE 125# 5 Each No Bid No Bid $19.69 $98.45 No Bid No Bid
16 4 X 2 INCH THREADED 125# 10 Each No Bid No Bid $50.60 $506.00 No Bid No Bid
17 4 X 3 INCH THREADED 125# 5 Each No Bid No Bid $50.60 $253.00 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $8,375.45 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 INCH STEEL 45 DEGREE ELLS 2 Each No Bid No Bid $3.50 $7.00 No Bid No Bid
2 2 INCH STEEL 45 DEGREE ELLS 5 Each No Bid No Bid $3.50 $17.50 No Bid No Bid
3 4 INCH STEEL 45 DEGREE ELLS 2 Each No Bid No Bid $7.90 $15.80 No Bid No Bid
4 6 INCH STEEL 45 DEGREE ELLS 2 Each No Bid No Bid $15.00 $30.00 No Bid No Bid
5 8 INCH STEEL 45 DEGREE ELLS 2 Each No Bid No Bid $25.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid
6 1 INCH STEEL 90 DEGREE ELLS (LONG RADIUS) 10 Each No Bid No Bid $3.50 $35.00 No Bid No Bid
7 2 INCH STEEL 90 DEGREE ELLS (LONG RADIUS) 75 Each No Bid No Bid $9.05 $678.75 No Bid No Bid

Bid Tabulation ITB 52-25, Polyethylene Pipe Fittings and Steel Pipe Fittings
Indicates Intent to Award

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 3: Elbows Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 1: Epoxy Coated Steel Pipe Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 2: Flanges Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries



8 3 INCH STEEL 90 DEGREE ELLS (LONG RADIUS) 10 Each No Bid No Bid $12.27 $122.70 No Bid No Bid
9 4 INCH STEEL 90 DEGREE ELLS (LONG RADIUS) 10 Each No Bid No Bid $21.20 $212.00 No Bid No Bid

10 6 INCH STEEL 90 DEGREE ELLS (LONG RADIUS) 10 Each No Bid No Bid $46.34 $463.40 No Bid No Bid
11 8 INCH STEEL 90 DEGREE ELLS (LONG RADIUS) 10 Each No Bid No Bid $80.00 $800.00 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $2,432.15 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 X 1 X 1 INCH STEEL TEES 10 Each $0.00 $0.00 $10.17 $101.70 $0.00 $0.00
2 2 X 2 X 2 INCH STEEL TEES 20 Each $0.00 $0.00 $9.52 $190.40 $0.00 $0.00
3 4 X 4 X 4 INCH STEEL TEES 5 Each $0.00 $0.00 $20.05 $100.25 $0.00 $0.00
4 6 X 6 X 6 INCH STEEL TEES 5 Each $0.00 $0.00 $32.50 $162.50 $0.00 $0.00
5 4 X 4 X 2 INCH STEEL TEES 5 Each $0.00 $0.00 $19.90 $99.50 $0.00 $0.00
6 3 X 3 X 3 INCH STEEL TEES 5 Each $0.00 $0.00 $13.25 $66.25 $0.00 $0.00
7 6 X 6 X 4 INCH STEEL TEES 5 Each $0.00 $0.00 $41.00 $205.00 $0.00 $0.00

Total $0.00 $925.60 $0.00

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 2 INCH CAPS 25 Each No Bid No Bid $5.80 $145.00 No Bid No Bid
2 3 INCH CAPS 10 Each No Bid No Bid $5.50 $55.00 No Bid No Bid
3 4 INCH CAPS 10 Each No Bid No Bid $8.75 $87.50 No Bid No Bid
4 6 INCH CAPS 2 Each No Bid No Bid $13.89 $27.78 No Bid No Bid
5 8 INCH CAPS 2 Each No Bid No Bid $20.00 $40.00 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $355.28 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 2 X 1 INCH STEEL WELD REDUCING CONCENTRIC 30 Each No Bid No Bid $8.56 $256.80 No Bid No Bid
2 3 X 2 INCH STEEL WELD REDUCING CONCENTRIC 10 Each No Bid No Bid $6.74 $67.40 No Bid No Bid
3 4 X 2 INCH STEEL WELD REDUCING CONCENTRIC 10 Each No Bid No Bid $10.00 $100.00 No Bid No Bid
4 4 X 3 INCH STEEL WELD REDUCING CONCENTRIC 10 Each No Bid No Bid $7.60 $76.00 No Bid No Bid
5 6 X 4 INCH STEEL WELD REDUCING CONCENTRIC 2 Each No Bid No Bid $16.85 $33.70 No Bid No Bid
6 8 X 6 INCH STEEL WELD REDUCING CONCENTRIC 2 Each No Bid No Bid $20.00 $40.00 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $573.90 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 3/4 INCH METER STOP 600 Each $19.38 $11,628.00 $15.15 $9,090.00 No Bid No Bid
2 1 INCH METER STOP 1500 Each $27.50 $41,250.00 $25.00 $37,500.00 No Bid No Bid
3 1 1/4 INCH METER STOP 20 Each $38.74 $774.80 $30.00 $600.00 No Bid No Bid
4 2 INCH METER STOP 75 Each $78.20 $5,865.00 $75.00 $5,625.00 No Bid No Bid

  Total       $59,517.80   $52,815.00   No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 3/4 INCH COND. COMPRESSION COUPLING DRESSER STYLE 90 20 Each $51.45 $1,029.00 $69.55 $1,391.00 No Bid No Bid
2 1 INCH COND. COMPRESSION COUPLING DRESSER STYLE 90 20 Each $53.50 $1,070.00 $74.93 $1,498.60 No Bid No Bid

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 4: Tees Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 5: Caps Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 6: Reducing Couplings Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 8: Dresser Style Compression Couplings Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 7: Gas Meter Stops (BMI, non-insulated ball valves that do not include the pres  Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries



3 2 INCH COND. COMPRESSION COUPLING DRESSER STYLE 90 20 Each $78.40 $1,568.00 $109.85 $2,197.00 No Bid No Bid
4 1/2 IPS COND. COMPRESSION COUPLING DRESSER STYLE 90 5 Each $51.45 $257.25 $80.00 $400.00 No Bid No Bid
5 2 INCH COND. COMPRESSION COUPLING DRESSER STYLE 90 INSULATED 5 Each $108.80 $544.00 $152.20 $761.00 No Bid No Bid
6 3/4 INCH COND. COMPRESSION COUPLING DRESSER STYLE 90 CAP 10 Each $24.89 $248.90 $80.00 $800.00 No Bid No Bid
7 1 INCH COND. COMPRESSION COUPLING DRESSER STYLE 90 CAP 20 Each $27.50 $550.00 $96.15 $1,923.00 No Bid No Bid
8 2 INCH COND. COMPRESSION COUPLING DRESSER STYLE 90 CAP 10 Each $44.85 $448.50 $152.20 $1,522.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $5,715.65 $10,492.60 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 3/4 X 3 INCH STAINLESS STEEL CLAMP POWER SEAL STYLE 3151 10 Each No Bid No Bid $10.15 $101.50 No Bid No Bid
2 3/4 X 6 INCH STAINLESS STEEL CLAMP POWER SEAL STYLE 3151 10 Each No Bid No Bid $20.30 $203.00 No Bid No Bid
3 1 X 3 INCH STAINLESS STEEL CLAMP POWER SEAL STYLE 3151 10 Each No Bid No Bid $11.10 $111.00 No Bid No Bid
4 1 X 6 INCH STAINLESS STEEL CLAMP POWER SEAL STYLE 3151 10 Each No Bid No Bid $22.22 $222.20 No Bid No Bid
5 2 X 3 INCH STAINLESS STEEL CLAMP POWER SEAL STYLE 3151 20 Each No Bid No Bid $13.43 $268.60 No Bid No Bid
6 2 X 6 INCH STAINLESS STEEL CLAMP POWER SEAL STYLE 3151 10 Each No Bid No Bid $24.34 $243.40 No Bid No Bid
7 2 X 12 INCH FULL CIRCLE STAIN.STEEL CLAMP 2:35-2:55 OD POWER SEAL 311OG 5 Each No Bid No Bid $153.67 $768.35 No Bid No Bid
8 2 X 12 INCH FULL CIRCLE STAIN.STEEL CLAMP 2:45-2:65 G POWER SEAL 311OG 10 Each No Bid No Bid $153.67 $1,536.70 No Bid No Bid
9 2 1/2 X 12 INCH FULL CIRCLE STAIN.STEEL CLAMP 2:70-2:90 OD POWER SEAL 5 Each No Bid No Bid $170.89 $854.45 No Bid No Bid

10 4 X 6 INCH FULL CIRCLE STAIN.STEEL CLAMP 4:50-4:80 OD POWER SEAL 311OG 5 Each No Bid No Bid $119.95 $599.75 No Bid No Bid
11 4 X 12 INCH FULL CIRCLE STAIN.STEEL CLAMP 4:50-4:80 OD POWER SEAL 311OG 5 Each No Bid No Bid $202.25 $1,011.25 No Bid No Bid
12 4 X 18 INCH FULL CIRCLE STAIN.STEEL CLAMP 4:50-4:80 OD POWER SEAL 311OG 5 Each No Bid No Bid $318.53 $1,592.65 No Bid No Bid
13 6 X 18 INCH STAINLESS STEEL FULL CIRCLE CLAMP 5 Each No Bid No Bid $381.27 $1,906.35 No Bid No Bid
14 8 X 12 INCH FULL CIRCLE STAIN.STEEL CLAMP 8:00-8:25 OD POWER SEAL 311OG 5 Each No Bid No Bid $266.21 $1,331.05 No Bid No Bid
15 8 X 12 INCH FULL CIRCLE STAINLESS STEEL CLAMP 8:60-9:50 POWER SEAL 3122G 5 Each No Bid No Bid $322.52 $1,612.60 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $12,362.85 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 SERVICE SADDLES 2 MAIN X 1 FPT 1 Each No Bid No Bid $42.50 $42.50 No Bid No Bid
2 SERVICE SADDLES 2 MAIN X 3/4 FPT 1 Each No Bid No Bid $42.50 $42.50 No Bid No Bid
3 SERVICE SADDLES 2 1/2 MAIN X 1 FPT 1 Each No Bid No Bid $48.90 $48.90 No Bid No Bid
4 SERVICE SADDLES 4 1/2 MAIN X 1 FPT 1 Each No Bid No Bid $62.35 $62.35 No Bid No Bid
5 SERVICE SADDLES 4 MAIN X 1 FPT 1 Each No Bid No Bid $62.35 $62.35 No Bid No Bid
6 SERVICE SADDLES 4 MAIN X 2 FPT 1 Each No Bid No Bid $74.35 $74.35 No Bid No Bid
7 SERVICE SADDLES 6 MAIN X 1 FPT 1 Each No Bid No Bid $65.80 $65.80 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $398.75 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 #12 SOLID COPPER,YELLOW, TRACER WIRE (polyethylene coated) 360000 Foot $.24 $86,400.00 $.24 $86,400.00 No Bid No Bid
2 #10 COPPER CLAD STEEL, YELLOW, TRACER WIRE (polyethylene coated) 90000 Foot $.17 $15,300.00 $.15 $13,500.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $101,700.00 $99,900.00 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 5/8 OD PE W/STIFFENER X 5/8 XTRUBE ADAPTER CONTINENTAL 0443-00-1004-00 10 Each $83.80 $838.00 $87.50 $875.00 $0.00 $0.00

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 9: Vegas-Stainless steel repair clamp with neoprene sealing gasket (neoprene o  Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 10: Service Saddles-Double steel strap with rolled thread design Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 11: Wire - Must be "UL" listed, marked as "Caution Gas Pipe" Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 12: Continental Adapters, Punch Tees and Wrap Arounds Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries



2 5/8 OD PE W/STIFFENER X 1/2 XTRUBE ADAPTER CONTINENTAL 0343-00-1004-00 10 Each $72.30 $723.00 $69.75 $697.50 $0.00 $0.00
3 3/4 MPT X 5/8 OD PE W/STIFFENER ADAPTER CONTINENTAL 0442-00-0913-00 20 Each $82.82 $1,656.40 $22.50 $450.00 $0.00 $0.00
4 3/4 DRESSER X 5/8 OD PE W/STIFFENER ADAPTER CONTINENTAL 1340-00-1004-00 20 Each $71.99 $1,439.80 $158.70 $3,174.00 $0.00 $0.00
5 3/4 MPT X 1/2 XTRUBE ADAPTER CONTINENTAL 0343-00-0913-00 50 Each $67.04 $3,352.00 $54.70 $2,735.00 $0.00 $0.00
6 1/2 MPT X 1/2 XTRUBE ADAPTER CONTINENTAL 0343-00-0912-00 1 Each $76.35 $76.35 $40.00 $40.00 $0.00 $0.00
7 5/8 INCH X 5/8 INCH XTRUBE  CONTINENTAL 0443-00-1304-00 50 Each $66.28 $3,314.00 $56.75 $2,837.50 $0.00 $0.00
8 1/2 INCH CONDUCTIVE STEEL TUBING ADAPTER P/N 0343-00-1303-00 10 Each $202.72 $2,027.20 $83.90 $839.00 $0.00 $0.00
9 1/2 INCH MIP X 1/2 INCH PE (5/8 OD) ADAPTER P/N 0442-*00-0912-00 10 Each $69.37 $693.70 $47.05 $470.50 $0.00 $0.00

10 3/4 INCH PUNCH TEE  X 5/8 INCH COMPRESSION TEE CONTINENTAL 10 Each $161.37 $1,613.70 $69.35 $693.50 $0.00 $0.00
11 3/4 INCH PUNCH TEE X 3/4 INCH COMPRESSION TEE CONTINENTAL 10 Each $125.17 $1,251.70 $124.95 $1,249.50 $0.00 $0.00
12 3/4 INCH PUNCH TEE X 1 INCH COMPRESSION OUTLET CONTININTAL 40 Each $161.37 $6,454.80 $161.05 $6,442.00 $0.00 $0.00
13 3/4 INCH PUNCH TEE X 3/4 INCH WELDABLE OUTLET CONTININTAL 50 Each $54.63 $2,731.50 $94.30 $4,715.00 $0.00 $0.00
14 3/4 INCH PUNCH TEE X 1 INCH WELDABLE OUTLET CONTININTAL 50 Each $108.80 $5,440.00 $108.60 $5,430.00 $0.00 $0.00
15 1 INCH PUNCH TEE X 5/8 INCH COMPRESSION TEE CONTINENTAL 20 Each $197.24 $3,944.80 $170.45 $3,409.00 $0.00 $0.00
16 1 INCH PUNCH TEE X 3/4 INCH COMPRESSION TEE CONTINENTAL 20 Each $197.24 $3,944.80 $156.50 $3,130.00 $0.00 $0.00
17 1 INCH PUNCH TEE  X 1 INCH COMPRESSION TEE CONTINENTAL 20 Each $274.78 $5,495.60 $208.50 $4,170.00 $0.00 $0.00
18 1 INCH PUNCH TEE X 3/4 INCH WELDABLE OUTLET CONTINENTAL 10 Each $124.46 $1,244.60 $131.50 $1,315.00 $0.00 $0.00
19 1 INCH PUNCH TEE X 1 INCH WELDABLE OUTLET CONTINENTAL 20 Each $115.18 $2,303.60 $113.75 $2,275.00 $0.00 $0.00
20 3/4 X 5/8 INCH W/STIFFENER, STEEL; WRAP-A-ROUND TAP TEE 5 Each $271.46 $1,357.30 $253.10 $1,265.50 $0.00 $0.00
21 1 X 5/8 INCH W/STIFFENER, STEEL WRAP-A-ROUND TAP TEE 10 Each $283.20 $2,832.00 $280.00 $2,800.00 $0.00 $0.00
22 1 X 3/4 INCH W/STIFFENER, STEEL WRAP-A-ROUND TAP TEE 10 Each $325.33 $3,253.30 $340.00 $3,400.00 $0.00 $0.00
23 1 X 1 INCH W/STIFFENER, STEEL WRAP-A-ROUND TAP TEE 20 Each $338.15 $6,763.00 $360.00 $7,200.00 $0.00 $0.00
24 2 X 5/8 INCH W/STIFFENER, STEEL WRAP-A-ROUND TAP TEE 10 Each $266.09 $2,660.90 $293.00 $2,930.00 $0.00 $0.00
25 2 X 3/4 INCH W/STIFFENER, STEEL WRAP-A-ROUND TAP TEE 10 Each $350.65 $3,506.50 $293.00 $2,930.00 $0.00 $0.00
26 2 X 1 INCH W/STIFFENER, STEEL WRAP-A-ROUND TAP TEE 20 Each $414.11 $8,282.20 $293.00 $5,860.00 $0.00 $0.00

Total $77,200.75 $71,333.00 $0.00

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 3 BOLT COMP. COUPLING 2.500 TO 2.375 5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 3 BOLT COMP. COUPLING 2.375 TO 2.375 5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 3 BOLT COMP. COUPLING 2.500 TO 2.500 5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 3 BOLT COMP. COUPLING 2.875 TO 3.2 5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 4 BOLT COMP. COUPLING 4.500 TO 2.375 5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 4 BOLT COMP. COUPLING 4.500 TO 4.800 5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 4 BOLT COMP. COUPLING 4.500 TO 4.500 5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 4 BOLT COMP. COUPLING 4.500 TO 5.00 5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 6 BOLT COMP. COUPLING 6.75 TO 5.00 5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 6 BOLT COMP. COUPLING 8.625 5 Each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Total No Bid No Bid No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 INCH 150 # WELD X WELD 1 Each No Bid No Bid $703.40 $703.40 No Bid No Bid
2 EXTERNAL COATED 2 INCH 150 # WELD X WELD 1 Each No Bid No Bid $767.05 $767.05 No Bid No Bid

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 13: Dresser Style Couplings, Style 711 Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 14: In-line Insulators Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries



3 3 INCH 150 # WELD X WELD 1 Each No Bid No Bid $1,126.14 $1,126.14 No Bid No Bid
4 4 INCH 150 # WELD X WELD 1 Each No Bid No Bid $1,405.68 $1,405.68 No Bid No Bid
5 6 INCH 150 # WELD X WELD 1 Each No Bid No Bid $2,185.20 $2,185.20 No Bid No Bid
6 8 INCH 150 # WELD X WELD 1 Each No Bid No Bid $3,104.00 $3,104.00 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $9,291.47 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 TYPE E, 150 SIZE 2 INCH 300 Each No Bid No Bid $28.90 $8,670.00 No Bid No Bid
2 TYPE E, 150 SIZE 3 INCH 200 Each No Bid No Bid $45.90 $9,180.00 No Bid No Bid
3 TYPE E, 150 SIZE 4 INCH 150 Each No Bid No Bid $66.30 $9,945.00 No Bid No Bid
4 TYPE E, 150 SIZE 6 INCH 50 Each No Bid No Bid $99.25 $4,962.50 No Bid No Bid
5 TYPE E, 150 SIZE 8 INCH 20 Each No Bid No Bid $99.00 $1,980.00 No Bid No Bid
6 1 INCH NEOPREVE FLANGE GASKET 30 Each No Bid No Bid $.65 $19.50 No Bid No Bid
7 2 INCH E NEOPRENE FLANGE GASKETS 300 Each No Bid No Bid $1.20 $360.00 No Bid No Bid
8 3 INCH E NEOPRENE FLANGE GASKETS 200 Each No Bid No Bid $1.80 $360.00 No Bid No Bid
9 4 INCH E NEOPRENE FLANGE GASKETS 100 Each No Bid No Bid $2.60 $260.00 No Bid No Bid

10 6 INCH E NEOPRENE FLANGE GASKETS 20 Each No Bid No Bid $3.80 $76.00 No Bid No Bid
11 8 INCH E NEOPRENE FLANGE GASKETS 20 Each No Bid No Bid $4.75 $95.00 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $35,908.00 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 INCH IPS 10 Each No Bid No Bid $20.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid
2 2 INCH IPS 20 Each No Bid No Bid $21.50 $430.00 No Bid No Bid
3 4 INCH IPS 10 Each No Bid No Bid $32.05 $320.50 No Bid No Bid
4 6 INCH IPS 20 Each No Bid No Bid $40.70 $814.00 No Bid No Bid
5 8 INCH IPS 10 Each No Bid No Bid $64.40 $644.00 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $2,408.50 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 2 INCH WILLIAMSON TEE (LOW PRESSURE) 25 Each $259.30 $6,482.50 $262.35 $6,558.75 No Bid No Bid
2 2 INCH WILLIAMSON TEE (HIGH PRESSURE) 25 Each $3,101.00 $77,525.00 $2,729.00 $68,225.00 No Bid No Bid
3 3 INCH WILLIAMSON TEE (HIGH PRESSURE) 12 Each $3,814.00 $45,768.00 $3,357.00 $40,284.00 No Bid No Bid
4 4 INCH WILLIAMSON TEE (HIGH PRESSURE) 20 Each $6,088.00 $121,760.00 $5,480.00 $109,600.00 No Bid No Bid
5 6 INCH WILLIAMSON TEE (HIGH PRESSURE) 10 Each $8,016.00 $80,160.00 $7,215.00 $72,150.00 No Bid No Bid
6 8 INCH WILLIAMSON TEE (HIGH PRESSURE) 4 Each $9,340.00 $37,360.00 $8,545.00 $34,180.00 No Bid No Bid
7 2 INCH WILLIAMSON SHORT STOP 25 Each $132.00 $3,300.00 $125.00 $3,125.00 No Bid No Bid
8 3 INCH WILLIAMSON SHORT STOP 12 Each $226.00 $2,712.00 $195.00 $2,340.00 No Bid No Bid
9 4 INCH WILLIAMSON SHORT STOP 25 Each $958.00 $23,950.00 $969.00 $24,225.00 No Bid No Bid

10 6 INCH WILLIAMSON SHORT STOP 10 Each $1,272.00 $12,720.00 $1,287.05 $12,870.50 No Bid No Bid
11 8 INCH WILLIAMSON SHORT STOP 4 Each $2,303.00 $9,212.00 $2,350.00 $9,400.00 No Bid No Bid
12 2 INCH COMPLETION PLUG 10 Each $82.55 $825.50 $83.50 $835.00 No Bid No Bid
13 4 INCH COMPLETION PLUG 10 Each $793.00 $7,930.00 $775.00 $7,750.00 No Bid No Bid
14 6 INCH COMPLETION PLUG 10 Each $926.00 $9,260.00 $820.00 $8,200.00 No Bid No Bid

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 15: Neoprene Faced Phenolic Gasket Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 16: PIGS - Foam Pipeline Cleaners Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 17: T D Williamson Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries



15 8 INCH COMPLETION PLUG 10 Each $1,609.00 $16,090.00 $1,400.00 $14,000.00 No Bid No Bid
16 2 INCH WILLIAMSON TEE (BOLT ON) 10 Each $5,076.00 $50,760.00 $5,375.00 $53,750.00 No Bid No Bid
17 4 INCH WILLIAMSON TEE (BOLT ON) 10 Each $6,511.00 $65,110.00 $6,648.00 $66,480.00 No Bid No Bid
18 6 INCH WILLIAMSON TEE (BOLT ON) 10 Each $7,925.00 $79,250.00 $7,800.00 $78,000.00 No Bid No Bid
19 8 INCH WILLIAMSON TEE (BOLT ON) 4 Each $9,950.00 $39,800.00 $9,550.00 $38,200.00 No Bid No Bid
20 2 INCH WILLIAMSON SHORT STOP (BOLT ON) 5 Each $1,482.00 $7,410.00 $1,498.00 $7,490.00 No Bid No Bid
21 4 INCH WILLIAMSON SHORT STOP (BOLT ON) 5 Each $4,041.00 $20,205.00 $4,278.80 $21,394.00 No Bid No Bid
22 6 INCH WILLIAMSON SHORT STOP (BOLT ON) 5 Each $5,713.00 $28,565.00 $6,000.00 $30,000.00 No Bid No Bid
23 8 INCH WILLIAMSON SHORT STOP (BOLT ON) 2 Each $7,840.00 $15,680.00 $7,400.00 $14,800.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $761,835.00 $723,857.25 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 2 INCH NORDSTROM LUBE VALVES 5 Each No Bid No Bid $250.00 $1,250.00 No Bid No Bid
2 4 INCH NORDSTROM LUBE VALVES 5 Each No Bid No Bid $490.00 $2,450.00 No Bid No Bid
3 6 INCH NORDSTROM LUBE VALVES 5 Each No Bid No Bid $1,630.00 $8,150.00 No Bid No Bid
4 8 INCH NORDSTROM LUBE VALVES 5 Each No Bid No Bid $2,900.00 $14,500.00 No Bid No Bid
5 1 INCH BALON NON-LUBE VALVES (WELD) 5 Each No Bid No Bid $87.00 $435.00 No Bid No Bid
6 2 INCH BALON NON-LUBE VALVES (WELD) 5 Each No Bid No Bid $388.80 $1,944.00 No Bid No Bid
7 4 INCH BALON NON-LUBE VALVES (WELD) 5 Each No Bid No Bid $667.00 $3,335.00 No Bid No Bid
8 6 INCH BALON NON-LUBE VALVES (WELD) 5 Each No Bid No Bid $1,300.00 $6,500.00 No Bid No Bid
9 8 INCH BALON NON-LUBE VALVES (WELD) 5 Each No Bid No Bid $2,800.00 $14,000.00 No Bid No Bid

10 2 INCH BALON NON-LUBE VALVES (FLANGED) 5 Each No Bid No Bid $550.00 $2,750.00 No Bid No Bid
11 4 INCH BALON NON-LUBE VALVES (FLANGED) 5 Each No Bid No Bid $675.00 $3,375.00 No Bid No Bid
12 6 INCH BALON NON-LUBE VALVES (FLANGED) 5 Each No Bid No Bid $825.00 $4,125.00 No Bid No Bid
13 8 INCH BALON NON-LUBE VALVES (FLANGED) 5 Each No Bid No Bid $1,425.00 $7,125.00 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $69,939.00 No Bid

Line ItemDescription Quantity Unit of MUnit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 2 X 18  INCH CANUSA PL-55-10 SHRINK SLEEVES 5 Each No Bid No Bid $10.20 $51.00 No Bid No Bid
2 4 X 18 INCH CANUSA PL-115-18 5 Each No Bid No Bid $12.80 $64.00 No Bid No Bid
3 6 X 18 INCH CANUSA PL-170-18 5 Each No Bid No Bid $17.50 $87.50 No Bid No Bid
4 8 X 18 INCH SHRINK SLEEVES 5 Each No Bid No Bid $16.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid
5 (SLIDS) SUPPORT CLAMPS 12 INCH X 8 INCH 1 Each No Bid No Bid $28.00 $28.00 No Bid No Bid
6 (SLIDS) SUPPORT CLAMPS 12 INCH X 6 INCH 1 Each No Bid No Bid $24.00 $24.00 No Bid No Bid

7
CATHODIC TEST STATIONS WITH CAST IRON RING, CAST IRON LID WITH TERMINAL 
BLOCK 125 Each No Bid No Bid $49.32 $6,165.00 No Bid No Bid

8 3M DIRECT BURIAL SPLICE KITS 5000 Each No Bid No Bid $2.45 $12,250.00 No Bid No Bid
9 METER LUBE TOOL 15 Each No Bid No Bid $180.00 $2,700.00 No Bid No Bid

10 80-B LUBE 15 Each No Bid No Bid $32.00 $480.00 No Bid No Bid
11 CONTROL BAR O-RING 10 Each No Bid No Bid $.30 $3.00 No Bid No Bid
12 2 INCH SHORT STOP GASKETS 10 Each No Bid No Bid $34.00 $340.00 No Bid No Bid
13 4 INCH SHORT STOP GASKETS 10 Each No Bid No Bid $40.00 $400.00 No Bid No Bid
14 6 INCH SHORT STOP GASKETS 10 Each No Bid No Bid $47.00 $470.00 No Bid No Bid

Steel PIpe and Fittings - Group 18: Valves (Lube and Non-Lube) Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries

Steel Pipe and Fittings - Group 19: Miscellaneous Parts Consolidated Pipe & SupplyGeneral Utility Pipe and Suppl ISCO Industries



15 8 INCH SHORT STOP GASKETS 10 Each No Bid No Bid $72.94 $729.40 No Bid No Bid
16 2 INCH SHORT STOP STOPPERS 50 Each No Bid No Bid $48.00 $2,400.00 No Bid No Bid
17 4 INCH SHORT STOP STOPPERS 30 Each No Bid No Bid $114.00 $3,420.00 No Bid No Bid
18 6 INCH SHORT STOP STOPPERS 30 Each No Bid No Bid $207.00 $6,210.00 No Bid No Bid
19 8 INCH SHORT STOP STOPPERS 10 Each No Bid No Bid $275.00 $2,750.00 No Bid No Bid
20 STEEL PIPE SQUEEZE TOOL PS-62B 5 Each No Bid No Bid $3,425.00 $17,125.00 No Bid No Bid
21 4 X 2 INCH CASING END SEAL 20 Each No Bid No Bid $33.05 $661.00 No Bid No Bid
22 8 X 4 INCH CASING END SEAL 20 Each No Bid No Bid $49.40 $988.00 No Bid No Bid
23 12 X 6 INCH CASING END SEAL 10 Each No Bid No Bid $56.50 $565.00 No Bid No Bid
24 16 X 8 INCH CASING END SEAL 10 Each No Bid No Bid $72.00 $720.00 No Bid No Bid

Total No Bid $58,710.90 No Bid

Indicates Intent to Award
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