
General Utility Pipe and Supply
Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

1 1/2 INCH CTS 1500 Foot $.28 $420.00 $.20 $300.00 No Bid No Bid
2 3/4 INCH IPS 1000 Foot $.48 $480.00 $.32 $320.00 No Bid No Bid
3 1 INCH IPS 80000 Foot $.75 $60,000.00 $.55 $44,000.00 No Bid No Bid
4 1 1/4 INCH IPS 2000 Foot $.89 $1,780.00 $.75 $1,500.00 No Bid No Bid
5 2 INCH IPS 100000 Foot $1.09 $109,000.00 $1.05 $105,000.00 No Bid No Bid
6 4 INCH IPS 250 Foot $3.37 $842.50 $3.05 $762.50 No Bid No Bid
7 6 INCH IPS 250 Foot $7.32 $1,830.00 $6.60 $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid
8 8 INCH IPS 250 Foot $12.65 $3,162.50 $11.10 $2,775.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $177,515.00 $156,307.50 No Bid

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1/2 INCH CTS 250 Foot $.32 $80.00 $.20 $50.00 No Bid No Bid
2 3/4 INCH IPS 250 Foot $.49 $122.50 $.35 $87.50 No Bid No Bid
3 1 INCH IPS 250 Foot $.83 $207.50 $.50 $125.00 No Bid No Bid
4 1  1/4 INCH IPS 250 Foot $1.00 $250.00 $.50 $125.00 No Bid No Bid
5 2 INCH IPS 250 Foot $1.31 $327.50 $.98 $245.00 No Bid No Bid
6 4 INCH IPS 1200 Foot $4.03 $4,836.00 $3.45 $4,140.00 No Bid No Bid
7 6 INCH IPS 1200 Foot $8.83 $10,596.00 $7.50 $9,000.00 No Bid No Bid
8 8 INCH IPS 2000 Foot $14.22 $28,440.00 $12.72 $25,440.00 No Bid No Bid
9 12 INCH IPS 480 Foot $20.72 $9,945.60 $26.15 $12,552.00 No Bid No Bid

10 14 INCH IPS 120 Foot $24.98 $2,997.60 $31.50 $3,780.00 No Bid No Bid
11 16 INCH IPS 1000 Foot $32.62 $32,620.00 $44.12 $44,120.00 No Bid No Bid
12 18 INCH IPS 40 Foot $41.28 $1,651.20 $50.24 $2,009.60 No Bid No Bid

Total $92,073.90 $101,674.10 No Bid

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 5/8 INCH PE (1/2 CTS) 20 Each $18.02 $360.40 $13.00 $260.00 No Bid No Bid
2 3/4 INCH IPS 20 Each $17.49 $349.80 $13.00 $260.00 No Bid No Bid
3 1 INCH IPS 1200 Each $22.38 $26,856.00 $19.25 $23,100.00 No Bid No Bid
4 2 INCH IPS 10 Each $54.67 $546.70 $50.00 $500.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $28,112.90 $24,120.00 No Bid

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

Bid Tabulation ITB 52-25, Polyethylene Pipe Fittings and Steel Pipe Fittings

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 1: Pipe - 2708 Resin Consolidated Pipe & Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings  - Group 2: Pipe - 4710 Resin Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

Indicates Intent to Award

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 3: PE Excess Flow Valves - 2708 Resin Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 4: Fittings - 2708 Resin Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries



1 3/4 INCH IPS SOCKET 90 ELBOW 10 Each $2.06 $20.60 $2.25 $22.50 No Bid No Bid
2 3/4 INCH IPS BUTT 90 ELBOW 1 Each $3.45 $3.45 $4.10 $4.10 No Bid No Bid
3 1 INCH IPS SOCKET 90 ELBOW 200 Each $2.13 $426.00 $1.98 $396.00 No Bid No Bid
4 1 INCH IPS BUTT 90 ELBOW 1 Each $3.94 $3.94 $3.93 $3.93 No Bid No Bid
5 1 1/4 INCH IPS SOCKET 90 20 Each $2.72 $54.40 $3.10 $62.00 No Bid No Bid
6 1 1/4 INCH IPS BUTT 90 ELBOW 1 Each $4.25 $4.25 $4.46 $4.46 No Bid No Bid
7 2 INCH IPS SOCKET 90 ELBOW 150 Each $5.50 $825.00 $5.15 $772.50 No Bid No Bid
8 2 INCH IPS BUTT 90 ELBOW 5 Each $4.50 $22.50 $4.59 $22.95 No Bid No Bid
9 4 INCH IPS BUTT 90 ELBOW 20 Each $13.50 $270.00 $16.00 $320.00 No Bid No Bid

10 6 INCH IPS 90 ELBOW 25 Each $33.45 $836.25 $37.95 $948.75 No Bid No Bid
11 4 INCH IPS BUTT 45 ELBOW 10 Each $13.50 $135.00 $16.00 $160.00 No Bid No Bid
13 6 INCH IPS BUTT 45 ELBOW 10 Each $33.45 $334.50 $38.95 $389.50 No Bid No Bid
14 8 INCH IPS BUTT 45 ELBOW 5 Each $93.00 $465.00 $105.00 $525.00 No Bid No Bid
15 1/2 INCH CTS SOCKET TEE 1 Each $1.90 $1.90 $1.72 $1.72 No Bid No Bid
16 3/4 INCH IPS SOCKET TEE 1 Each $1.75 $1.75 $1.72 $1.72 No Bid No Bid
17 1 INCH IPS SOCKET TEE 200 Each $2.25 $450.00 $2.25 $450.00 No Bid No Bid
18 1 INCH IPS BUTT TEE 1 Each $4.25 $4.25 $4.76 $4.76 No Bid No Bid
19 1 1/4 INCH IPS SOCKET TEE 10 Each $3.20 $32.00 $3.50 $35.00 No Bid No Bid
20 1 1/4 INCH IPS BUTT TEE 1 Each $4.70 $4.70 $5.29 $5.29 No Bid No Bid
21 2 INCH IPS SOCKET TEE 45 Each $6.05 $272.25 $5.95 $267.75 No Bid No Bid
22 2 INCH IPS BUTT TEE 1 Each $5.00 $5.00 $4.13 $4.13 No Bid No Bid
23 4 INCH IPS BUTT TEE 15 Each $17.50 $262.50 $19.45 $291.75 No Bid No Bid
24 6 INCH IPS BUTT TEE 10 Each $43.50 $435.00 $49.50 $495.00 No Bid No Bid
25 8 INCH IPS BUTT TEE 3 Each $112.00 $336.00 $129.00 $387.00 No Bid No Bid
26 1/2 INCH CTS SOCKET CAP 5 Each $1.25 $6.25 $1.20 $6.00 No Bid No Bid
27 3/4 INCH IPS SOCKET CAP 5 Each $1.32 $6.60 $1.25 $6.25 No Bid No Bid
28 1 INCH IPS SOCKET CAP 100 Each $2.15 $215.00 $1.90 $190.00 No Bid No Bid
29 1 1/4 INCH IPS SOCKET CAP 10 Each $1.85 $18.50 $1.95 $19.50 No Bid No Bid
30 2 INCH IPS SOCKET CAP 200 Each $2.95 $590.00 $2.70 $540.00 No Bid No Bid
31 4 INCH IPS BUTT CAP 20 Each $8.15 $163.00 $10.85 $217.00 No Bid No Bid
32 6 INCH IPS BUTT CAP 20 Each $20.15 $403.00 $26.50 $530.00 No Bid No Bid
33 8 INCH IPS BUTT CAP 5 Each $35.75 $178.75 $56.00 $280.00 No Bid No Bid
34 4 X 2 INCH IPS BUTT REDUCER 20 Each $8.05 $161.00 $10.35 $207.00 No Bid No Bid
35 6 X 4 INCH IPS BUTT REDUCER 10 Each $24.10 $241.00 $29.75 $297.50 No Bid No Bid
36 8 X 6 INCH IPS BUTT REDUCER 4 Each $44.44 $177.76 $52.00 $208.00 No Bid No Bid
37 1/2 INCH CTS SOCKET COUPLING 5 Each $.90 $4.50 $.90 $4.50 No Bid No Bid
38 3/4 INCH IPS SOCKET COUPLING 5 Each $.98 $4.90 $1.13 $5.65 No Bid No Bid



39 1 INCH IPS SOCKET COUPLING 4000 Each $1.65 $6,600.00 $1.20 $4,800.00 No Bid No Bid
40 1 1/4 INCH IPS SOCKET 10 Each $1.44 $14.40 $1.65 $16.50 No Bid No Bid
41 2 INCH IPS SOCKET COUPLING 400 Each $2.50 $1,000.00 $1.75 $700.00 No Bid No Bid
42 2 X 1 INCH IPS SOCKET COUPLING 20 Each $4.25 $85.00 $3.75 $75.00 No Bid No Bid
43 2 x 1 1/4 INCH IPS SOCKET 5 Each $4.25 $21.25 $3.45 $17.25 No Bid No Bid
44 1 1/4 x 1 INCH IPS SOCKET 5 Each $3.75 $18.75 $4.40 $22.00 No Bid No Bid
45 1 IPS X 3/4 INCH IPS SOCKET 20 Each $3.32 $66.40 $3.20 $64.00 No Bid No Bid
46 1 IPS X 1/2 INCH IPS SOCKET 25 Each $3.32 $83.00 $4.10 $102.50 No Bid No Bid
47 3/4 IPS X 1/2 INCH IPS SOCKET 5 Each $3.10 $15.50 $1.90 $9.50 No Bid No Bid

Total $15,280.80 $13,893.96 No Bid

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 4 INCH IPS BUTT 90 ELBOW 25 Each $14.53 $363.25 $13.50 $337.50 No Bid No Bid
2 6 INCH IPS BUTT 90 ELBOW 25 Each $34.20 $855.00 $37.50 $937.50 No Bid No Bid
3 8 INCH IPS BUTT 90 ELBOW 5 Each $90.20 $451.00 $83.30 $416.50 No Bid No Bid
4 4 INCH IPS BUTT 45 ELBOW 25 Each $14.53 $363.25 $13.50 $337.50 No Bid No Bid
5 6 INCH IPS BUTT 45 ELBOW 25 Each $32.59 $814.75 $35.25 $881.25 No Bid No Bid
6 8 INCH IPS BUTT 45 ELBOW 5 Each $86.70 $433.50 $88.00 $440.00 No Bid No Bid
7 4 INCH IPS BUTT TEE 10 Each $17.85 $178.50 $19.50 $195.00 No Bid No Bid
8 6 INCH IPS BUTT TEE 10 Each $43.65 $436.50 $46.95 $469.50 No Bid No Bid
9 8 INCH IPS BUTT TEE 5 Each $112.06 $560.30 $119.00 $595.00 No Bid No Bid

10 4 INCH IPS BUTT CAP 20 Each $9.30 $186.00 $9.75 $195.00 No Bid No Bid
11 6 INCH IPS BUTT CAP 20 Each $19.95 $399.00 $23.40 $468.00 No Bid No Bid
12 8 INCH IPS BUTT CAP 5 Each $38.00 $190.00 $36.25 $181.25 No Bid No Bid
13 4 X 2 INCH IPS BUTT REDUCER 10 Each $7.85 $78.50 $8.75 $87.50 No Bid No Bid
14 6 X 4 INCH IPS BUTT REDUCER 10 Each $24.80 $248.00 $24.50 $245.00 No Bid No Bid
15 8 X 6 INCH IPS BUTT REDUCER 5 Each $43.25 $216.25 $40.00 $200.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $5,773.80 $5,986.50 No Bid

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 INCH IPS X 1 INCH MIP (SDR-11) 5 Each $21.35 $106.75 $23.00 $115.00 No Bid No Bid
2 1 1/4 INCH IPS X 1 1/4 INCH MIP 1 Each $23.95 $23.95 $22.00 $22.00 No Bid No Bid
3 2 INCH IPS X 2 INCH MIP (SDR-11) 50 Each $38.23 $1,911.50 $33.00 $1,650.00 No Bid No Bid
4 4 INCH IPS X 4 INCH WELD (SDR- 10 Each $101.70 $1,017.00 $104.00 $1,040.00 No Bid No Bid
5 6 INCH IPS X 6 INCH WELD (SDR- 10 Each $310.00 $3,100.00 $285.00 $2,850.00 No Bid No Bid
6 8 INCH IPS X 8 INCH WELD (SDR- 5 Each $776.00 $3,880.00 $659.00 $3,295.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $10,039.20 $8,972.00 No Bid

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 5: Fittings - 4710 Resin Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 6: Transitions Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries



Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 INCH IPS 200 Each $34.45 $6,890.00 $40.50 $8,100.00 No Bid No Bid
2 2 INCH IPS 50 Each $65.30 $3,265.00 $74.00 $3,700.00 No Bid No Bid
3 4 INCH IPS 10 Each $210.00 $2,100.00 $230.00 $2,300.00 No Bid No Bid
4 6 INCH IPS 10 Each $435.00 $4,350.00 $489.00 $4,890.00 No Bid No Bid
5 8 INCH IPS 5 Each $835.90 $4,179.50 $799.00 $3,995.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $20,784.50 $22,985.00 No Bid

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 4 INCH IPS 10 Each $235.25 $2,352.50 $262.00 $2,620.00 $290.90 $2,909.00
2 6 INCH IPS 10 Each $491.75 $4,917.50 $540.00 $5,400.00 $660.50 $6,605.00
3 8 INCH IPS 5 Each $956.45 $4,782.25 $1,033.00 $5,165.00 $1,146.05 $5,730.25

Total $12,052.25 $13,185.00 $15,244.25

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 3/4 INCH X 1/2 INCH CTS (SDR- 140 Each $30.95 $4,333.00 $29.15 $4,081.00 No Bid No Bid
2 3/4 INCH X 3/4 INCH IPS (SDR-11) 112 Each $35.98 $4,029.76 $33.95 $3,802.40 No Bid No Bid
3 1 INCH X 1 INCH IPS (SDR-11) 1200 Each $36.30 $43,560.00 $37.50 $45,000.00 No Bid No Bid
4 1 1/4 INCH X 1 1/4 INCH IPS (SDR- 1 Each $80.00 $80.00 $33.20 $33.20 No Bid No Bid
5 2 INCH X 2 INCH IPS (SDR-11) 1 Each $150.75 $150.75 $135.00 $135.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $52,153.51 $53,051.60 No Bid

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1/2 INCH CTS X 1/2 INCH CTS 150 Each $15.98 $2,397.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
2 1/2 INCH CTS X STUB CAP 100 Each $16.04 $1,604.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 3/4 INCH IPS X 3/4 INCH IPS 30 Each $31.39 $941.70 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4 3/4 INCH IPS X STUB CAP 25 Each $28.91 $722.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5 1 INCH IPS X 1 INCH IPS 200 Each $54.59 $10,918.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 1 INCH IPS X STUB CAP 100 Each $73.65 $7,365.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
7 1 1/4 INCH IPS X 1 1/4 INCH IPS 10 Each $97.32 $973.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 1 1/4 INCH IPS X STUB CAP 10 Each $109.21 $1,092.10 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 2 INCH IPS X 2 INCH IPS 200 Each $126.99 $25,398.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 2 INCH IPS X STUB CAP 30 Each $207.81 $6,234.30 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 1 INCH IPS X 1/2 CTS STAB 25 Each $111.65 $2,791.25 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 1 INCH IPS X 3/4 IPS STAB 20 Each $112.26 $2,245.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
13 1/2 INCH COPPER X 5/8 INCH CTS 10 Each $56.35 $563.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 7: Polyvalves - 2708 Resin Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 8: Polyvalves - 4710 Resin Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 9: Risers Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 10: Stab Fittings - 4710 Resin Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries



Total $63,246.00 No Bid No Bid

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 2 INCH IPS X 1/2 INCH CTS 10 Each $32.46 $324.60 $15.50 $155.00 No Bid No Bid
2 2 INCH IPS 3/4 INCH IPS 10 Each $36.75 $367.50 $15.78 $157.80 No Bid No Bid
3 2 INCH IPS 1 INCH IPS 1500 Each $36.30 $54,450.00 $21.50 $32,250.00 No Bid No Bid
4 2 INCH IPS X 2 INCH IPS 125 Each $130.15 $16,268.75 $89.00 $11,125.00 No Bid No Bid
5 4 INCH IPS X 1/2 INCH CTS 1 Each $34.60 $34.60 $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid
6 4 INCH IPS X 1 INCH IPS 25 Each $35.65 $891.25 $28.00 $700.00 No Bid No Bid
7 4 INCH IPS X 2 INCH IPS 40 Each $124.47 $4,978.80 $72.00 $2,880.00 No Bid No Bid
8 6 INCH IPS X 1/2 INCH CTS 1 Each $43.15 $43.15 $32.00 $32.00 No Bid No Bid
9 6 INCH IPS X 1 INCH IPS 20 Each $44.25 $885.00 $18.00 $360.00 No Bid No Bid

10 6 INCH IPS X 2 INCH IPS 40 Each $134.85 $5,394.00 $74.00 $2,960.00 No Bid No Bid
11 8 INCH IPS X 1 INCH IPS 2 Each $53.42 $106.84 $40.00 $80.00 No Bid No Bid
12 8 INCH IPS X 2 INCH IPS 2 Each $150.41 $300.82 $80.00 $160.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $84,045.31 $50,874.80 No Bid

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 2 INCH IPS X 1/2 INCH CTS 1 Each $22.58 $22.58 $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid
2 2 INCH IPS 3/4 INCH IPS 1 Each $33.58 $33.58 $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid
3 2 INCH IPS 1 INCH IPS 5 Each $36.30 $181.50 $15.00 $75.00 No Bid No Bid
4 4 INCH IPS X 1/2 INCH CTS 1 Each $27.83 $27.83 $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid
5 4 INCH IPS X 1 INCH IPS 20 Each $29.10 $582.00 $26.95 $539.00 No Bid No Bid
6 6 INCH IPS X 1/2 INCH CTS 1 Each $33.88 $33.88 $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid
7 6 INCH IPS X 1 INCH IPS 1 Each $52.28 $52.28 $15.00 $15.00 No Bid No Bid
8 2 INCH IPS X 2 INCH IPS 5 Each $92.54 $462.70 $88.00 $440.00 No Bid No Bid
9 4 INCH IPS X 2 INCH IPS 20 Each $101.48 $2,029.60 $95.00 $1,900.00 No Bid No Bid

10 6 INCH IPS X 2 INCH IPS 20 Each $102.75 $2,055.00 $98.00 $1,960.00 No Bid No Bid
11 8 INCH IPS X 2 INCH IPS 5 Each $109.63 $548.15 $102.00 $510.00 No Bid No Bid
12 4 INCH POLYSTOPP PE BRANCH 5 Each $1,119.30 $5,596.50 $1,158.80 $5,794.00 No Bid No Bid
13 6 INCH POLYSTOPP PE BRANCH 5 Each $1,454.55 $7,272.75 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 No Bid No Bid
14 8 INCH POLYSTOPP PE BRANCH 5 Each $2,086.30 $10,431.50 $2,160.00 $10,800.00 No Bid No Bid
15 4 INCH POLYSTOPP PE PLUG 5 Each $861.37 $4,306.85 $891.00 $4,455.00 No Bid No Bid
16 6 INCH POLYSTOPP PE PLUG 5 Each $1,144.00 $5,720.00 $1,184.70 $5,923.50 No Bid No Bid
17 8 INCH POLYSTOPP PE PLUG 5 Each $1,782.95 $8,914.75 $1,845.85 $9,229.25 No Bid No Bid

Total $48,271.45 $49,200.75 No Bid

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 11: Electrofusion Tapping Tees -2708 ResinConsolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 12: Electrofusion Tapping Tees - 4710 Resi Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 13: Electrofusion Couplings - 2708 Resin Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries



Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 INCH IPS 20 Each $12.19 $243.80 $9.00 $180.00 No Bid No Bid
2 2 INCH IPS 20 Each $12.55 $251.00 $9.00 $180.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $494.80 $360.00 No Bid

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1 INCH IPS 1 Each $6.35 $6.35 $9.00 $9.00 $10.10 $10.10
2 2 INCH IPS 100 Each $8.20 $820.00 $7.00 $700.00 $13.10 $1,310.00
3 4 INCH IPS 25 Each $25.05 $626.25 $22.50 $562.50 $38.95 $973.75
4 6 INCH IPS 25 Each $61.25 $1,531.25 $54.75 $1,368.75 $97.65 $2,441.25
5 8 INCH IPS 5 Each $86.60 $433.00 $77.65 $388.25 $122.60 $613.00

Total $3,416.85 $3,028.50 $5,348.10

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 4 INCH IPS 45 8 Each $101.65 $813.20 $56.18 $449.44 $93.32 $746.56
2 6 INCH IPS 45 8 Each $237.10 $1,896.80 $84.25 $674.00 $149.28 $1,194.24
3 8 INCH IPS 45 4 Each $349.95 $1,399.80 $154.00 $616.00 $267.06 $1,068.24
4 4 INCH IPS 90 12 Each $101.65 $1,219.80 $50.00 $600.00 $93.42 $1,121.04
5 6 INCH IPS 90 12 Each $237.10 $2,845.20 $86.00 $1,032.00 $135.61 $1,627.32
6 8 INCH IPS 90 4 Each $349.95 $1,399.80 $162.70 $650.80 $254.40 $1,017.60
7 4 INCH IPS TEE 4 Each $232.90 $931.60 $78.55 $314.20 $132.72 $530.88
8 6 INCH IPS TEE 4 Each $254.03 $1,016.12 $117.14 $468.56 $331.46 $1,325.84
9 8 INCH IPS TEE 4 Each $423.35 $1,693.40 $161.25 $645.00 $584.08 $2,336.32

10 4 INCH IPS CAP 4 Each $65.55 $262.20 $31.70 $126.80 $53.68 $214.72
11 6 INCH IPS CAP 4 Each $165.75 $663.00 $62.00 $248.00 $126.16 $504.64
12 8 INCH IPS CAP 4 Each $300.25 $1,201.00 $66.30 $265.20 $312.65 $1,250.60

Total $15,341.92 $6,090.00 $12,938.00

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 SOCKET FUSION HEATER 5 Each No Bid No Bid $660.00 $3,300.00 $880.00 $4,400.00
2 FUSION BAG 5 Each No Bid No Bid $95.00 $475.00 $226.50 $1,132.50
3 3/4 INCH SOCKET FACE 6 Each No Bid No Bid $119.95 $719.70 $88.20 $529.20
4 5/8 INCH SOCKET FACE 6 Each No Bid No Bid $119.95 $719.70 $73.50 $441.00
5 1 INCH SOCKET FACE 10 Each No Bid No Bid $119.95 $1,199.50 $88.20 $882.00
6 1 1/4 INCH SOCKET FACE 5 Each No Bid No Bid $119.95 $599.75 $118.95 $594.75
7 2 INCH SOCKET FACE 2 Each No Bid No Bid $119.95 $239.90 $178.95 $357.90
8 3/4 INCH CHAMFERING TOOL 5 Each No Bid No Bid $72.00 $360.00 $103.85 $519.25

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 14: Electrofusion Couplings - 4710 Resin Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 15: Electrofusion Fittings - 4710 Resin Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 16: PE Socket Fusion Tools Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries



9 5/8 INCH CHAMFERING TOOL 5 Each No Bid No Bid $72.00 $360.00 $103.85 $519.25
10 1 INCH CHAMFERING TOOL 20 Each No Bid No Bid $72.00 $1,440.00 $103.85 $2,077.00
11 1 1/4 INCH CHAMFERING TOOL 5 Each No Bid No Bid $71.00 $355.00 $103.85 $519.25
12 2 INCH CHAMFERING TOOL 20 Each No Bid No Bid $72.00 $1,440.00 $128.50 $2,570.00
13 3/4 INCH COLD RING 5 Each No Bid No Bid $87.20 $436.00 $152.65 $763.25
14 5/8 INCH COLD RING 5 Each No Bid No Bid $102.50 $512.50 $152.65 $763.25
15 1 INCH COLD RING 10 Each No Bid No Bid $87.20 $872.00 $152.65 $1,526.50
16 1 1/4 INCH COLD RING 4 Each No Bid No Bid $102.50 $410.00 $222.15 $888.60
17 2 INCH COLD RING 10 Each No Bid No Bid $102.50 $1,025.00 $222.15 $2,221.50

Total No Bid $14,464.05 $20,705.20

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 2 INCH ROTARY PEELER 5 Each No Bid No Bid $705.00 $3,525.00 $765.00 $3,825.00
2 4 INCH ROTARY PEELER 5 Each No Bid No Bid $780.00 $3,900.00 $826.50 $4,132.50
3 6 INCH ROTARY PEELER 5 Each No Bid No Bid $925.00 $4,625.00 $1,073.70 $5,368.50
4 8 INCH ROTARY PEELER 5 Each No Bid No Bid $985.00 $4,925.00 $1,305.30 $6,526.50
5 SCRAPER BLADES 10 Each No Bid No Bid $117.75 $1,177.50 $95.00 $950.00
6 2 INCH UNDERCLAMP 10 Each No Bid No Bid $480.00 $4,800.00 $350.00 $3,500.00
7 4 INCH UNDERCLAMP 10 Each No Bid No Bid $550.00 $5,500.00 $457.90 $4,579.00
8 6 INCH UNDERCLAMP 5 Each No Bid No Bid $565.00 $2,825.00 $523.25 $2,616.25
9 8 INCH UNDERCLAMP 5 Each No Bid No Bid $975.00 $4,875.00 $1,543.70 $7,718.50

10 2 INCH ELECTROFUSION 5 Each No Bid No Bid $211.00 $1,055.00 $183.50 $917.50
11 4 INCH ELECTROFUSION 5 Each No Bid No Bid $570.00 $2,850.00 $220.00 $1,100.00
12 6 INCH ELECTROFUSION 5 Each No Bid No Bid $675.00 $3,375.00 $260.55 $1,302.75
13 8 INCH ELECTROFUSION 2 Each No Bid No Bid $772.00 $1,544.00 $362.40 $724.80
14 4 INCH ELECTROFUSION 45 2 Each No Bid No Bid $179.68 $359.36 $227.00 $454.00
15 6 INCH ELECTROFUSION 45 2 Each No Bid No Bid $215.60 $431.20 $283.60 $567.20
16 8 INCH ELECTROFUSION 45 2 Each No Bid No Bid $230.00 $460.00 $3,685.00 $7,370.00
17 4 INCH ELECTROFUSION 90 2 Each No Bid No Bid $179.68 $359.36 $227.00 $454.00
18 6 INCH ELECTROFUSION 90 2 Each No Bid No Bid $215.60 $431.20 $293.75 $587.50
19 8 INCH ELECTROFUSION 90 2 Each No Bid No Bid $230.00 $460.00 $3,685.00 $7,370.00
20 4 INCH ELECTROFUSION TEE 2 Each No Bid No Bid $205.00 $410.00 $505.30 $1,010.60
21 6 INCH ELECTROFUSION TEE 2 Each No Bid No Bid $246.00 $492.00 $675.80 $1,351.60
22 8 INCH ELECTROFUSION TEE 2 Each No Bid No Bid $260.00 $520.00 $955.80 $1,911.60

Total No Bid $48,899.62 $64,337.80

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 17: PE Electrofusion Tools Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 18: PE Squeeze Tools Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries



1 GLS-26 5 Each No Bid No Bid $1,450.00 $7,250.00 $1,550.00 $7,750.00
2 SMALL SERVICE SQUEEZE TOOL 10 Each No Bid No Bid $375.00 $3,750.00 $1,075.00 $10,750.00
3 MID-RANGE SERVICE SQUEEZE 5 Each No Bid No Bid $710.00 $3,550.00 $1,850.00 $9,250.00
4 INDIVIDUAL VISE-GRIP SQUEEZE 5 Each No Bid No Bid $80.00 $400.00 $308.10 $1,540.50
5 4 INCH MANUAL SQUEEZE TOOL 5 Each No Bid No Bid $1,280.00 $6,400.00 $1,350.00 $6,750.00
6 6 INCH MANUAL SQUEEZE TOOL 5 Each No Bid No Bid $3,880.00 $19,400.00 $4,105.50 $20,527.50
7 8 INCH MANUAL SQUEEZE TOOL 5 Each No Bid No Bid $4,445.00 $22,225.00 $4,700.00 $23,500.00
8 4 INCH HYDRAULIC SQUEEZE 2 Each No Bid No Bid $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $4,525.00 $9,050.00
9 6 INCH HYDRAULIC SQUEEZE 2 Each No Bid No Bid $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $8,600.00 $17,200.00

10 8 INCH HYDRAULIC SQUEEZE 2 Each No Bid No Bid $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $9,225.00 $18,450.00
Total No Bid $107,975.00 $124,768.00

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 2 INCH HEATING IRON 5 Each No Bid No Bid $687.85 $3,439.25 $870.50 $4,352.50
2 4 INCH HEATING IRON 5 Each No Bid No Bid $687.85 $3,439.25 $1,095.00 $5,475.00
3 6 INCH HEATING IRON 2 Each No Bid No Bid $2,140.00 $4,280.00 $2,755.00 $5,510.00
4 8 INCH HEATING IRON 2 Each No Bid No Bid $4,100.00 $8,200.00 $4,477.90 $8,955.80
5 2 INCH BUTT FUSION MACHINE 1 Each No Bid No Bid $4,250.00 $4,250.00 $4,552.65 $4,552.65
6 4 INCH BUTT FUSION MACHINE 1 Each No Bid No Bid $5,921.98 $5,921.98 $6,267.50 $6,267.50
7 6 INCH BUTT FUSION MACHINE 1 Each No Bid No Bid $11,750.00 $11,750.00 $13,272.65 $13,272.65
8 8 INCH BUTT FUSION MACHINE 1 Each No Bid No Bid $28,400.00 $28,400.00 $30,717.90 $30,717.90

Total No Bid $69,680.48 $79,104.00

Line Item Description Quantity Unit of Measure Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total Unit Cost Total
1 1/2 INCH CTS STIFFENER 5 Each $10.00 $50.00 $5.00 $25.00 No Bid No Bid
2 1 INCH IPS STIFFENER 5 Each $10.00 $50.00 $5.00 $25.00 No Bid No Bid
3 1 1/4 INCH IPS STIFFENER 5 Each $10.00 $50.00 $5.00 $25.00 No Bid No Bid
4 2 INCH IPS STIFFENER 10 Each $10.00 $100.00 $12.00 $120.00 No Bid No Bid
5 4 INCH IPS STIFFENER 5 Each $10.00 $50.00 $10.00 $50.00 No Bid No Bid
6 MARKERPOLES; 2 INCH ROUND 1000 Each $28.65 $28,650.00 $24.80 $24,800.00 No Bid No Bid
7 VALVE BOX- PLASTIC; COMPLETE 300 Each $141.00 $42,300.00 $147.00 $44,100.00 No Bid No Bid

Total $71,250.00 $69,145.00 No Bid

Indicates Intent to Award

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 19: Butt Fusion Tools Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries

PE Pipe and Fittings - Group 20: Miscellaneous Material Consolidated Pipe & Supply General Utility Pipe and Supply ISCO Industries
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