

Invitation to Bid 17-16, Citywide Signage
Bid Tabulation

Bld Tabulation				Capital Signs LLC Conroe, TX		Clearwater Imaging, LLC Clearwater, FL		Creative Sign Designs, LLC - Tampa, FL		Elite Designs Unlimited, Inc. - Safety Harbor, FL		Ryan-Markland Signs, Inc.-Inverness, FL		Thomas Sign & Awning Co., Inc.-Clearwater, FL		West Central Signs, Inc.- Tampa, FL	
Segment 1 - Long Center Signs																	
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF SIGN	QTY	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - NO INSTALL	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - NO INSTALL	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - NO INSTALL	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - NO INSTALL	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - NO INSTALL	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - NO INSTALL	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - NO INSTALL	LEAD TIME (Days)
REGULATORY SIGNS																	
1.A.	SINGLE SIDED FACE PARK/PLAYGROUND RULE SIGN - Panel Only Park rule sign 23"x33" single face sandblasted high density urethane sign with wood grain look. Overall thickness of the urethane is a minimum of 3-¾" with 1-½" foam panel laminated to each side of ¾" PVC Panel. Background to sandblasted wood grain finish to accommodate aluminum rule panel (18" x 24") which will be provided by the City to be attached to sign insets. Background Pantone 3282U. Outer edges of sign Pantone 4685U.	100	30	\$ 961.33		No Bid	30	\$ 726.00	30	\$ 445.00	30	\$ 564.00	20	\$ 645.00	20	\$ 502.72	
1.B.	DOUBLE SIDED FACE PARK/PLAYGROUND RULE SIGN - Panel Only Park rule sign 23"x33" double face sandblasted high density urethane sign with wood grain look. Overall thickness of the urethane is a minimum of 3-¾" with 1-½" foam panel laminated to each side of ¾" PVC Panel. Background to sandblasted wood grain finish to accommodate aluminum rule panel(s) (18" x 24"), one on each side, will be provided by the City to be attached to sign insets. Background Pantone 3282U. Outer edges of sign Pantone 4685U.	40	30	\$ 1,186.69		No Bid	30	\$ 1,077.00	30	\$ 715.00	30	\$ 660.00	20	\$ 885.00	20	\$ 914.10	
1.C.	SINGLE SIDED BIKE TRAIL/RULE SIGN - Panel Only (similar in appearance but not size to Courtyard Directory Sign) Bike trail rule sign 42"x58" single face sandblasted high density urethane sign with wood grain look, with City of Clearwater logo. Overall thickness of the urethane is a minimum of 2-¼" with 1-½" foam panel laminated to ¾" PVC Panel. Back ground to sandblasted wood grain finish. Two (2) bike rule metal (aluminum) panels will be provided by the City. One (1) panel 24"x36" and the second panel 18"x36" may be attached to sign inset. All painted surfaces to receive two (2) coats of primer and three (3) coats of exterior paint. Revel and background of sign - paint chip Pantone 3282 U. Outer edges of sign Pantone 4685 U.	10	30	\$ 2,165.98		No Bid	30	\$ 1,818.00	30	\$ 1,445.00	30	\$ 1,036.00	20	\$ 1,405.00	20	\$ 1,603.22	
1.D.	SINGLE SIDED FACE SWIMMING POOL RULES OR PARK RULES SIGN - Panel Only Rule sign 28"x52" single face sandblasted high density urethane sign with wood grain look, with City of Clearwater logo. Overall thickness of the urethane is a minimum of 2-¾" with 1-½" foam panel laminated to ¾" PVC Panel. Back ground to sandblasted wood grain finish. One (1) metal (aluminum) panel 23"x45" will be provided by the City to be attached to sign inset. All painted surfaces to receive two (2) coats of primer and three (3) coats of exterior paint. Background of sign - paint chip Pantone 3282 U. Outer edges of sign Pantone 4685 U.	10	30	\$ 1,431.91		No Bid	30	\$ 1,100.00	30	\$ 850.00	30	\$ 962.00	20	\$ 1,265.00	20	\$ 963.53	
ALUMINUM SIGNS .063																	
1.E.	18" X 24" Digital print - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	30	\$ 84.50		No Bid	30	\$ 76.00	15	\$ 49.50	10	\$ 57.60	20	\$ 65.00	10	\$ 53.75	
1.F.	18" X 24" Cut Vinyl - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	30	\$ 86.19		No Bid	30	\$ 87.00	15	\$ 49.50	10	\$ 67.50	20	\$ 75.00	10	\$ 74.52	
IDENTIFICATION SIGNS																	
1.G.	SINGLE SIDED FACE IDENTIFICATION SIGN Identification signage 2'x8' single face sandblasted high density urethane sign with wood grain look. Overall thickness of the urethane is a minimum of 2-¾" with 1-½" foam panel laminated to ¾" PVC Panel. Letters style Palatino complex name – height 7-¾" and City of Clearwater letters style Helvetica, height 3". Background to sandblasted wood grain finish. All painted surfaces to receive two (2) coats of primer and three (3) coats of exterior paint. Background of sign - paint chip Pantone 3282 U, Outer edges of sign Pantone 4685 U, letters of facility white, City of Clearwater – Pantone 871 C.	5	30	\$ 2,051.60		No Bid	30	\$ 1,721.00	30	\$ 1,360.00	30	\$ 831.60	20	\$ 1,235.00	10	\$ 1,515.03	
1.H.	DOUBLE SIDED FACE IDENTIFICATION SIGN Identification signage 2'x8' double face sandblasted high density urethane sign with wood grain look. Overall thickness of the urethane is a minimum of 2 ¾" with 2-¾" foam panels laminated to ¾" PVC Panel. Letters: style Palatino complex name – height 7-¾" and City of Clearwater letters style Helvetica, height 3". Back ground to sandblasted wood grain finish. All painted surfaces to receive two (2) coats of primer and three (3) coats of exterior paint. Background of sign – paint chip Pantone 3282 U. Outer edges of sign Pantone 4685 U, letters of facility white, City of Clearwater – Pantone 871 C.	5	30	\$ 3,079.80		No Bid	30	\$ 3,201.00	30	\$ 2,175.00	30	\$ 1,245.60	20	\$ 2,235.00	10	\$ 2,763.23	
DIRECTORY SIGN - Panel Only																	
1.I.	Panel Face size is 36"x 41-25"; material is 1/4" polycarbonate, with printed directory information and various logos. Sign is electric.	2	30	667.28		No Bid	30	\$ 186.00	15	\$ 150.00	15	\$ 346.50	20	\$ 270.00	10	\$ 262.47	
Segment 2 - Other City Signage																	
ALUMINUM SIGNS .063																	
2.A.	18" X 36" Digital print - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 112.74		No Bid	30	\$ 95.00	15	\$ 49.50	10	\$ 88.20	20	\$ 85.00	10	\$ 76.20	
2.B.	18" X 36" Cut Vinyl - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 112.74		No Bid	30	\$ 124.00	15	\$ 54.00	10	\$ 99.00	20	\$ 95.00	10	\$ 102.24	
2.C.	24" X 36" Digital print - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 148.99		No Bid	30	\$ 107.00	15	\$ 66.00	10	\$ 115.20	20	\$ 100.00	10	\$ 95.31	
2.D.	24" X 36" Cut Vinyl - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 148.99		No Bid	30	\$ 141.00	15	\$ 72.00	10	\$ 124.20	20	\$ 110.00	10	\$ 130.41	
2.E.	23" X 45" Digital print - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 178.00		No Bid	30	\$ 130.00	15	\$ 79.00	10	\$ 153.00	20	\$ 130.00	10	\$ 95.31	
2.F.	23" X 45" Cut Vinyl - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 178.00		No Bid	30	\$ 171.00	15	\$ 85.00	10	\$ 157.50	20	\$ 140.00	10	\$ 130.41	
ALUMINUM SIGNS .080																	
2.G.	18" X 24" Digital print - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 78.21		No Bid	30	\$ 85.00	15	\$ 36.00	10	\$ 90.90	20	\$ 80.00	10	\$ 55.11	
2.H.	18" X 24" Cut Vinyl - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 78.21		No Bid	30	\$ 109.00	15	\$ 39.00	10	\$ 101.70	20	\$ 90.00	10	\$ 75.87	
2.I.	18" X 36" Digital print - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 115.30		No Bid	30	\$ 99.00	15	\$ 54.00	10	\$ 117.90	20	\$ 100.00	10	\$ 78.93	
2.J.	18" X 36" Cut Vinyl - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 115.30		No Bid	30	\$ 127.00	15	\$ 58.50	10	\$ 120.60	20	\$ 110.00	10	\$ 104.96	
2.K.	24" X 36" Digital print - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 152.41		No Bid	30	\$ 118.00	15	\$ 72.00	10	\$ 121.50	20	\$ 115.00	10	\$ 98.93	
2.L.	24" X 36" Cut Vinyl - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 152.41		No Bid	30	\$ 152.00	15	\$ 78.00	10	\$ 125.10	20	\$ 125.00	10	\$ 134.04	
2.M.	23" X 45" Digital print - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 182.08		No Bid	30	\$ 136.00	15	\$ 85.50	10	\$ 156.60	20	\$ 145.00	10	\$ 98.93	
2.N.	23" X 45" Cut Vinyl - Reflective W/Anti Graffiti Coating	25	15	\$ 182.08		No Bid	30	\$ 171.00	15	\$ 92.50	10	\$ 161.10	20	\$ 155.00	10	\$ 134.04	
REFLECTIVE VINYL SIGN																	
2.O.	12" X 30" Full color digital print graphics on reflective 3M IJ5100 vinyl or equal quality vinyl. Includes Anti Graffiti laminate. For replacement on existing panel.	45	15	\$ 61.89		No Bid	30	\$ 40.00	15	\$ 25.00	10	\$ 78.00	25	\$ 50.00	10	\$ 25.61	

Invitation to Bid 17-16, Citywide Signage
 Bid Tabulation

Bid Tabulation				Capital Signs LLC Conroe, TX		Clearwater Imaging, LLC Clearwater, FL		Creative Sign Designs, LLC - Tampa, FL		Elite Designs Unlimited, Inc. - Safety Harbor, FL		Ryan-Markland Signs, Inc.-Inverness, FL		Thomas Sign & Awning Co., Inc.-Clearwater, FL		West Central Signs, Inc.- Tampa, FL	
Segment 3 - Miscellaneous																	
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF SIGN	QTY	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price Per Each Item - No Install Fee	
BANNER SIGNS																	
3.A.	18" x 36" Single Sided, 18 oz. vinyl banner, full color print. Webbing in top and bottom hem line with two brass grommets in hem line on pole side. 3" Top and Bottom Pockets, clean cut other sides	40	30	\$ 153.50		No Bid	30	\$ 136.00	15	\$ 54.00	5	\$ 43.20	20	\$ 30.00	10	\$ 74.95	
3.B.	18" x 48" Single Sided, 18 oz. vinyl banner, full color print. Webbing in top and bottom hem line with two brass grommets in hem line on pole side. 3" Top and Bottom Pockets, clean cut other sides	40	30	\$ 173.75		No Bid	30	\$ 141.00	15	\$ 72.00	5	\$ 55.80	20	\$ 40.00	10	\$ 92.56	
3.C.	2' x 4' Single Sided, 13 oz. vinyl banner, full color print. Single Hemmed Edges, Corner Grommets.	10	30	\$ 137.75	10	\$ 34.00	30	\$ 137.00	15	\$ 96.00	5	\$ 22.50	20	\$ 45.00	10	\$ 51.13	
3.D.	2' x 6' Single Sided, 13 oz. vinyl banner, full color print. Single Hemmed Edges, Corner Grommets.	10	30	\$ 164.75	10	\$ 51.00	30	\$ 145.00	15	\$ 144.00	5	\$ 28.80	20	\$ 65.00	10	\$ 68.62	
3.E.	3' x 10' Single Sided, 10 oz. vinyl mesh banner, full color print. Single Hemmed Edges, Corner Grommets.	10	30	\$ 218.75	10	\$ 157.50	30	\$ 205.00	15	\$ 360.00	6	\$ 90.00	20	\$ 165.00	10	\$ 210.98	
3.F.	3' x 15' Single Sided, 10 oz. vinyl mesh banner, full color print. Single Hemmed Edges, Corner Grommets.	10	30	\$ 191.75	10	\$ 236.25	30	\$ 252.00	15	\$ 540.00	6	\$ 198.00	20	\$ 250.00	10	\$ 301.80	
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF POSTS	Length	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price For One Pair - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price For One Pair - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price For One Pair - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price For One Pair - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price For One Pair - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price For One Pair - No Install Fee	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price For One Pair - No Install Fee	
SIGN POSTS																	
3.G.	4x4 Posts All post are 4x4 pressure treated pine, all edges are corner round with ¼"radius routed with dato revel 3" from top of post ¼" width and ½" depth. All columns shall be sanded smooth and all cracks filled with wood putty and sanded smooth. All painted surfaces to receive two coats of primer and three coats of exterior paint. Revel paint chip Pantone 3282 U. Post color, Pantone 4685 U.	72"	30	\$ 352.55		No Bid	30	\$ 600.00	30	\$ 100.00	10	\$ 74.00	20	\$ 350.00	10	\$ 133.47	
		84"	30	\$ 347.72		No Bid	30	\$ 600.00	30	\$ 100.00	10	\$ 81.00	20	\$ 395.00	10	\$ 142.86	
		96"	30	\$ 369.89		No Bid	30	\$ 600.00	30	\$ 100.00	10	\$ 81.00	20	\$ 435.00	10	\$ 142.86	
3.H.	6x6 Posts All post are 6x6 pressure treated pine, all edges are corner round with ¼"radius routed with dato revel 3" from top of post ¼" width and ½" depth. All columns shall be sanded smooth and all cracks filled with wood putty and sanded smooth. All painted surfaces to receive two coats of primer and three coats of exterior paint. Revel paint chip Pantone 3282 U. Post color, Pantone 4685 U.	72"	30	\$ 474.29		No Bid	30	\$ 740.00	30	\$ 150.00	10	\$ 122.00	20	\$ 385.00	10	\$ 174.05	
		84"	30	\$ 521.27		No Bid	30	\$ 740.00	30	\$ 200.00	10	\$ 135.00	20	\$ 465.00	10	\$ 194.18	
		96"	30	\$ 568.22		No Bid	30	\$ 740.00	30	\$ 200.00	10	\$ 135.00	20	\$ 520.00	10	\$ 194.18	
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF POST INSTALL	Qty (PAIR)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	
INSTALLATION FEE - POSTS																	
3.I.	Installation - any pair of 4x4 Posts with any one (1) Identification Sign	1	30	\$ 425.70		No Bid	10	\$ 278.00	30	\$ 150.00	7	\$ 660.00	20	\$ 600.00	10	\$ 475.00	
3.J.	Installation - any pair of 6x6 Posts with any one (1) Regulatory Sign	1	30	\$ 525.70		No Bid	10	\$ 278.00	30	\$ 250.00	7	\$ 770.00	20	\$ 600.00	10	\$ 475.00	
Item No.	DESCRIPTION OF PANEL REFURBISHMENT	Qty (EACH)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	LEAD TIME (Days)	Price (USD)	
REFURBISHMENT - 12"x30" PANELS																	
3.K.	12"x30" reflective vinyl sign to customer provided .080 gauge aluminum panels. Sign panels may be delivered to vendor for cleanup, refurbishing and application purposes in advance of sign installation.	45	30	\$ 103.00		No Bid	20	\$ 108.00	15	\$ 35.00	10	\$ 78.00	20	\$ 70.00	10	\$ 77.23	

Intended Awardee
 Low Bid Item